Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

= Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAY)

Print Form

| Primary Sponsor: Council Member Cheri Hamilton

| Amount: $90,000

Date: 8-6-18

Account # 8672-410-8105-148379-822702 $40,000
Account # 8102-410-8105-148379-822702 $50,000

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
New sidewalk project on west side of South 45th Street between Garland Avenue and Greenwood
Avenue. This project will be funded with prior fiscal years MAP funds.

City Agency: Public Works & Assets

Contact Person: Steve M. Kurowsky

Agency Phone: 502-574-8743

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # Council Member Signature

Amount

8-6-18
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Approved by:

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Budget Revision #:

Appropriations Committee Chairman

Amended Amount:
To OMB:

Date

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Completion Date:

Actual Cost:

Funds Returned:
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Department/Project:
Public Works & Assets/New sidewalk project on west side of South 45th Street

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.
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F  NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST |

Interagency Name: Public Works & Assets
West side of South 45th Street New Sidewalk Project
- T Yes/No/NA

|

Program/Project Name:

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes i
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with T ‘
account numbers in the request form description? | NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amountof | |
the request exclude the matching fund amount? . NA |
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they |
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? . NA '
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the O NA
funding source is probably NDF. !
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful T
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. . NA
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than =~

- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. " NA !
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? I
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? . NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid |
estimate and description of cost? . Yes
Submitted by: LaTonya Bell on behalf of District 05 Date: 8-6-18

Revised May 2016



Stenberg, Beth

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject

Great, then let’s use the Capital Projects Public Works units of 1483

- Re: South 45th Street New Sidewalk Estimate

Hamilton, Cheri ‘(
Saturday, June 16, 2018 12:17 AM

O\}J
Stenberg, Beth. 4/4\
cheridistricts @gmail.com \

project budgeted at $90,000.

Thanks!

Sent from my iPad

OnJun 15, 2018, at 2:46 PM, Stenberg, Beth <Béth.Stenberg@Iouisvillekv.gov> wrote:

yes

From: Hamilton, Cheri

Sent: Friday, June 15, 2018 2:32 PM

To: Stenberg, Beth

Cc: 'cheridistricts @gmail.com'

Subject: FW: South 45th Street New Sidewalk Estimate

Would | have money to fund this project in the balances we discussed today in project unit 148379?

From: Kurowsky, Steve M,

Sent: Thursday, June 14, 2018 11:55 AM

To: Hamilton, Cheri; Friend-Ellis, Myra

Cc: Stenberg, Beth; Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: South 45th Street New Sidewalk Estimate

Steve will provide a cost estimate to construct a new sidewalk along both sides of S 45 St between
Garland & Greenwood. Steve —please provide a breakdown of cost for each side.

Below is the estimate for a new sidewalk along South 45" Street from Garland Ave. to Greenwood
Ave. |looked at both sides of the street. The west side seems most appropriate for a new

sidewalk. The east side presents many more problems like a small berm, more trees, exist. concrete
steps and more.....you guessed it.....utility poles.

New sidewalk on the west side of South 45" Street would cost $90,000. This would enable us to
connect up the existing sidewalks from Riverview & Westchester Aves.

If you have any questions regarding anything related to this work, please don’t hesitate to contact me.

Thanks,

Steve Kurowsky, PE
Louisville Metro Government
Transportation Division
Metro Development Center

of $50,000 and $41,867.60 for this sidew
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