Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Kevin Triplett |

| Amount: $564.00 Date: April 4, 2019 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Requesting a total of 4 honorary street name signs for John Asher. Two signs will be installed
under the official street name at Taylor and Central and another at 4th & Central. Churchill Downs
will install one on the median on Central Ave. One sign will be purchased by Churchill Downs.
Billing address is:T. Kevin Flanery, President Churchill Downs Racetrack 700 Central Ave
Louisville, KY 40208

The cost of each sign is $188.00.

City Agency; Public Works
Contact Person: Tim Maier

Agency Phone: 502-574-3921

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Honorary Street Signs for John Asher

~ Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? - NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? f NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the  Yes
funding source is probably NDF. |

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. ~ Yes
Ordinance Required: [s the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? o n\
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? N U

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: shughes Date: Apr3,2019

Revised May 2016



Hughes, Susan

From: Luckett, Daniel R - i \ \

Sent: Wednesday, March 27, 2019 1:04 PM iﬁg{‘ﬂ/lfﬂ H/é*l =

To: Hughes, Susan it k) T C)(/} -
Subject: FW: Street name signs WT 14 MJ"‘@ e
Attachments: image002.png

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Wednesday, March 27, 2019 1:02 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R; Sparks, Stuart; Grothaus, Seth T; Jennings, Patricia A; Hines, William A
Cc: Hall, Barbara C; Roades, Bonnie ]

Subject: RE: Street name signs

The cost per sign is $188 and includes installation, usually installed under the official street name if room is available. It
could read “John Asher Way”. Attached is the typical style but we could do something different for the pictograph on
the left side of the sign if you didn’t want a picture of John. It’ll be a double sided sign and both faces would be the
same, unlike the picture. Public Works would accept the funds and the guys & gals can probably get this fabricated and
installed before Derby if that is what you need.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, March 27, 2019 12:20 PM

To: Brown, leffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; Grothaus, Seth T
<Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Street name signs

Hi Jeff!
Per our conversation our District 15 office spoke to Kevin Flanery at Churchill Downs today (3/27/19) about honorary
street name signs for “John Asher”. | have several questions:

What are the cost per signr - v - G

Are they installed right u/rlder the actual street name sign?

What do they look like? N /

If they decide on this can it say “John Asher Way”? '

Once we appropriate the Smoney can these be installed quickly? - "7
Who would be the one to accept our Smoney? , '
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Hughes, Susan

)7 (17
From: Triplett, Kevin D. <t/ L U]
Sent: Monday, April 8, 2019 9:35 AM !
To: Hughes, Susan
Subject: Re: Approval Request Reminder

| approve of this Resolution and grant my assistant Susan Hughes permission to proceed with submitting this
to our Clerk's Office right away.

Kevin Triplett

Metro Councilman,

District 15

From: Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov <Susan.Hughes@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, April 4, 2019 4:19:14 PM

To: Triplett, Kevin D.

Subject: ATS: Approval Request Reminder

Kevin Triplett,
This is a reminder.

A proposed Resolution, R-043-19, has been submitted by Susan Hughes for your review and approval. The
expected introduction date is NO DATE ENTERED. The description is as follows:

A RESOLUTION HONORING JOHN S. ASHER BY DEDICATING A PORTION OF CENTRAL AVENUE TO BE NAMED
“JOHN S. ASHER WAY” IN HIS HONOR.

Please review this item at
http://louisville.legistar.com/ATS.aspx?From=ATS&1D=28807&Hash=fd0cd4dc33533ad3¢f2¢665ce28540a5.

This email is an automatic email notice from your Legistar? Approval Tracking System. Please do not ?Reply? to
this email, but use the links above. Thank you.



