Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Il Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Keisha Dorsey

| Amount: $25,000 Date: 05-03-2019

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
lIocation of project/program and any external grantee(s):
New sidewalk connector along the north side of Crums Lane ( behind Southland Terrace Shopping
Center). The total project estimate is $50,000 and TARC has agreed to a 50/50 partnership, so that
there be additional boarding/ bench pad included.

City Agency: Public Works- Transportation Division
Contact Person: Steve Kurowsky, PE

Agency Phone: 502-574-8743

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation frogn the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Transportation Division
Program/Project Name: Sidewalk on Crums Lane

‘ - N ‘ Yes/No/NA

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) ‘
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? No
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? No
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? No
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: s the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: Date: 9 é /

Revised May 2016



Alexander, Kalifa

From: Alexander, Kalifa

Sent: Friday, April 26, 2019 3:08 PM

To: ‘ Dorsey, Keisha C.; Kurowsky, Steve M.
Subject: Re: Crums Lane New S/W Estimate

Perfect! Thank you Steve!

Kalifa Alexander

Legislative Aide to Councilwoman Keisha Dorsey
District 3

601 West Jefferson St.

Louisville, KY 40202

Phone: 502-574-1103

From: Dorsey, Keisha C. <keisha.dorsey@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, April 26, 2019 3:06 PM

To: Kurowsky, Steve M.; Alexander, Kalifa

Subject: RE: Crums Lane New S/W Estimate

e Steve thank you
e Kalifa —Please prep this for the Monday noon deadline for 25K from D3 ( see Latonya or Beth regarding funding -
please use the list provided by Steve and also denote where and how all those buckets of monies can be used )

From: Kurowsky, Steve M. <steve.kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, April 26, 2019 3:04 PM

To: Dorsey, Keisha C. <Keisha.Dorsey@louisvilleky.gov>; Alexander, Kalifa <Kalifa.Alexander@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Crums Lane New S/W Estimate

CW Dorsey / Kalifa,

Please find below the estimates for the new sidewalk connector piece along the north side of Crums Lane (behind
Southland Terrace shopping center). The project estimate is $50,000. This all includes costs for a new 5’ wide concrete
sidewalk, detectable pavers, seeding and protection, and a contingency for anything unforeseen. TARC has agreedtoa
50-50 partnership on this project, so there will be an additional boarding/bench pad included with this project. We will
also fix this nasty drainage situation here (see pic below).




If you have any questions about these estimates please feel free to contact me.
Thanks,

Steve Kurowsky, PE
Louisville Metro Government
Transportation Division
Metro Development Center
444 South 5™ Street, Suite 400
Louisville, Ky. 40202

Tel (0): (502) 574-8743

Tel (c): (502) 565-7601

Steve.Kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov






