
Print Form

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
. Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

Capital Infrastructure Fund (GIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP) ^
Paving Fund (PA V)

Primary Sponsor: Councilman Kevin Triplett
^^->

Amount: $720.00 Date: July 8,2019

Description ofprogram/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location ofproject/program and any external grantee(s):

The amount will fund monthly disbursement for the period of one year for transportation to and from
[stores for seniors to purchase food and necessities. The service will be provided by TARC.

jxy«
-r-r

City Agency: Louisville Forward

Contact Person: Rebecca Fleischaker/Justin Robinson

Agency Phone:

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District #

^.JC^-^,

Council Member Sigilature
^ $720.00

Amount
/^f 2J>^

Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman

Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Amended Amount:

To 0MB:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Date

Revised May 2016
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NDF, GIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Louisville Forward

Program/Project Name: TARC Transportation for American Village

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

9''dinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Submitted by: shughes Date: July 8, 2019

Revised May 2016



June 20,2019

Councilman Kevin Triplett
Louisville Metro Council
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

Dear Councilman Triplett:

Re: Louisville Metro Council Capital Preyects Request

This letter supports a request for funding under the Louisville Metro Council Caoital Proi<
Neighboiiiood Projects Reserve Funds. ----r.-.^,-»^,

TTie requested amount $720.00, would fund the monthly disbursement of $60.00 for the period of
Juiy-lL2.0I^thro"8h June 30.' 2020 for sh°PPmg triPS from American Village Apartmente73700

a, to and fiom Shopping Centere in the community. No otfaer agencies or govemmcaits "are
mvolved in funding this program. The bmeficianes of this service are elderly residems'of'American
Village, many of whom do not have access to an automobile.

TARC is a political subdivision and public body corporate, organized under Kentucky Revised
Statutes Section 96A.

The members of the TARC Board of Directors are:

CedricPowell, Chair
Mary Margaret Mulvihill, Vice-Chair
Alice Houston
John Clay Stites
Ted Smith

Mary Morrow
Charles Rogers
Michael Shackelford

AJ^^^,tbe Louisville Metro Council q)proves TARC's Capital and Operating Budget. The
fimding of_$720.00 requested provides services that are not otherwise fanded in TARC-s fiscd'
Operating Budget of $92,650,326.

TARC looks forward to continuing this special program for the residents of American Vil
Please direct any questions to, Tonya Carter, Director of Finance at 561-5139 or myself.

Sincerely,

Ferdinand L. Risco, Jr., MBA
Executive Director/CEO

Transit Authority of River City (TARC)



Hughes, Susan

From:

Sent:

To:
Cc:
Subject:

Fleischaker, Rebecca

Wednesday, July 3, 2019 1:29 PM
Zawacki, Theresa M; Hughes, Susan
Luckett, Daniel R; Robinson, Justin A

RE: Emailing: American Village TARC O19.pdf

We can do it! copying Justin here...

From: Zawacki, Theresa M <Theresa.Zawacki@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, July 3, 2019 1:22 PM

To: Hughes, Susan <Susan Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>; Fleischaker, Rebecca <Rebecca.Fleischaker@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvitleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Emailing: American Village TARC 019.pdf

Hi Susan-this is squarely in Rebecca's hands as I've moved into a new role working in Russell. She's got you
covered, I'm sure! Happy 4th!

Theresa

Theresa Zawacki

Executive on Loan to Russell a Place of Promise

Theresa.Zawacki@louisvillekv.gov

502-593-4508

From: Hughes, Susan
Sent: Wednesday, July 3, 2019 12:51:00 PM
To: Zawacki, Theresa M; Fleischaker, Rebecca
Cc: Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: Emailing: American Village TARC 019.pdf

Good holiday weekend. Once again District 15 has been asked to service elderly seniors by providing TARC services for
transportation to purchase personal necessities.

Would you be willing to help facilitate that service by accepting the NDF request in the amount of $720.00?

If so, please reply and I will prepare the request.



Thank you both for the consideration.

Susan
District 15

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link attachments:

American Village TARC O19.pdf

Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent sending or receiving certain types of file
attachments. Check your e-mail security settings to determine how attachments are handled.


