Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
'7<Neighb0rh00d Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

| Primary Sponsor: David James

LAmount: /0, 0O O ‘

I /
Date: ’[!?‘:F'//f]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of preject/program and any external grantee(s):
Funds will be used to pay invoices pertaining to District 6 services

City Agency: Louisville Metro Parks
Contact Person: Dana Kasler

Agency Phone: 502-574-7275

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds willel?/s;d for a public purpose and have the attached

documentation from the y

ifig department concerning the project/expenditure,

6 o s 10,000 Jul 24, 2019
District # ~ACgnéfl Member Signature Amount Date
i
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Budget Revision #:

Amended Amount:
To OMB:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Completion Date:

Actual Cost:

Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
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Interagency Name: Louisville Metro Parks

1 Yes/No/NA

RéqueSt Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Mem'ber('s) -
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

$5,0007 If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Yes

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

Yes

Submitted by:%&ggﬁwg M Date:
ol d e L a v

o5

Revised May 2016



Taz!or, Shalanna

From: Kasler, Dana

Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2019 11:25 AM
To: Taylor, Shalanna

Cc: Veeneman, Andrea R.

Subject: RE: NDF Transfer

Shalanna-

We will accept the funds. | have copied Andrea Veeneman, our Fiscal Administrator.
Regards,
Dana

Dana Kasler

Director

Louisville Parks and Recreation
P.O. Box 37280

Louisville, KY 40233-7280
502-574-FPARK (7275)
Dana.Kasler@louisvilleky.gov

m, LOUISVILLE
8 PARKS

7 AND RECREATION

From: Taylor, Shalanna <Shatanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2019 10:46 AM

To: Kasler, Dana <Dana.Kasler@louisvilieky.gov>

Subject: FW: NDF Transfer

Hello Dana —

Just following up on the request below...

Thank you,

Shalanna Taylor

Legislative Assistant

President David James District 6 Office

601 W, Jefferson Street Louisville, Ky 40202
| Office: 502-574-1106 |



| Direct: 502-574-3910 |

From: Veeneman, Andrea R. <Andrea.Veeneman@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, luly 15, 2019 5:41 PM

To: Kasler, Dana <Dana.Kasler@louisvilleky.gov>; Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@iouisvilteky.gov>
Cc: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Fw: NDF Transfer

Do you accept the transfer of these funds?

From: Taylor, Shalanna

Sent: Monday, July 15, 2019 4:37:57 PM
To: Veeneman, Andrea R.

Subject: NDF Transfer

Hello Andrea,

We would like to transfer $10,000 of our NDF fund to our Parks NDF account.

We have 3 invoices from luv it landscaping that we would like to pay thru our parks account once the funds are
transferred.

Please iet me know if there is anything else you will need from me.

Thank you,

Shalanna Taylor

Legislative Assistant

President David James District 6 Office

601 W. Jefferson Street Louisville, Ky 40202
| Office: 502-574-1106 |

|Direct: 502-574-3910|



Tazlor, Shalanna

From: Hoover, Mark J

Sent: Friday, July 26, 2019 10:25 AM
To: Taylor, Shalanna

Subject: FW: Back to School August 10
Attachments: Radio Spot Cali Comm.pdf

Here is an invoice for the radio spot we did. it was $300. We are looking at how to spend the $700 as effectively as
possible. | will get that to you shortly.

From: 4 YOURKIDS ENTERTAINMENT <4yourkidsent@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, july 25, 2019 5:44 PM

To: Hoover, Mark J <Mark.Hoover@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Back to Schooi August 10

CAUTION: This email came from cutside of Louisvilie Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments uniess you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

All-
Please see attached radio schedule and inveice for the event. The commercial spot wiil be done tomorrow.

Mark - when are we thinking a check will be ready?

Best,
Walter L. Murrah II1

Owner | Chief Operations Manager

4YourKids Entertainment LLC

2043 S. Shelby Street Suive # 2

Louisville, KY 40217

Office:(502)414-7774 Ext. 101

Fax: (50204147774

Email: Y owrKadsEnttiemail.com

Twitter: www, [witter.com/4YourKidsEnt
Facebook: www.facebook.com/4YourKidsEnt
Instagram: www.Instagram.com/4YourKidsEnt

We Are......4YourKids Entertainment!
Cartoon Mascots | IDj Services | Event Planning & Diesign | Birthday Invitations | Party Supply Rentals
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P.G.Box 17192
Louisville, KY 40217 [

Invoice )

Number: 8548

€36.168%

we Don'l Leave unlit you say you vt
T ST

i1
Councilman David James
601 W Jefferson St

5

P

o Desenton: o ot
. B 'ggnd&Dumgsni; o i N ST - . :_$3ﬁ§730_ |
| remove old fieur da.lis_ and concrete - ' L B

ihsta!i_newﬁeurdei_is___ RN AR _ DR R

.-j “trim

deweed

sy

~haul ang dump Eig -
- Thank You for your business!

Total $610.00




P.G.Box 17192 L“

g Louisville, KY 40217 Invoice J

%ﬁﬁﬂ @% Number; 8320

we Dont Lesve until you say you “Luv-It

601 W Jefferson St

Lavisville, Ky 40207

Mideoele, Pro e
VLI HON YO

N/

Description: .. _' " VT o o o ' Amount
landscape work o _ S o - $3,280.00
20 green giant n - ' ' o ' '
. 100-1 2(}_ yards of chips

. edge and regr_&.d_e_... BRI
‘remove soil ﬁgﬁ w_a.i_k. o

eeenup T e
3 ﬁgn (4-5_(5_33@): : 5 R

 extra rock for drain w0

i Thanlx You for youtbusmessi .

Total $3,780.00




P.O. Box 17192

Louisville, KY 40217
$35.568%

we Don't Leave untd you say you “Luv-It"

“Councilman David James
601 W Jefferson St

[ Invoice )
Number. B378

Zi12018

hal Ta

Councilman David James
601 W Jefferson St

Backiil
-reset block and plants =

" clean up

. Thank You for your busingss! -

[ Home Phona
Y 574-1106 Y
4 A
Description: Asmount
k 7ih & Magnolia _ .
Repair wall from car accident $2,450.00

Total $2.450.00
N\ /
- N
\_ %Lﬁw% MJ
[



