Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
w Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

| Primary Sponsor: BRENT T. ACKERSON

| Amount: $1080.00 Date: 09/01/2019

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Remove and replace the tree upon the city right-of-way at 3307 Furman Boufevard at the direction
of the Division of Community Forestry,

City Agency: Division of Community Forestry

Contact Person: grin Thompson

Agency Phone: s502.574-4030

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

26 [+] (7 — $1080.00 09/01/2019
District # Chuncil Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #;
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Program/Project Name: 3307 Furman Boulevard R-O-W Tree Removal and Replacement
R . S " Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes

funding source is probably NDF,

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. -~ Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than -

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? :

If 50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Decumentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? \ B
T

Submitted by:/A\/J ’ 1%\)\\9 /&/3,___& Date: M:Z@I({
(O

Revised May 2016



Noble, Jeffrey T

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Good afternoon Jeff-

Thompson, Erin

Wednesday, August 21, 2019 2:55 PM

Noble, Jeffrey T

Garton, Michael J.; Michael Garton; Wiedamann, Christopher

CD 26 Requested Cost Estimate for RE: Frank Farmer of 3307 Furman Blvd

CD 26 Cost Est_3307 Furman Blvd_RemoveReplace .pdf; DCF Q007
_PropOwner&DCFAgreement_02_2018.pdf; DCF 0002_Tree Watering Regimen_01_23_
2018.pdf

Please find attached the cost estimate for the removal and replacement of the of the public right of way tree abutting
Mr. Frank Farmer’s property at 3307 Furman Blvd. If council proceeds with appropriation of funds to cover this cost, The
Division will accept the funds and ensure that the work is performed. If council does not proceed with the fund
appropriation in the next 60 days, council needs to confirm with the Division that the costs are still applicable. Mr.

Farmer will be responsible for the maintenance of the tree according to LMCO 102 and will be asked to sign the attached
agreement acknowledging the ordinance and his responsibility. The attached watering instructions will be provided to
Mr. Farmer for the first three years of water maintenance.

I look forward to hearing from council if fund appropriation will proceed.

Thank you, Erin

Erin Thompson

Urban Forester/Community Forestry Supervisor

ISA Certified Arborist KY-0813A and ISA Tree Risk Assessment Qualified
Division of Community Forestry

Louisville Metro Government

527 W. Jefferson Street, 6™ fioor

Louisville, KY 40202

Office: (502) 574-4030
https://louisvilleky.gov/government/division-community-forestry

DIVISION OF

COMMUNITY
FORESTRY

Offlee of Sustainablifty — Lowlsville Forwaed

From: Noble, Jeffrey T <leffrey.Noble@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 9:48 AM

To: Wiedamann, Christopher <Christopher.Wiedamann®@louisvilieky.gov>; Thompson, Erin
<trin.Thompson@louisvilleky.gov>

Ce: Garton, Michael J. <Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>; Michael Garton <mjgarton@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: Frank Farmer of 3307 Furman 8lvd



ggmumw 3307 Furman Blvd:

FORESTRY Tree Removal and Replacement

Offiess of Suatakdility — Lounille Fotensd Cost Estimate is prepared at the request of Council District 26
for the rermoval and replacement of a Public ROW tree

This cost estimate is prepared at the request of Metro Council District 26: Brent Ackerson’s office. The public
right of way tree that abuts the private property of Mr. and Mrs. Frank Farmer of 3307 Furman Blvd has been
inspected by the Division for health status. Upon inspection, the staff of the Division found that the tree is 3
21.5" sugar maple in decline and needs to be removed/replaced. The following is the overali cost to remove
and replace the tree with a city contractor. The tree removal cost covers the removal of the tree, disposal of any
woody debris produced, and to grind the stump. The tree planting cost is for the purchase of tree stock and
contractor instaliation. It is the responsibility of the abutting property owner to maintain the tree for its life per
LMCO 102 but also to follow the Division instructions on watering and mulching of the tree for the first three
years it in the ground.

Tree Removal $768.00

Replacement Tree (Type A) $312.00

Estimated Total Cost $1,080.00
Prepared by Erin Thompson

August 20, 2013



Mo Job Too Small, No Tres Too Tall”
v hobrayce.com

eﬁtﬁfeﬂl Aabonst

Bob Ray Company Inc. Proposal

Louisville Mefro / DCF 201908014 ”
Thursday, August 01, 2019 Arbarist: Adam B. Palmer
5G27F731120

Billing Address: adamp@bobrayece. com:

Louisville Metro # DCF
Job Losation: 3307 Furman Blud

&11 W Jefferson Street Louisville , Ky 40220
Louisyille, KY 48202
Fhrone: {502y 574-4030C Custamer Number: 106744
boo# mem _ Dsscription: e Tl Cosf]
1 Maple {Sugar} Remove 1 $758.00
Remave 21.5" DBH: sugay meaple and stump
Subtotal: Fea.00
Tax: SO0
Totfak $763.006
Py %,«_'; O b |
lN;“‘x‘{ P Qﬁ'i"\
Dot

We: proposa: to fumisth matemall, [atbar, and equijrment t compliste wark e zccardance: witts abave specifications.
Tihe: above prices(s) and specifiaction(s)) are: sattafactony and) hersby; sccepted!. Yow arer astherized! te din he work: as. spewifiad,,
Any amandments ar modifications: cfithi agreament shalll be-itnwritibg: and: executad by the-contracting parties.

This agreement: and any noted! attaehments canstitutes; e: entite: agreament batween Hre: Bobky Ray S| [, and itve belew signed canceming the subject mattar
hereof. Thic agreement supersedes all! grion agreements;. discussions, representations;, warsanties: and! covenants: Between the: Partieg with: respect to the above
spedcifiedwank. There are me wansmntes, represeatstions, covenents or agreements, expressed ar implied, between (he purtios excuaptihose exprassly sof foeddin

this: agreermant.

Your signature helow wilt constifute a kinding cantract

Representative’s Signature g//gm forl Mo Date 370101
Customer's Signature: Date
Page 1t of3

723 Lyndom Lane Louisville, KY 40222 Phaone 502.425.7654 Fax: 502.425.7607



"No Job Too Small, No Tree Too Talf®
wwwe bobrayco.com:

Bob Ray Company Inc. Proposal

Louisville Mefro f DCF 201308014
Arboarist: Adam B. Palmer
Thewsday, August 01, 2019 | A

Billing Address; adarmp@bobrayco.coms
Louiswite Metro § DCF
Job: Location: 3307 Fusmwn Bivd
G111 W Jefferson Sireet Louisville , Ky 40220
Leouisyille, KY 40202
Phrone-(502) 574-4030 Custamer Number: 106741
1 Mapls (Suges)  Remave ¥ $768.00
Remove 21.5" DBH sugsar magle and stump
Subfotalk §reE00
Fax: 000
Tofal: $768.00
lZ< Q.oi oce et
i \‘f r -

W prepuse: fo Sumisty ratedsl], lkbor, and equipment te commplite wokim sceandmes with above specifications.
Tirer afiove: prices(a)h and specioction(s)) ase satisfactey andi Heraty scceprg, Yo ane auttonzed o db the work a5 spezifisd],
Ay arendiments oF medifications: aff this sgreement: shall e imwritingy am execmhed by the comtracting penties:

Tkt agreenrent amd amy noted attachments constilives, the: eetile syreement hetwaemn the: Boty Ray Cm. [, a0 e tedlrws sigmed concemig the: sulijeat matter
Mmcmmxllwmmwmm,wmmmm,mmﬁmmﬁmmmmm:mmmmmmmmm
specified wari. Timme-ane no warnsmtizs, regresertations, cvenents or agreements, expressed or inplied), between e panties: except hose exgraselly ast futin

thiz agreermemt.
Yaur signature: betow wili catstiute a binding cantract

st Qg«w— Dafe 0812019

Date

Representative’s Signature:

Customers Signafure:
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