Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
# Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: BRENT T. ACKERSON |

| Amount: -$2:37192 ﬁz._og 0. €7 Date: 11/15/2019 |
A

Description of program/proj%?\ﬁﬁluding public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Relocation of a decorative concrete bench from artist's studio to Pee Wee Park; pouring of
concrete pad; placement of said bench. (The original bench was part of an artists program
(P.A.LLN.T.) funded by the Metro Council which placed benches along Breckenridge Lane in the
11th and 26th districts. Over time, the benches have been destroyed in automobile accidents and
removed from their original locations to safer locations. This bench was on the 26th District side

of the street and the new one is being placed in Pee Wee Park.)

City Agency: Ppublic Works
Contact Person: Christopher Schork

Agency Phone: 502.574-3921

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Breckenridge Lane Bench Replacement/Pee Wee Park

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

‘Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?
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Noble, Jeffrex T

From: Noble, Jeffrey T

Sent: Friday, November 15, 2019 4:41 PM
To: Noble, Jeffrey T

Subject: FW: Let's move a bench!

From: Schork, Christopher L. <Christopher.Schork@Iouisvilieky.gov>

Sent: Friday, October 25, 2019 8:54 AM

To: Smith, Bryan G <Bryan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>; Garton, Michael J. <Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Noble, Jeffrey T <Jeffrey.Noble @louisvilleky.gov>; Maier, Tim <Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov>; Ackerson, Brent
<Brent.Ackerson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

After figuring the cost for a possible 8 hours of work {could be less ) depending on conditions, labor and materials total
would be $2,371.92. | will work with Tim and Bryan about nailing down a date to accomplish this work and respond

accordingly.

Get Qutlook foriQS

From: Garton, Michael J.

Sent: Tuesday, June 4, 2019 4:20 PM

To: Smith, Bryan G <Bryan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Noble, Jeffrey T <Jeffrey.Noble @louisvilleky.gov>; Maier, Tim <Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov>; Ackerson, Brent
<Brent.Ackerson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

Bryan,

Just checking in on this project. Have you had a chance to work out a plan on the cost/timeline? We are happy to help in
any way we can to make this project move as soon as possible. If we missed any communication, our apologies.

Thanks for your help,

-MG

From: Garton, Michael J. <Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, April 16, 2019 2:43 PM

To: Smith, Bryan G <Bryan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Noble, jeffrey T <Jeffrey.Noble@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

Thanks for the update. After talking with Parks initially, we settled on location #1 (on the attached location concept
document we received from Parks). That looks to me to be directly opposite the existing bench, which will be removed.

Does that make sense?



I've copied Jeff Noble to confirm this decision.
_mg

From: Smith, Bryan G

Sent: Tuesday, April 16, 2019 1:18 PM

To: Garton, Michael J. <Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

Attached are pictures of the area in question. Can you let me know exactly where you want the concrete pad please.
Thanks



From: Schork, Christopher L. <Christopher.Schork@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 11, 2019 1:24 PM

To: Noble, Jeffrey T <Jeffrey.Noble@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Garton, Michaei J. <Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>; Smith,
Bryan G <Bryan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>; Maier, Tim <Tim.Maier@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Ackerson, Brent
<Brent.Ackerson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

I went and looked at this today and found our point of entry to grab it. We will get the bench in the next few days and
will make a plan to pour and set it at the park this coming Saturday. 1 will send pictures of the finished product. Thank

you.

From: Noble, Jeffrey T

Sent: Thursday, November 07, 2019 10:24 AM

To: Schork, Christopher L.; Garton, Michael J.; Smith, Bryan G; Maier, Tim; Ackerson, Brent
Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

Very good and thank you. -- Jeff

From: Schork, Christopher L. <Christopher.Schork@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 7, 2019 10:19 AM

To: Noble, leffrey T <Jeffrey.Noble@louisvilleky.gov>; Garton, Michael J. <Michael.Garton@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Smith,
Bryan G <Bryan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>; Maier, Tim <Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov>; Ackerson, Brent
<Brent.Ackerson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Let's move a bench!

Thank you , we will handle getting it secured and | will update when it is placed.

Chris Schork

———————— Original message --------

From: "Noble, Jeffrey T" <jeffrey.Noble @louisvilleky.gov>

Date: 11/7/19 10:16 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Schork, Christopher L." <Christopher.Schork@louisvilleky.gov>, "Garton, Michael J."
<Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>, "Smith, Bryan G" <Bryan.Smith@Ilouisvilleky.gov>, "Maier, Tim"
<Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov>, "Ackerson, Brent" <Brent.Ackerson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW: Let's move a bench!

All -~

The bench is located in the rear of 330 E. College Street {40203). According to the owner, “the alley is closed off so they
need to circle around the block and come in from behind.” This is the block between Preston and Floyd and College and

Breckinridge.
The building is unattended and the bench is outside under a tarp.

We are appropriating the costs from the 26" NDF to Public Works to pay for the work.




Let me know what else you need to know and thank you for this. 1 am hopeful we can at least secure the bench as soon
as possible as right not it is not in a secure location.

Thanks.

e Jeff

Jeff T. Noble

Legislative Aide to Council Member Brent T. Ackerson
26™ District

601 W. Jefferson Street, Room 318

Louisville, Kentucky 40202

502-574-1126

jeff.noble@louwsvilleky.gov

Hi Jeff,
We have had the bench moved outside of the studio and tarped down. | will send along some photos. It is ready for

pickup whenever Public Works has a time slot available. Please let me know what you hear from them.
Thanks Penny












Noble, Jeffrey T

From: Schork, Christopher L.

Sent: Monday, November 18, 2019 2:13 PM

To: Ackerson, Brent; Noble, Jeffrey T; Garton, Michael J,; Smith, Bryan G; Maier, Tim
Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

Attachments: SKM_C284e19111813560.pdf

.

The final cost for the project with the bench ended up beig 52,030.69. Jhave attached the work order for any

reference issues. Thank you and let me know if you have any-guestie

From: Ackerson, Brent

Sent: Monday, November 18, 2019 7:40 AM

To: Schork, Christopher L.; Noble, Jeffrey T; Garton, Michael J.; Smith, Bryan G; Maier, Tim
Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

Thanks for getting this done, Chris. We will report this project completed to our constituents. | know they greatly
appreciate your efforts.

-brent

From: Schork, Christopher L. <Christopher.Schork@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Saturday, November 16, 2019 1:07 PM

To: Noble, Jeffrey T <Jeffrey.Noble@louisvilleky.gov>; Garton, Michael J. <Michael.Garton@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Smith,
Bryan G <Bryan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>; Maier, Tim <Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov>; Ackerson, Brent
<Brent.Ackerson@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Let's move a bench!

Attaching these would help.

Chris Schork

-------- Original message --------

From: "Noble, Jeffrey T" <leffrey.Noble@louisvilleky.gov>

Date: 11/15/19 11:07 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Schork, Christopher L." <Christopher.Schork@louisvilleky.gov>, "Garton, Michael J."
<Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>, "Smith, Bryan G" <Bryan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>, "Maier, Tim"
<Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov>, "Ackerson, Brent" <Brent.Ackerson@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

| was out yesterday or would have responded then. Thanks for this update. -- Jeff

From: Schork, Christopher L. <Christopher.Schork@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 14, 2019 10:27 AM
To: Noble, leffrey T <Jeffrey.Noble @louisvilleky.gov>; Garton, Michael J. <Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>; Smith,

Bryan G <Bryan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>; Maier, Tim <Tim.Maier@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Ackerson, Brent




Metro info. Development & Asset System WORK ORDER: 19-RDS-05788

Prirted TH18/2019  14507PM

for Louisville
Work Order & 18-RDS-05786 Activity:  Special Project

ASSET D FROM:

ASSETID TO
From Address 2813 KLONDIKE LN intersection:
To Address:
Area: 011003-3
Map #: MAMZ1D District: 26
Location: NIAMIA
initiated By: CECHORK - Christopher Schork nitiated: 11/18/2019 Scheduled:
Assigned To: CSCHORK - Christopher Schark Due:
Assigned Dept Public. Works Roads - East Priority:
Application Name: Concrete and Bench placement for Council in Pee Wee Park
Work Order Costs:
Labor Costs
Labor Cost Total: $1,742.69
Materials Costs
PW Materals PWCONC $IBROD
Materials Cost Total: $288.00
GRAND TOTAL $2,030.69
Work Crder Fees:
Work Order Description:

East District poured a 4x8 concrete pad and secured then placed a special carved concrete bench for Council District 26 in Pee Wee Park off Klondike Ln,

Work Order Comments:
Date Cormment
11182018 1:32.38P) Work Order Created at 11/18/2019 1:32 PM.
11/18/2018  1:39:13Ph This work has been completed as of 11/16/2018,
Workflow History:
Task Name: Closed Task Status: Due Date: 11/18/201%8

Completed By: (; Complete Date:

111812019

Task Status: Inspection Required Due Date: 11/18/2018

Task Name: Open
Complete Date: 11/18/2019

Completed By: Chrstopher Schork ()
Task Name: Inspection

Completed By: Christopher Schork (Public Works Roads - East)
Task Name: Work Task Status: Completed Due Date: 11/18/2018
Completed By: Chiistopher Schork (Pubiic Works Roads - East) Complete Date: 11/18/2019

Task Status: Work Reguired Due Date: 11/18/2018
Complete Date: 11/18/2012

SR Customer Comments SR Nbr
SR Comments: SR Nbn.
Date Comment
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Wagner, David B

From: Noble, Jeffrey T

Sent: Wednesday, December 4, 2019 11:29 AM

To: Wagner, David B; Bell, LaTonya J.; Blackwell, Rick
Subject: FW: Let's move a bench!

David -

Per LaTonya, please include this email with the attachment for ltem #12.
Thanks.

E jeff

From: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2 @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, December 4, 2019 11:22 AM

To: Nobile, Jeffrey T <Jeffrey.Noble @louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Let's move a bench!

fyi

From: Noble, Jeffrey T <jeffrey.Noble @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, November 22, 2019 3:32 PM

To: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonva.Bell2 @louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Let's move a bench!

From: Schork, Christopher L. <Christopher.Schork@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Saturday, November 16, 2019 1:06 PM

To: Noble, Jeffrey T <jeffrey.Noble@louisvilleky.gov>; Garton, Michael J. <Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>; Smith,
Bryan G <Bryan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>; Maier, Tim <Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov>; Ackerson, Brent
<Brent.Ackerson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Let's move a bench!

Please see attached pictures of new pad and placed bench. It was a pleasure for Public Works East District to help with
this project. Thank you and have a great holiday season!

Chris Schork

-------- Original message ---—-—--
From: "Noble, Jeffrey T" <Jeffrey.Noble @louisvilleky.gov>
Date: 11/15/19 11:07 AM (GMT-05:00)




To: "Schork, Christopher L." <Christopher.Schork@louisvilleky.gov>, "Garton, Michael J."
<Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>, "Smith, Bryan G" <Brvan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>, "Maier, Tim"
<Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov>, "Ackerson, Brent" <Brent.Ackerson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

| was out yesterday or would have responded then. Thanks for this update. -- Jeff

From: Schork, Christopher L. <Christopher.Schork@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 14, 2019 10:27 AM

To: Noble, Jeffrey T <leffrey. Noble@louisvilleky.gov>; Garton, Michael J. <Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>; Smith,
Bryan G <Bryan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>; Maier, Tim <Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov>; Ackerson, Brent
<Brent.Ackerson@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

We have secured the bench at our shop and will be doing the install on 11/16/19 this Saturday. Will follow up when
finished. Thank You.

From: Noble, Jeffrey T

Sent: Monday, November 11, 2019 2:09 PM

To: Schork, Christopher L.; Garton, Michael J.; Smith, Bryan G; Maier, Tim; Ackerson, Brent
Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

Excelient. Thanks for this update. -- Jeff

From: Schork, Christopher L. <Christopher.Schork@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 11, 2019 1:24 PM

To: Noble, Jeffrey T <Jeffrev.Noble @louisvilleky.gov>; Garton, Michael ). <Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>; Smith,
Bryan G <Bryan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>; Maier, Tim <Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov>; Ackerson, Brent
<Brent.Ackerson@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

I went and looked at this today and found our point of entry to grab it. We will get the bench in the next few days and
will make a plan to pour and set it at the park this coming Saturday. | will send pictures of the finished product. Thank
you.

From: Noble, Jeffrey T

Sent: Thursday, November 07, 2019 10:24 AM

To: Schork, Christopher L.; Garton, Michael 1.; Smith, Bryan G; Maier, Tim; Ackerson, Brent
Subject: RE: Let's move a bench!

Very good and thank you. -- Jeff

From: Schork, Christopher L. <Christopher.Schork@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 7, 2019 10:19 AM

To: Noble, Jeffrey T <Jeffrey.Noble @louisvilleky.gov>; Garton, Michael J. <Michael.Garton@louisvilleky.gov>; Smith,
Bryan G <Bryan.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>; Maier, Tim <Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov>; Ackerson, Brent
<Brent.Ackerson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Let's move a bench!

Thank you , we will handle getting it secured and | will update when it is placed.




Chris Schork

———————— Original message ---—----

From: "Noble, Jeffrey T" <jeffrey.Noble@louisvilleky.gov>

Date: 11/7/19 10:16 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Schork, Christopher L." <Christopher.Schork@louisvilleky.gov>, "Garton, Michae! J."
<Michael.Garton®@louisvilleky.gov>, "Smith, Bryan G" <Bryan.Smith@Ilouisvilleky.gov>, "Maier, Tim"
<Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov>, "Ackerson, Brent" <Brent.Ackerson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW: Let's move a bench!

Alf -

The bench is located in the rear of 330 E. College Street (40203). According to the owner, “the alley is closed off so they
need to circle around the block and come in from behind.” This is the block between Preston and Floyd and College and
Breckinridge.

The building is unattended and the bench is outside under a tarp.
We are appropriating the costs from the 26™ NDF to Public Works to pay for the work.

Let me know what else you need to know and thank you for this. | am hopeful we can at least secure the bench as soon
as possible as right not it is not in a secure location.

Thanks.

e Jeff

Jeff T. Noble

Legislative Aide to Council Member Brent T. Ackerson
26" District

601 W. Jefferson Street, Room 318

Louisville, Kentucky 40202

502-574-1126

jeff.noble@louisvilleky.gov

Hi Jeff,

We have had the bench moved outside of the studio and tarped down. | will send along some photos. It is ready for
pickup whenever Public Works has a time slot available. Please let me know what you hear from them.

Thanks Penny













