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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
[ Primary Sponsor: Brandon Coan |

[ Amount: $362.88 Date: Dec 16,2019 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
$362.88 to Public Works to produce and install 12 Lock/ Take/ Hide signs to be installed on the 800

- 1000 block of Cherokee Rd, Eastern Parkway between Bardstown Rd and Willow Ave and
Highland Ave between Baxter and Bardstown.

City Agency: Public Works

Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502 574 0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

8 ‘ $362.88 Dec 16, 2019
District # oyhcil Member Signature™" Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CTFOR1320PuI03P To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

“Interagency Name: Public Works

' Program/Project Name: Lock Take Hide Signs

E Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

" Appropriating Funding?

" Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

, Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

' Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
- disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

' Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
~own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
* funding source is probably NDF.

| Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
. life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

' Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

" Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
Hf so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

" Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
" estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

No

No

Yes

Submitted by: Jasmine Weatherby

Date: Dec 16, 20&

Revised May 2016



Weatherby, Jasmini

From: Coan, Brandon

Sent: Friday, December 13, 2019 1:33 PM

To: Oliver, Robert L

Cc: Hallahan, Bridget; King, Robert J; Weatherby, Jasmine; Hall, Barbara C Jennings, Patricia
A; Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Lock, Take, Hide Initiative

Officer Oliver — I’m sharing your reply with the rest of the group.

Jasmine - please prepare transfer of $362.88 (12 x $30.24) CIF to PW.

PW Team — do you need any further instruction on where to place the signs? Anything else you need from LMPD or us?

Thanks Very Much,
SBC

From: Oliver, Robert L <Robert.Oliver@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, December 13, 2019 1:20 PM

To: Coan, Brandon <Brandon.Coan@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Lock, Take, Hide Initiative

Sorry Major | somehow have missed this chain of emails. | don’t know Cherokee Park very well, so I'm not sure what you
would need as far as coverage. However Metro Signs and Marketing already has the design and can produce the signs

for $30.24 per sign which includes installation.

If you need my help please just let me know.

Officer Robert Oliver
Louisville Metro Police Dept. 1st Div
416 N 29th St, Louisville, KY 40212
Division Resource Officer

Division Warrant/Traffic

Honor Guard Unit

Work 502-574-7167
Robert.oliver@louisvilleky.gov




{Lyouice suiproiouy aclivify call

{502] 574LMPD

From: Coan, Brandon

Sent: Friday, December 13, 2019 11:18 AM

To: Hallahan, Bridget

Cc: King, Robert J; Weatherby, Jasmine; Oliver, Robert L; Hall, Barbara C; Jennings, Patricia A; Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Lock, Take, Hide Initiative

Major Hallahan — this confirms that we will fund 12 signs to be placed: a) 800-1000 Block of Cherokee; b)

Eastern Parkway btw Bardstown and Willow; and c) Highland Ave btw Baxter and Bardstown. | am adding all the
relevant folks who helped District 4 and am asking someone to quote us the price; Jasmine will then initiate payment
and hopefully we can get the areas signed without much delay. Anyone with questions can call me: 574-1108. Thanks!

Brandon

From: Hallahan, Bridget <Bridget.Hallahan@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, December 11, 2019 3:03 PM

To: Coan, Brandon <Brandon.Coan@louisvilleky.gov>; King, Robert J <Robert.King2 @louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Weatherby, Jasmine <jasmine.Weatherby@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Lock, Take, Hide initiative

I drove Cherokee Road after our meeting yesterday. | think we can get good coverage if we get 8 signsTpr that area. We

could use 4 to place about a block off of the intersection of Eastern Pwy and Bardstown.

£ HdBTOZELT 93

So 12 total should work.

NAY BE



