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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
] Primary Sponsor: Kevin Triplett [

| Amount: $4,000 ~ Date: Feb 27, 2020 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding is to install 4 parking T's and No Stopping Signs for E. Warnock Street between Crittenden
Dr. and Bradley Ave.

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502-574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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‘ ‘Interagency Name:

Program/Project Name:

Request Form: s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

- Appropriating Funding?

- Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

Parking T's and No Stopping Signs

- account numbers in the request form description?

- Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

- the request exclude the matching fund amount?

' Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
- disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
- own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the

 funding source is probably NDF.

“ Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
. life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
- If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

| Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

. estimate and description of cost?

Public Works & Assets

Yes/No/NA

Yes

No

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

NA

No

Yes

Submitted by:

shughes

Date: Feb 27, 2020

Revised May 2016



Luckett, Daniel R

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 11:26 AM
To: Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: FW: E Warnock St parking T's

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 11:03 AM
To: Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: RE: E Warnock St parking T's

Yes, we will accept funding for the additional signs as well.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, February 27,2020 11:02 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: E Warnock St parking T's

Will you accept those funds as well?

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 11:01 AM
To: Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: RE: E Warnock St parking T's

You can add $1,000 if you would like to include (4) No Stopping Anytime signs to be installed at the No Parking areas

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 10:36 AM
To: Luckett, Daniel R; Triplett, Kevin D.
Subject: FW: E Warnock St parking T's

The total project cost for the parking T's and No Stopping hatching for E Warnock St between Crittenden & Bradley is
estimated at $3,000. Public Works will accept these funds to complete the project sometime after Derby and while U of
L is closed for Summer break. The markings will be completed in two phases so that parking is only restricted on one
side of the street at a time.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

I created a rough estimate at the following per triangular section assuming each is 30’ long:
4” exterior = $0.75%43’

8” hatching = $4.50*30’

Total per triangular section is approximately $175



Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 10:34 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: E Warnock St parking T's

Jeff,

I would recommend 22’ for interior spaces and 20’ for exterior unless we have to go below that. |1did a rough
measurement of the south side (670’) and we can get (2) exterior spaces at 20’ and (26) interior spaces at 21.9’. The
north side measures apx. 640" which leaves (2) exterior spaces at 20’ and (25) interiors at 21.6" each. | believe we can
perform a slight tweak to the plan by stating to have exterior spaces at 20’ and equally space all interior spaces if you
agree with my suggestion.

Kindly,

Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE

Louisville Metro Public Works

Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings
601 W lefferson St, Room &

{502) 574-3650

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 10:05 AM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@fouisvilleky.gov>; Grothaus, Seth T <Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky .gov>
Cc: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>; Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin.Triplett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: E Warnock St parking T's

CM Triplett is interested in funding a pilot project to designate on-street parking spaces using the parking T’s and needs
a cost estimate for the appropriation. I've sketched up a layout, and have the unit price for the parking T’s, but need
some help estimating the hatching markings. Can you guys estimate the hatching on the attached plan?

Jeffrey Brown, PE

Assistant Director

Metro Public Works & Assets
444 S 5th St, 4th Fl

Louisville, KY 40202

Office 502-574-0065

Cell 502-773-3222
Jeffrey.Brown@LouisvilleKY.gov






