Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
& Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Bill Hollander |

| Amount: $250.39 Date: 02/27/2020 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

NDF funds to Metro Parks for six (6) yard signs for Brownsboro Road near the Crescent Hill Golf
Course. The signs will share that the golf course is open.

City Agency: Metro Parks

Contact Person: pmargaret Brosko

Agency Phone: 502.574-6339

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Interagency Name: Metro Parks

Program/Project Name:

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
 life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

“Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Mewo Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Six Yard Signs for Crescent Hill Golf Couse
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FASTSIGNS. ESTIMATE: 202 - 24747

More than fast. More than signs’ Estimate Date: 2/25/2020 10:56:00AM
FASTSIGNS - Fern Valley Page 1 of 1 Salesperson: Jess!ca Mutter
6005A Fern Valley Road Phone: 502-969-7002 Entereq By: Jessica Mutter
Louisville, KY 40228 Fax: 502-969-2177 Date Printed: 2/25/2020 10:58:19AM
Email: 202@fastsigns.com Salesperson: 202@fastsigns.com
Project Description: 18" X 24" Single-Sided Yard Signs with Step Stakes / Standard Turnaround
Customer: Louisville Parks and Recreation 1297 Trevilian Way
Ordered by:  Ernest Sedgwick Louisville, KY 40213
Phone: (502) 574-6054
Email: Ernest.Sedgwick@Iouisvilleky.gov
PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QTY SIDES HxW UNIT COST TOTALS
Coroplast 4mm Coroplast 3mm with cut or 6 1 18x24 $39.73 $238.39
printed vinyl applied.
Color: White —_—t
Wire Step Stake Wire Step Stake 6 1 1x1 $2.00 $12.00
Color: White

TERMS: Payment is due upon placement of the order.

Line Item Total: 250.39
ESTIMATE RECEIVED/APPROVED BY: Subtotal: < $250.39 P
X / / Taxes: $15.02
Total: $265.41
CUSTOMER SIGNATURE DATE
P.0./Credit Card # Exp:_ 7/ Deposit Required: $132.71

Bill To: Louisville Parks and Recreation
Attention: Ernest Sedgwick

1297 Trevilian Way
Louisville, KY 40213

Thank You for choosing
FASTSIGNS

Copyright © 2015 FASTSIGNS International, Inc
More than fast. More than signs.®

SYSTEM\FASTSIGNS_CRYSTAL_Estimate-F1101




Ethridge, Kyle

L SRR S

From: Brosko, Margaret A.
Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 9:27 A
To: Ethridge, Kyle )
Subject: RE: Crescent Hill signs
Great!
Thanks,
Margaret

LOUISVILLE

PARKS

AND RECREATION

From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 9:26 AM

To: Brosko, Margaret A. <Margaret.Brosko@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Crescent Hill signs

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (5602) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the District 9 eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood news and alerts!

From: Brosko, Margaret A. <Margaret.Brosko@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 1:51 PM

To: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Crescent Hill signs

Kyle
Please see the attached quotes and let me know which you prefer.

Thanks,
Margaret
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