
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request 

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF) 

111 Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF) 

Municipal Aid Program (MAP) 

Paving Fund (PAV) 
I Primary Sponsor: Councilman Kevin Triplett

I Amount: $1,370.84 Date: March 5, 2020 

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, 
location of project/program and any external grantee(s): 

District 15 is requesting "No Stopping" signs in the cul-de-sac at the end of W. Florence near the 
Circle K to alleviate parking congestion in the area. This request has been vetted through Public 
Works. 

City Agency: Public Works and Assets

Contact Person: Williams Hines 

Agency Phone: 502-794-6862 

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have 
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached 
documentatio from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure. 
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Approved by: 
Appropriations Committee Chairman 
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$1,370.84 

Amount 

Request Amount: _________ _ Amended Amount: 

Date 

---------

Reference#: ___________ _ To OMB: ___________ _ 

Budget Revision#: __________________________ _ 

Account#: 
-----------------------------

To Project Manager: ________ _ Completion Date: 
---------

Actual Cost: Funds Returned: 
------------ ---------

Revised May 2016 
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, Interagency Name: Public Works 

Program/Project Name: "No Stopping" sign s  on Florence

. Request Form: ls the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) 
i Appropriating Funding? 

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with 
account numbers in the request form description? 

: Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of 
; the request exclude the matching fund amount? 

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they 
' disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? 

, Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville 
: own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the 
' funding source is probably NDF. 

' Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful 
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. 

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than 
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. 

l Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
' estimate and description of cost? 

Submitted by: __________ sh_u_g_h _e _s ________ _

Revised May 2016 
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Date: Mar 5, 2020



From: Brown, Jeffrey E 

Sent: 

To: 

Wednesday, March 4, 2020 10:52 AM 

Luckett, Daniel R 

Subject: RE: No Parking Signs- *SR-SIGN-20-19818 

Public Works will accept funds for the fabrication and installation of the No Parking signs 

Jeffrey Brown, PE 

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov> 

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 10:59 AM 

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov> 

Subject: FW: No Parking Signs- *SR-SIGN-20-19818 

Thank you for this estimate! I have to confirm with the Councilman however will you accept the funds from our District 

15 office to facilitate these signs and installation? 

From: Hines, William A 
Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 12:36 PM 
To: Luckett, Daniel R; Sparks, Stuart; Brown, Jeffrey E; Grothaus, Seth T; Jennings, Patricia A; Roades, Bonnie J 
Subject: RE: No Parking Signs- *SR-SIGN-20-19818 

Cost estimate 

• (6) 12xl8" signs $181.44

• (6) 1 Oft posts $150

• (6) anchor sleeves 59.40

• Installation materials & labor $940

• Total cost $1,370.84

William A. Hines Ill 
Labor Supervisor 
Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets 
Signs & Markings Division 
3507 Newburg Rd 
Louisville. KY 40218 
Phone: (502) 794-6862 
Fax: (502) 458-4868 
https://louisvilleky.gov/ 

Error! Filename not specified. 
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Daniel R 

From: Hines, William A 

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 12:36 PM 

To: Luckett, Daniel R; Sparks, Stuart; Brown, Jeffrey E; Grothaus, Seth T; Jennings, Patricia A; 
Roades, Bonnie J 

Subject: RE: No Parking Signs- *SR-SIGN-20-19818 

Cost estimate 

• (6) 12x18" signs $181.44
• (6) 10ft posts $150
• (6) anchor sleeves 59.40
• Installation materials & labor $940
• Total cost $1,370.84

William A. Hines Ill 
Labor Supervisor 
Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets 

Signs & Markings Division 
3507 Newburg Rd 
Louisville. KY 40218 
Phone: (502) 794-6862 
Fax: (502) 458-4868 
https://louisvilleky.gov/ 

-------- Original message --------

From: "Luckett, Daniel R" <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov> 
Date: 2/26/20 10:28 AM (GMT-05:00) 
To: "Sparks, Stuart" <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>, "Brown, Jeffrey E" 
<Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>, "Grothaus, Seth T" <Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>, "Jennings, Patricia 
A" <Patricia.Jennings@louisvilleky.gov>, "Hines, William A" <William.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>, "Roades, 
Bonnie J" <Bonnie.Roades@louisvilleky.gov> 
Subject: RE: No Parking Signs- *SR-SIGN-20-19818 

Thank you Stuart! Yes .... please get me that cost estimate. Thank you! 

From: Sparks, Stuart 
Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 10:25 AM 
To: Luckett, Daniel R; Brown, Jeffrey E; Grothaus, Seth T; Jennings, Patricia A; Hines, William A; Roades, Bonnie J 
Subject: RE: No Parking Signs- *SR-SIGN-20-19818 

Jeff, 
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We can work up a plan, however, unless the Director approves an increase in budget we are out of no parking sign 

blanks and we have been out of funding for materials since November. We had some large project costs which ate a 

significant part of our budget this year. So, even if we get project funding it won't be enough for us to place an order. 

Dan, 

We will work up a plan and get it in the works ASAP. The section of roadway is approximately 400'. This will necessitate 

a minimum of (6) no parking anytime signs. This is if we increase the spacing to 200' which is much wider than typical 

(apx 100' to 150'). 

William or Patricia, 

Can you please provide a cost estimate to install (6) no parking anytime signs on the dead end portion of W Florence 

Ave? 

Thanks, 

Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE 

Louisville Metro Public Works 

Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings 

601 W Jefferson St, Room 8 

(502} 574-3650 

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov> 

Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 4:06 PM 

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; Grothaus, Seth T 

<Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>; Jennings, Patricia A <Patricia.Jennings@louisvilleky.gov>; Hines, William A 

<William.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>; Roades, Bonnie J <Bonnie.Roades@louisvilleky.gov> 

Subject: RE: No Parking Signs- *SR-SIGN-20-19818 

Thank you all! I need 3-4. Thank you! 

From: Brown, Jeffrey E 
Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 2:19 PM 
To: Sparks, Stuart; Grothaus, Seth T; Jennings, Patricia A; Hines, William A 
Cc: Luckett, Daniel R 
Subject: RE: No Parking Signs- *SR-SIGN-20-19818 

Can you guys work up a plan and cost estimate to install NO STOPPING signs for the cul-de-sac at the end of W Florence 

Ave? 
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Jeffrey Brown, PE 

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov> 

Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 1:49 PM 
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