Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
[ Primary Sponsor: /' W] Bovhavsy Sextan Syt

| Amount: )i 249,25 Date: /-4 -20 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional fundlng sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s): | 1 =sc {-\LVI cls
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City Agency: p ublie I /\) - V’Iés
Contact Person: >y Bradl =y
Agency Phone: (502) éﬁyﬁ[, -5 59/

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: qu b N L)‘V”IL;)

Program/Project Name: ‘\/\[O BLY'L/J\I/\;‘ pj\}uq,\g_uc-} N(af\ﬁ—l\x/? Q/N;?%N I{f%ﬂﬂ
. Yes/No

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? x4
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? - /\/ A
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of ’
the request exclude the matching fund amount? e /l/ A
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? - /l/‘o

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the o
funding source is probably NDF. }/

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. = ]/;%
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than _
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. - /{/‘-j

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? - /l/ O

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? -

Submitted by: %/ZW%WM»M Date: /x/ - —20

Revised May 2016



Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D.

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Monday, April 6, 2020 9:20 AM

To: Sparks, Stuart; Jennings, Patricia A; Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D.

Cc: Hines, William A

Subject: RE: No Parking pavement markings for driveway at 626 E Main St

| think Wanda was working on the funding

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, April 6, 2020 9:18 AM

To: Jennings, Patricia A <Patricia.Jennings@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Hines, William A <William.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: No Parking pavement markings for driveway at 626 E Main St

Jeff,

I received an email from KYTC regarding this concern. | believe they will be supportive of the installation of
markings. Was this funded project approved?

Thanks,

Stuart

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Monday, March 2, 2020 11:32 AM

To: Jennings, Patricia A <Patricia.Jennings@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Hines, William A <William.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: No Parking pavement markings for driveway at 626 E Main St

Jeff,
Cost estimate provided below.
Thanks,

Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE

Louisville Metro Public Works

Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings
601 W Jefferson St, Room 8

(502) 574-3650




From: Jennings, Patricia A <Patricia.Jennings@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 10:44 AM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: No Parking pavement markings for driveway at 626 E Main St

Stuart cost for marking request $ 1349. 25 also we do not have a No Stopping stencil T could get
a quote if you would like. -

(8) boxes of thermoplastic

(1) bag of glass beads

(4) crew members

(2) trucks

(1) Thermo applicator & rider seat

: /‘fi/f//}'/‘(/ // . f! )/////lr/u
Labor Supervisor |
Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
Signs & Markings Division
3507 Newburg Rd
Louisville, KY 40218
Office. (502) 574-3251
Cell: (602) 773-3221

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, February 24, 2020 11:39 AM

To: Jennings, Patricia A <Patricia.Jennings@louisvilleky.gov>; Hines, William A <William.Hines@Ilouisvilleky.gov>;
Grothaus, Seth T <Seth.Grothaus@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW: No Parking pavement markings for driveway at 626 E Main St

Patricia,

Please work up a cost estimate to hatch out the below shown section of E Main St. We will use 8” white thermo
for the cross hatching and 4” white thermo for the outline. Also, quote the addition of “No parking” text.

Thanks,

Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE

Louisville Metro Public Works

Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings
601 W Jefferson St, Room 8

(502) 574-3650




From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, February 24, 2020 8:01 AM

To: Grothaus, Seth T <Seth.Grothaus@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Sexton-Smith, Barbara <Barbara.SextonSmith@louisvilleky.gov>; Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D.
<Wanda.Mitchell-Smith@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: No Parking pavement markings for driveway at 626 E Main St

Seth & Stuart,
Can you guys work up a cost estimate to install hatching and possible NO PARKING text in front of the driveway

at 626 E Main St? It looks like the full length of the signed no parking area is 65’

b G s i

Jeffrey Brown, PE

Assistant Director

Metro Public Works & Assets
444 S 5th St, 4th FI

Louisville, KY 40202

Office 502-574-0065

Cell 502-773-3222
Jeffrey.Brown@LouisvilleKY.gov




