Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
s Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

| Primary Sponsor: James Peden

| Amount: $1600.00 Date: Apr 30, 2020

]

location .of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Purchase and install 2 solar LED enhanced warning signs to be placed on South Watterson Trall
near Glaser Lane. The signs will notify drivers of curves on South Watterson Trail, the area is a

frequent site of accidents.

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

City Agency: Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Stuart Sparks

Agency Phone: 574-3650

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached

documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
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Department/Project:

Additional Signatures
I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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- Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

: Prqg;gq;/}’roject Name:

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this préjec't,'aréﬂthey
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: s the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If'so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

~ Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Solar LED Warning Signs/ South Watterson Trail

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

NA

No

Yes

Submitted by: John Torsky

Date: Apr 30, 2020

Revised May 2016




‘ TAPCO SALES QUOTE
Safe travels.

Traffic and Parking Control Co., Inc. Q20005344

5100 West Brown Deer Road 3/23/2020
Brown Deer, Wisconsin 53223

Phone (800) 236-0112 » TAPCOnet.com + Fax (800) 444-0331

Louisville Metro Public Works
Patricia A. Jennings

601 W Jefferson St, Rm 10
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202

USA

Louisville Metro Public Works
Patricia A. Jennings

601 W Jefferson St, Rm 10
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202
USA

Net 30 DAYS

BLINKERSIGNS 4/22/2020 Nick Poblocki

Item Description Quantity um Price Extension
300127 Blinkersign,36"x36"x.100, OCT, DG3, White, Solar, 2 EA 800.00 $1,600.00

8 Red LEDs, DPM, KY Spec

Solar powered equipment requires no shading
Furnish only quote. Installation is not included.
Thank you! Nicholas Poblocki
PH#262-754-4342 email: nickp@tapconet.com

Shipment within
Acceptance By
Date

By

For terms and conditions, please visit: http://www.tapconet.com/terms-and-conditions




Torskz, John N

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Friday, April 24, 2020 11:19 AM
To: Peden, James

Subject: Re: 7102 s watterson trail

CM Peden,

The quote is accurate. He said they don't have a part number for the specific sign we requested so he quoted
an item they do have a part number for but the cost will be the same. Please let me know if you would like to

proceed with this installation.

Kindly,

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, April 24, 2020 9:57 AM

To: Peden, James <James.Peden@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: 7102 s watterson trail

CM Peden,

This estimate is to purchase a solar LED enhanced advance warning sign on each approach. | just noticed the
quote is for the wrong LED enhanced signs. | have reached out to the provider to confirm if the pricing is the
same for the correct item requested. It simply is a sign (in each direction) which has yellow flashing strobe
lights around the perimeter of the sign to alert motorists to the fact there is a dangerous turn ahead. We are
just starting to use these LED enhanced signs so | don't have much local data on them, however, we have
installed a similar sign at a curve on Six Mile Ln at Klondike Ln (arrow board signs in curve) which have reduced

crashes.
I will let you know when | hear back from the provider.
Thanks,

Stuart

From: Peden, James <James.Peden@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, April 24, 2020 9:34 AM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: 7102 s watterson trail

I missed that email with the estimate, thanks for sending again. It's not that pricey, what exactly are we
doing?

Thanks




Torskx, John N

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Friday, April 24, 2020 10:03 AM
To: Peden, James

Subject: Re: 7102 s watterson trail

It will be this sign just with LED lights strobing around the perimeter.

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, April 24, 2020 9:57 AM

To: Peden, James <James.Peden@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: 7102 s watterson trail

CM Peden,

This estimate is to purchase a solar LED enhanced advance warning sign on each approach. 1just noticed the
quote is for the wrong LED enhanced signs. | have reached out to the provider to confirm if the pricing is the
same for the correct item requested. It simply is a sign (in each direction) which has yellow flashing strobe
lights around the perimeter of the sign to alert motorists to the fact there is a dangerous turn ahead. We are
just starting to use these LED enhanced signs so | don't have much local data on them, however, we have
installed a similar sign at a curve on Six Mile Ln at Klondike Ln (arrow board signs in curve) which have reduced

crashes.




Visit us at TAPCOnet.com

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 11:41 AM

To: Nick Poblocki <nick.poblocki@tapconet.com>

Cc: Peden, James <James.Peden@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Grothaus, Seth T <Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW: 7102 s watterson trail

Caution: This email originated outside the organization. Do not click:an‘y ‘links or attachments unless you know the

sender.

Nick,

We would like to get a cost estimate for a pair of LED enhanced modified reverse curve signs on S Watterson Trl at
Glaser Ln. It appears to me both directions will have adequate sky visibility to the south but wanted to get your opinion
too. What do you think? Below is an image of each of the advance curve warning signs and the google maps link. We
propose to replace each existing advance warning sign with the same layout on a LED enhanced sign.

Thanks,
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S s
Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE
Louisville Mietro Public Works
Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings
601 W Jefferson St, Room 8
(502) 574-3650

From: Peden, James <James.Peden@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 10:22 AM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: 7102 s watterson trail

Stuart, can you provide an estimate for whatever set of lights or signage you think is best for this area? We
will see if it's a possibility with what funds we have abailbe to us.

Thank you,
John Torsky




