Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
® Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Print Form

|

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Kevin Triplett

I Amount: $4,9895.00 Date: April 20, 2020

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

in District 15. Descriptions outline in proposal

Description of program/project including public purpoese, additional funding seurces,

Funding request for ground maintenance on 3rd Street, Southern Parkway and Taylor Bivd. ramps

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502-574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached

documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

15 $4,995.00 Apr 20, 2020
District # Amount Date
Approved by:

Date

Appropriations Committee Chairman
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:

Reference #Niék @5@@@ éﬁ@?f To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
Page 1



NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

- Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Ramp Maintenance

Yes/No/NA

- Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes
- Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA
- Request Form: If rﬁatching funds are to be used, does the amount of
- the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
- Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
- own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
funding source is probably NDF.

. Funding Source: 1f CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
- life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

- Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
- $5,0007 If so, an ordinance is required. No

 Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
- If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: shughes Date: Apr 20, 2020

Revised May 2016



Integrated Service Inc.

A Full Service Facility Maintenance Company

Metro Council District 15
601 W. Jefferson St.
Louisville, KY 40202

Proposal for Landscape Clean-up

Attn: Daniel Luckett Jr.

Clean-up rose beds and sign at
@264 West Ramps

Clean-up rose bushes, trim and
mulch with wood chips on SW
ramp sides and clean-up around

Southern Parkway

Clean-up rose bushes, trim and
mulch with wood chips on the
ramp West.

Taylor Blvd.
Clean-up rose bushes, trim and
mulch with wood chips on the
ramp West.
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Total for Proposed Clean up
Services

Spraying
264 SW Overpass corner. Spray
sterilant to kill out vegetation

and spray areas off Southern

Please contact Kevin Downs
INTEGRATED Services INC,
Kevin.downsisi@gmail.com
502-413-1729

Date 3/16/2020
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Hughes, Susan

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Monday, April 20, 2020 9:10 AM
To: Hughes, Susan

Subject: FW: Metro Dist 15 proposal.docx

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Wednesday, March 25, 2020 9:41 AM
To: Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: RE: Metro Dist 15 proposal.docx

Public Works will accept funds for the maintenance. Please make sure they are set up as a vendor with Metro to
save some time after the appropriation.

———————— Original message --------

From: "Luckett, Daniel R" <Daniel. Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Date: 3/25/20 9:32 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Brown, Jeffrey E" <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Metro Dist 15 proposal.docx

Good morning! | hope you are safe and weli!
Here is the quote from Integrated Services to ramp-lawn maintenance work at the 1-264 west ramp at both 3™ Street &

Southern Parkway, the north sides in District 15. The total is $4995.00 Will you accept the Smoney/appropriation?

From: Kevin Downs [mailto:kevin.downsisi@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, March 16, 2020 9:34 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: Metro Dist 15 proposal.docx

Here you go this would be for each time we would need to do.

Thanks

Kevin Downs

INTEGRATED SERVICES
502-413-1729

POBOX 43352

Louisville KY 40253
http:/integratedservicesinc.us/




