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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
e Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Cindi Fowler |

| Amount: $510.00 Date: 5-7-20 |

Description of program/proeject including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

District 14 Capital Infrastructure Funds to Louisville Metro Public Works for materials and
instailation. Public Works will install (2) wildlife crossing signs on Blevins Gap Rd.

City Agency: Louisville Metro Public Works

Contact Person: syart Sparks

Agency Phone: (502) 574-3650

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
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Department/Project:
Louisville Metro Public Work/Installation of (2) Wildlife Signs on Blevns Gap Rd.

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Name: Louisville Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Installation of (2) wildlife signs on Blevins Gap Rd.
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes B

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA B

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA B

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes B

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes B

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA IZ'

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA E]

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes E]

Submitted by:;M/ W

Date: &7"20

Revised May 2016



Thieneman, Cindx L

From: Fowler, Cindi

Sent: Thursday, May 7, 2020 12:17 PM
To: Thieneman, Cindy L

Subject: Geese crossing NDF

Cindy,

You have my permission to sign this NDF in my stead.
Thanks so much.
Cindi

Sent from my iPad
Cindi Fowler
D14 Councilwoman




Thieneman, Cindy L

R i s s o
From: Sparks, Stuart
Sent: Thursday, May 7, 2020 10:30 AM
To: Dearing, Connie M.; Fowler, Cindi; Thieneman, Cindy L
Cc: Harward, Sonya
Subject: Re: Blevins Gap Road - Geese Crossing Signage

Louisville Metro Public Works will accept the funds from District 14 to for this project.

From: Dearing, Connie M. <Connie.Dearing@louisvilieky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, May 7, 2020 8:48 AM

To: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Blevins Gap Road - Geese Crossing Signage

Good Morning!

I have been able to pull out of the stream of emails items that can be used as documentation for this CIF. So,
no worries there. However, | will need one email from Public Works stating that they will accept the funding
from District 14. | have included in this email below what | am able to use as the documentation but will wait
for the email of acceptance. | have attached the CIF packet, please complete and this must be signed as well.

From: "Sparks, Stuart” <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Date: May 4, 2020 at 7:14:42 AM EDT

To: "Fowler, Cindi" <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: "Tackett, Danielle" <Danielle. Tackett@louisvilleky.gov>, "Thieneman, Cindy L" <Cindy.Thieneman®@Iouisvilleky.gov>,
"Grothaus, Seth T" <Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Geese Crossing Signage

CW Fowler,

This is a case where if you would like to fund the project we will fabricate and install the requested

signage. The project cost will be $510 for materials and installation to install (2) wildlife crossing signs. Below
is an image of the sign layout. We will research the possibility of modifying it to look more like a goose and
change the layout if possible. As discussed on the phone Friday evening, if you are able to solidify a cost
center, we can bill the project to expeditiously we are glad to move this forward as quickly as possible.

<image00l.png>
Kindly,

Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE
Louisville Metro Public Works



Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings
601 W lefferson §t, Room 8
{502) 574-3650

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, May 4, 2020 11:54 AM

To: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Tackett, Danielle <Danielle. Tackett@louisvilleky.gov>; Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman@louisvilleky.gov>;
Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya . Bell2 @louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Geese crossing signs

CW Fowler,

Here is the MUTCD approved sign which we will use for this installation.

Regards,



