THIS IS A NEIGHBORHOOD DEVELOPMENF—>>

FUND

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Paving Fund (PAV)

| Primary Sponsor: Purvis

[Amount: $500.00 Date: 06/03/2020

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Sharing the cost of the 64 or 95 gallon recylcling carts with District 5 residents.

City Agency: Solid Waste Management

Contact Person: Amy Axom

Agency Phone: 502.5742783

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

5 ( %m[ o ﬁ(lﬂxﬂ $500.00 06/03/2020
District # ouncil Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: NDF 061720 SWMS 05 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Louisville Metro Solid Waste

Additional Signatures

1 have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Intgpaggncy Name Solid Wagter Management ‘ 7 -
Recycling Cart Cost Sharing

Program/Project Name:

‘Request Form: s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

"Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with |

account numbers in the request form description?

' Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
' the request exclude the matching fund amount?

'Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

" own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

NA
NA

NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
_ $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

NAYES

NO e

No
No
Yes

Submitted by: Councilwoman Donna Purvis

Date: 06/03/2020

Revised May 2016
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Bentley, Denise G.

o W
From: Axsom, Amy
Sent: Monday, April 27, 2020 2:32 PM
To: Bentley, Denise G.
Cc Hackett, Keith; Bradiey, Maxwell B.
Subject: FW: Recycling Carts for District 5
Attachments: SPWA-600-KM20042712020.pdf
importance: High

We can use the $1,000 to go ahead and buy additional carts. Every quarter (or month if you prefer) | will
provide spreadsheet style report on who receives them with name, address, phone and email if provided,
along with their cost which will let you know which cart they purchased. It looks like this:

iscount Reeveling Cart Program Participants through 3/31/2020.

Jay Wissing 2/11/20 | CreditCd | $28.00 | 1S 2541 Ellsworth Ave | wissingiav@gmail.com 502-609-5937
Barrett Goff 3/15/20 | s0z7 $28.00 |15 1027 Beecher Street | S02renters@grnati.oom $02-905-2653
Phuong Nguyen | 3/19/30 | 118 $2800 |15 1512 Tarquolse Dr S03-434-1928
Rachel Manning | 3/26/20 | 1133 $I7.70 | 15 919 Drésden Ave g S02-727-8815
Rathy tcEachem | 3/30/20 | w5 52800 | 19 £42 East Barbee Ave | igthymecachem i S@emalloony | 502-648-0303

We have a standard form (attached) that is provided to the constituent by calling MetroCall, Council District
office directly or our office to have the form mailed to them to chose which cart they wish to purchase. You
can also provide a link on your webpage to download that form.

On the 64 gallon cart, your contribution is $20.00 and on the 95 gallon cart it's $25.00 for your part. Your
$1,000 would roughly help 40-50 of your constituents purchase these recycling carts using the discounted
program!

Just let us know if you want to move forward. Thanks

Amy L. Axsom, (Interim) Administrative Supervisor
Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

Division of Solid Waste Management

600 Meriwether Avenue

Louisville, KY 40217

Ph: 574-2783

-----0Original Message--—-

From: Bentley, Denise G. <Denise.Bentley@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, April 27, 2020 11:20 AM

To: Hackett, Keith <Keith.Hackett@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom@louisvilleky.gov>; Baldon, Antonio J Sr <Antonio.BaldonSr@louisvilleky.gov>
1




Subject: Re: Recycling Carts for District 5
Thank you!

Denise Bentley

> On Apr 27, 2020, at 10:53 AM, Hackett, Keith <Keith.Hackett@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

>

> Amy,

> Please coordinate the recycling cart program with Denise Bentley in District 5, per our conversation this
morning.

>

> Thanks

> Keith

> memm Original Message-----

> From: Bentley, Denise G. <Denise.Bentley@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
> Sent: Monday, April 27, 2020 9:49 AM

> To: Hackett, Keith <Keith.Hackett@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

> Subject: Recycling Bin

>

> Keith-

> Good morning! Please provide the necessary information for the upright bins so that D5 can provide funding
to SWMS, Thank you.

>

> Denise Bentley

> <Waste Container Types.pdf>




Louisville Metro Recycling Cart Discount Order Form

Some Metro Council Districts offer a discount on the purchase of a residential recycling cart.
Resident must live within one of the participating districts.

District number:

Name: Date:
Delivery Address: Zip Code:
Email: Daytime Phone Number:
PRICE
CHECK ONE ITEM DESCRIPTION {LISTED PRICE ALREADY
INCLUDES SALES TAX}
95 Gallon Recycling Cart $28.00
65 Gallon Recycling Cart $27.70

-

*Discount is only given for one cart*

AMOUNT ENCLOSED: $

Please make check or money order (no cash) payable to Louisville Metro and mail completed form to:

Louisville Metro Solid Waste Management
Attn: Collection Division

600 Meriwether Avenue

Louisville, KY 40217-1146

Delivery of your cart will be within four weeks after receipt of this form and payment. If you have any
questions, please call Louisville Metro Solid Waste at 574-3571.



Dearing, Connie M.

From: Hackett, Keith

Sent: Friday, June 5, 2020 10:47 AM

To: Bentley, Denise G.; Dearing, Connie M.
Cc: Bradley, Maxwell B,; Axsom, Amy
Subject: RE: Recycle carts

Denise,

SWMS will accept the $500 for cost sharing of recycling carts.

Keith S. Hackett

Assistant Director

Department of Public Works

Division of Solid Waste Management Services
{o) 502.574.2775

(c) 502.773.4173

Download the Recycle Coach app

for waste disposal alerts and info

From: Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, June 4, 2020 3:19 PM

To: Hackett, Keith <Keith.Hackett@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Bentley, Denise G. <Denise.Bentley@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Bradley, Maxwell B. <Maxwell.Bradley@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Recycle carts

Importance: High

Keith,
See below email. Please let Ms. Bentley know if you Metro Solid Waste will accept the money for District 5 Cart
Discounts.

Thanks,

Amy

From: Bentley, Denise G. <Denise.Bentley@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, June 4, 2020 2:55 PM

To: Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Recycle carts

Amy can you send an email stating you will accept $500 for cost sharing of carts in District 5. Thanks

1
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Denise Bentley





