Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
e Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Dr. Barbara Shanklin |

| Amount: $3,500 Date: 06/03/2020 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding of $3,500 to Metro Public Works Transportation Division for 60+ feet of new sidewalk on
Sunday Drive in the Newburg area. The project will connect two lengths of existing sidewalk that
currently do not connect. The project will include a new concrete sidewalk (matching width to the
existing pieces), MOT and provisions for seed & protection.

City Agency: Metro Public Works (Transportation Division)

Contact Person: steve Kurowsky

Agency Phone: (502 574-8743

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

2 [7] %M—g_, $3,500 06/03/2020
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
$3,500 to Metro Public Works Transportation Division for 60+ feet of new sidewalk on Sunday Drive

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount

District 1 S
District 2 Dr. Barbara Shanklin $3,500

District 3 $

District 4

District 5

District 6

District 7

District 8

District 9

District 10

District 11

District 12

District 13

District 14

District 15

District 16

District 17

District 18

District 19

District 20

District 21
District 22
District 23

District 24
District 25
District 26
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works (Transportation Division)

Program/Project Name: Funding of $3,500 for 60+ feet of new sidewalk on Sunday Drive
Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) —
Appropriating Funding? Yes M
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with —
account numbers in the request form description? NA M
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of _
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA M
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they -
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA M
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes [
funding source is probably NDF. —
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful _
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes v
- Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than __
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA |~
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? _
If so, 1s the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA |~
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid —
estimate and description of cost? Yes M
Submitted by: Caleb Howard Date: 06/03/2020

Revised May 2016



Howard, Ealeb A.

e R PR T,
From: Kurowsky, Steve M.
Sent: Wednesday, May 20, 2020 6:48 PM
To: Shanklin, Barbara; Howard, Caleb A.
Subject: Cost Estimate for Sidewalk Connector on Sunday Drive
Follow Up Flag: Flag for follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

CW Shanklin / Caleb,

Please find below the estimate for a new sidewalk connector piece along Sunday Drive. The cost to complete this 60+
feet of new sidewalk would be $3,500. This would include a new concrete sidewalk (matching width), MOT and
provisions for seed & protection.

Thanks,

Steve Kurowsky, PE
Louisville Metro Government
Transportation Division
Metro Development Center
444 South 5™ Street, Suite 400
Louisville, Ky. 40202

Tel (0): (502) 574-8743

Tel (¢): (502) 565-7601

Steve Kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov




Dearing, Connie M.
L

From: Kurowsky, Steve M.

Sent: Wednesday, June 3, 2020 11:52 AM

To: Howard, Caleb A.

Cc: Shanklin, Barbara; Dearing, Connie M.

Subject: RE: Cost Estimate for Sidewalk Connector on Sunday Drive

Public Works will accept the funding for this sidewalk project on Sunday Drive. | will complete the work under my
annual new sidewalk contract.

From: Howard, Caleb A. <Caleb.Howard@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, June 3, 2020 11:49 AM

To: Kurowsky, Steve M. <steve.kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Shanklin, Barbara <Barbara.Shanklin@!louisvilleky.gov>; Dearing, Connie M. <Connie.Dearing@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Cost Estimate for Sidewalk Connector on Sunday Drive

Mr. Kurowsky,
Please respond to this email {including Ms. Connie Dearing who is CC’d on this email) that you and Metro Public Works
will be willing to accept the funding of $3,500 for sidewalk construction and connection work on Sunday Drive in the

Newburg area. | intend to submit the CIF today (or as early as possible) as soon as we have the go ahead from you.

Thank you for all of your help!

Caleb Howard

Legislative Assistant to

Councilwoman Dr. Barbara Shanklin
District 2

Louisville Metro Council

Phone: (502) 574-2787

Email: Caleb.Howard@louisvilleky.gov

From: Kurowsky, Steve M. <steve kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, May 20, 2020 6:48 PM

To: Shanklin, Barbara <Barbara.Shanklin@louisvilleky.gov>; Howard, Caleb A. <Caleb.Howard @louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Cost Estimate for Sidewalk Connector on Sunday Drive

CW Shanklin / Caleb,

Please find below the estimate for a new sidewalk connector piece along Sunday Drive. The cost to complete this 60+
feet of new sidewalk would be $3,500. This would include a new concrete sidewalk (matching width), MOT and
provisions for seed & protection.



Thanks,

Steve Kurowsky, PE
Louisville Metro Government
Transportation Division
Metro Development Center
444 South 5™ Street, Suite 400
Louisville, Ky. 40202

Tel (0): (502) 574-8743

Tel (c¢): (502) 565-7601

Steve Kurowskvy@louisvilleky.goy




Dearing, Connie M.

From: Shanklin, Barbara
Sent: Wednesday, June 3, 2020 12:32 PM
To: Dearing, Connie M.

Ms. Dearing it is ok for Caleb Howard to sign the CIF For the sidewalk funds in my behalf.
Thank you.
Sent from my iPhone



