Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Jessica Green Metro District 1

| Amount: $20,000.00 Date: 07/29/2020

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Funds requested are to be used for a Alley paving project in Council District 1 in the 4200 Biock of
Hale Ave ( South side Alley ) between 42nd Street & 43rd Street ,between Hale Ave & Virginia
Ave . The total project cost is $30,000.00 with $20,000.00 coming from D01 CIF account #
(8101-105-8105-038201-899998) and $10,000 coming from Alley Match Fund account as foliows :
$596.37 (#8115-410-8105-148442-899999)
$2,093.16 (#8101-410-8210-148937-899999)
$7,310.47 (#8133-410-8210-148450-899999)

City Agency: Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
Contact Person: Matthew R. Haines , PE

Agency Phone: 502 574 3883

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation fropi/the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

1 $20,000.00 07/29/2020
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CI?F (98 /&&O Pa)(? fé To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Funds requested are to be used for a Alley paving project in Council District 1 in the 4200 Block of Hale
Ave (South side alley) between 42" Street & 43" Street, between Hale Ave & Virginia Ave . The Total
cost is $30,000.00 with $20,000.00 coming from DO1 CIF account # 8101-105-8105-038201-899998) and
$10,000.00 coming from Alley Match Funds accounts as follows:

$596.37 (# 8115-410-8105-148442-899999)
$2,093.16 (#8101-410-8210-148937-899999)
$7,310.47 (#8133-410-8210-148450-899999)

Total $10,000.00

SR# 7920645 4200 Block of Hale Ave alley project



Interagency Name: Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: 4200 Block of Hale Ave Alley Paving project

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) -
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
. account numbers in the request form description? Yes
RequeSt Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? Yes
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? ~ Yes

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
- funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

 Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than :
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. - NA

~ Ordinance Required: [s the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? - No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

z%

Submitted by: é -/

/Date: 07/29/2020

Revised May 2016
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DETAILS

Description
The in question is on Hale Ave between 42nd St & 43rd St in the 4200 Block of Hale Ave ( behind 4202 -4234 Hale Ave )

Street Issue

Street Repair

Street Type
Alley

0 COMMENTS
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http://iframe.publicstuff.com/ 7/22/2020



Weathers, Charles

s i
From: Haines, Matthew R
Sent: Wednesday, July 29, 2020 11:23 AM
To: Weathers, Charles
Subject: RE: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

We will pave the small section where she is currently parking | believe with asphalt.

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5% Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) | 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Weathers, Charles

Sent: Wednesday, July 29, 2020 11:19 AM

To: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: RE: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

Morning , I am circling back around to see if you had a chance to look at this so | can process the CIF/ Alley Match Fund .
C

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@Ilouisvilieky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, July 16, 2020 11:23 AM

To: Weathers, Charles <Charles.Weathers@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

Charles,

fam not sure what you mean by ramp, but if you mean the section where someone is currently parking, we can
address.



Matthew R. Haines, PE .

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5% Street, 4™ Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1502 528 5973 (C} 1502 574 4129 (F)

From: Weathers, Charles

Sent: Wednesday, July 15, 2020 11:46 AM

To: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: RE: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

Matthew , | have a quick question about this alley estimate , | received a call from the lady who lives at 4208 Hale Ave
asking if the ramp behind her home is included in the estimate for the alley repair ? Ms. Jackson states that several years
ago she was asked by Metro Gov to allow them to pave a section behind her home due to the turning radius so garbage
trucks could make the turn in the alley . C Weathers



From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, May 14, 2020 2:22 PM

To: Weathers, Charles <Charles.Weathers@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

Charles,

Here was the estimate | sent on the 4200 block of Hale. | am going to review the alley on 437 St on Tuesday and will get
back to you. The section south of Grand Ave appears to be gravel, so that will likely be construction of a new alley. This
does not appear to

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5 Street, 4™ Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 15025285973 {C) 1502574 4125 {F)

From: Haines, Matthew R

Sent: Wednesday, October 2, 2019 11:53 AM

To: Weathers, Charles

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

Charles,

twent out and locked at the alley discussed below. It does appear that our roads crew got out and paiched several
aress. 1 do believe this would be a good candidate for repaving. | would suggest a 2 inch mill and overlay with fiber
reinforcement. There are 8 ramps associated with the various alley connections. | estimate that the total to repave and
update those ramps would be $30,000.00.

Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5% Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D} 15025285973 {C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Weathers, Charles

Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 10:04 AM

To: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: RE: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

Thanks

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 10:04 AM

To: Weathers, Charles <Charles. Weathers@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave




f gave you a guote for the section running between Cecil and 42° st but not for the portion running between 42" and
43" St. | will get this on my list to have completed this week.

Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5% Street, 4™ Floor

Louisville KY 40202

5025743883 (D) 15025285973 {C) 15025744129 (F)

From: Weathers, Charles

Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 9:48 AM

To: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

Mr Haines, | turned in a request to get a alley paved or patched about 6 months ago , the alley in question is the alley
that runs behind 4200 Block of Hale Ave & 4200 Block of Virginia Ave between 42" St & 43 St . Its possible that it got
lost in the transition to the new system , so if possible can you take a look at this location . | received a call from another
resident this morning complaining about the pothole are getting really bad . Thanks C Weathers



Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5% Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1502 528 5373 (C} 1 502 574 4129 {F)

From: Weathers, Charles

Sent: Wednesday, July 15, 2020 11:46 AM

To: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: RE: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

Matthew , | have a quick question about this alley estimate , | received a call from the lady who lives at 4208 Hale Ave
asking if the ramp behind her home is included in the estimate for the alley repair ? Ms. Jackson states that several years
ago she was asked by Metro Gov to allow them to pave a section behind her home due to the turning radius so garbage
trucks could make the turn in the alley . C Weathers

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, May 14, 2020 2:22 PM

To: Weathers, Charles <Charles.Weathers@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

Charles,

Here was the estimate | sent on the 4200 block of Hale. | am going to review the alley on 43" St on Tuesday and will get
back to you. The section south of Grand Ave appears 1o be gravel, so that will likely be construction of a new alley. This
does not appear {o

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5% Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D} 15025285973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F}

From: Haines, Matthew R

Sent: Wednesday, October 2, 2019 11:53 AM

To: Weathers, Charles

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

Charles,

twent out and looked at the alley discussed below. It does appear that our roads crew got out and patched several
areas. |do believe this would be a good candidate for repaving. | would suggest a 2 inch mill and overlay with fiber
reinforcement. There are 8 ramps associated with the various alley connections. | estimate that the total to repave and
update those ramps would be $30,000.00.

Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisvilie Metro Public Works & Assets
444 South 5™ Street, 4" Floor



Louisville KY 40202
502 574 3883 (D) | 502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Weathers, Charles

Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 10:04 AM

To: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: RE: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

Thanks

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines®@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 10:04 AM

To: Weathers, Charles <Charles.Weathers@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

I gave you a quote for the section running between Cecil and 42" st but not for the portion running between 42™ and
4379 St. L will get this on my list to have completed this week.

Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisvilie Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5™ Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1502 528 5973 {C} | 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Weathers, Charles

Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 9:48 AM

To: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: Alley paving @ the 4200 Block of Hale Ave

Mr Haines, | turned in a request to get a alley paved or patched about 6 months ago , the alley in question is the alley
that runs behind 4200 Block of Hale Ave & 4200 Block of Virginia Ave between 42" St & 43 St . Its possible that it got
lost in the transition to the new system, so if possible can you take a look at this location . | received a call from another
resident this morning complaining about the pothole are getting really bad . Thanks C Weathers



Dearing, Connie M.

From: Haines, Matthew R

Sent: Wednesday, August 5, 2020 12:00 PM

To: Dearing, Connie M.

Subject: RE: CIFO81220PW0O1A & CIG081220PWO01B

Connie,

Public works will accept funding for both the alley along the 1660-bloek-6f43'C5t-a+-$6;000:06; and then the alley of the

4200 block of Hale Ave for $30,000.00.
Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5% Street, 4'" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1502 574 4129 (F)

From: Dearing, Connie M.

Sent: Wednesday, August 5, 2020 11:51 AM
To: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: CIF081220PW01A & CIG081220PW01B
Importance: High

Hello Matt,
I am reaching out to ask you to send confirmation emails to accept funds for two projects in District 1.

1. Alley paving — 1000 block of 43™ Street
2. Alley paving — 4200 block of Hale Avenue

If possible could you send these two emails by the end of business today?

Regards,

Louisville Metro Council | Assistant Clerk
City Hall | 601 West Jefferson Street | Suite 103
Louisville, KY 40202 | 502-574-3085




