Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
| Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF) |
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor:’]\)a\/\c)‘ Jou\e S

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s): :
project/prog y g ()WY\QL('U\HH e

used TWarg e UGNt PRfect |peatey at
e (¥R < OYW\QV\Q \Ahd@(mgg.

Toonerville Trolley Neighborhood Association is providing $2,250 to this project.
Total project cost will be $4,500.

City Agency: ™ANTd \TAy(S [Pl C Wl
Contact Person: Dawvid t‘\'ﬂ\y’_ §
Agency Phone: 2303 - &L — 22|

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the reeetying department concerning the project/expenditure.

$2,250.00
W [ !”F_ 7|28 [2020
District # Datte
—

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016

Page 1



CDEARING
Rectangle

CDEARING
Typewritten Text

CDEARING
Typewritten Text

CDEARING
Typewritten Text
Toonerville Trolley Neighborhood Association is providing $2,250 to this project.
Total project cost will be $4,500.

CDEARING
Highlight

CDEARING
Typewritten Text
$2,250.00

CDEARING
Typewritten Text

CDEARING
Line

CDEARING
Typewritten Text

CDEARING
Typewritten Text

CDEARING
Typewritten Text

CDEARING
Typewritten Text

CDEARING
Typewritten Text

CDEARING
Typewritten Text

CDEARING
Typewritten Text
$2,250.00


Interagency Name: ’Wb\/\c WOES Elvectncal Mainteroonce

- Program/Project Name: {0 G DYW\Q% A %»V\ﬂyw) Pn]‘ﬁffi’

- Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
- Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
~ the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
 disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the

funding source is probably NDF.

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
- estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA
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Submitted by: %?\MQMM \%LJ%QU
L} V O v

Date: I ,9912‘0

Revised May 2016



Taylor, Shalanna

e oanaii ]
From: Brown, Jeffrey E
Sent: Thursday, June 11, 2020 1:56 PM
To: Taylor, Shalanna
Subject: RE: Ormsby Underpass Between Preston & Floyd

We will accept the funds for this project if you want to move forward with the appropriation.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, June 11, 2020 1:54 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW: Ormsby Underpass Between Preston & Floyd

Hey Jeff,

I sent the email below to Mr. Hayes about getting this project started and hadn’t heard back.

In case he is out of the office | wanted to send to you as well.

Thank you,

Shalanna Taylor

Legislative Assistant

President David James District 6 Office

601 W. Jefferson Street Louisville, Ky 40202

| Office: 502-574-1106 |

| Direct: 502-574~3910 |

Click here to subscribe to the District 6 Newsletter

From: Taylor, Shalanna

Sent: Tuesday, June 9, 2020 4:20 PM

To: Hayes, David L <David.Hayes@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: James, David A <David.James@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Ormsby Underpass Between Preston & Fioyd

David,

Thank you for the cost estimate of $4,500 for this project. We would like to begin on this please. | will go ahead and get
the funding paperwork processed on this end. Please let me know what else you will need form our office.

Thank you,



Shalanna Taylor

Legislative Assistant

President David James District 6 Office

601 W. Jefferson Street Louisville, Ky 40202

| Office: 502-574-1106 |

| Direct: 502-574-39 10|

Click here to subscribe to the District 6 Newsletter

From: Taylor, Shalanna

Sent: Tuesday, June 9, 2020 4:05 PM

To: James, David A <David.James@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Ormsby Underpass Between Preston & Floyd

Shalanna Taylor

Legislative Assistant

President David James District 6 Office

601 W. Jefferson Street Louisville, Ky 40202

| Office: 502-574~1106 |

| Direct: 502-574-8910 |

Click here to subscribe to the District 6 Newsletter

From: Hayes, David L <David.Hayes@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, February 24, 2020 3:24 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Keith, Stacy <Stacy.Keith@louisvilleky.gov>; Wright, Tom <tom.wright@ky.gov>

Subject: RE: Ormsby Underpass Between Preston & Floyd

OK, So | rode by there and have attached a few pictures. As you can see when the underpass was painted they did not
tape off any of the lenses. To replace the lenses, a new LED, and a mogul base to convert to LED is more than replacing

the whole fixture.

The fixtures and miscellaneous hardware are $250.00 dollars apiece.

There are actually18 fixtures under the underpass.

Total cost would be $4,500.00 for all of the materials.



We would have 3™ shift change these out at night. It looks like all of the conduit system and service is in good shape.

I had a work order created to go down and look at his tonight to see what is working and make sure we have power to
them.

Thanks,

David Hayes

EM Supervisor

Electrical Maintenance Department
Louisville Metro Government

636 East Gray Street

Louisville, KY 40202

Office (502) 574-3261
Fax (502) 574-4132
Cell (502) 376-9584

From: Brown, Jeffrey £

Sent: Monday, February 24, 2020 1:17 PM

To: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hayes, David L <David.Hayes@louisvilleky.gov>; Keith, Stacy <Stacy.Keith@louisvilleky.gov>; Wright, Tom
<tom.wright@ky.gov>

Subject: RE: Ormsby Underpass Between Preston & Floyd

Adding a few others. | would expect those are Metro lights under the I-65 overpass but I'll ask Stacy and David to
confirm.

For the fencing, I've added Tom Wright with KYTC to check because it might need to stay in place for access control to
the interstate.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, February 24, 2020 12:39 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrev.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Fwd: Ormsby Underpass Between Preston & Floyd

Hello Jeff,

Are the lights under this underpass at Ormsby Between Preston and Floyd our lights or KYTC?
3



Toonerville Trolley Neighborhood Association

July 12, 2020

Louisville Jefferson County Government
Councilman David James

To Whom It May Concern:

The 165 underpass at Ormsby Avenue is in desperate need of
some TLC. The Toonerville Trolley Neighborhood Association
voted to make this area a top priority in our efforts to make Old
Louisville a wonderful place to live, work and play.

With that in mind, a donation of $2250.00 has been approved in
order to help sufficiently light the aforementioned underpass.

Working in Partnership with Louisville Metro, especially our
Councilman David James, it is understood how much more can
be accomplished toward our goal of making Old Louisville “THE”
place to live and be happy.

Enclosed is the donation check to help light the Ormsby 165
underpass.

Respectfully,

oan Stewart for the TTNA Board of Directors
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LOUISVILLE / JEFFERSON COUNTY METRO GOVERNMENT

TO: CASH MANAGEMENT

FROM: PWA-Max Bradley

DEPARTMENT #: 410

DATE: 7/30/2020
"District 6
TOTAL: $ 2,250.00
CASH Cash Management use only
CHECK $ 2,250.00 Transaction #
TOTAL $ 2,250.00 Cashier's Initials
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