Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
| Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF) |

e—Capital-Hnfrastrueture Fund (P
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Purvis l
| Amount: $562.20 Date: 08/05/20 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s): NEIGHBORHOOD DEVELOPMENT FUND
APPROPRIATING $562.20 FROM DISTRICT 5 CARITALINFRASTRUCTURE-FUNDS TO
PUBLIC WORKS FOR THE INSTALLATION OF A STREET LIGHT ON MAIN STREET
BETWEEN 37TH AND 38TH

City Agency: Public Works

Contact Person: jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502.574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

S B JOQ/% Fad % %1% $562.20 %

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public Works

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose. '

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Name: Public Works

- NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Program/Project Name:

Street light install Main Street bewtween 37th and 38th

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

~ Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA
o | 3
NA +] |
- 3
NA ]
Yesna  [+]
yes Na  [+]
NA no  [+]
wavo [
Yes [+
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Bentley, Denise G.

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: , Wednesday, August 5, 2020 12:35 PM
To: Bentley, Denise G.

Cc: Nall, Daniel (Auburndale)

Subject: RE: 37th and Duncan

Public Works will accept the funds for the minimum 5-year lease with LGE for this street light

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Bentley, Denise G. <Denise.Bentley@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, August 5, 2020 12:20 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Nall, Daniel {Auburndale) <Daniel.Nall@lge-ku.com>
Subject: 37th and Duncan

Jeff-
The total for the new light install is $562.20, $9.37 x 60 months. Can you please send me an email confirming so that |

can process the paperwork. Thanks!

Denise Bentley
Legislative Assistant
Metro Council District 5
601 W Jefferson
Louisville, KY 40202
502-574-1105




Bentley, Denise G.

From: - Nall, Daniel (Auburndale) <Daniel.Nall@lge-ku.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 29, 2020 4:24 PM

To: Bentley, Denise G.

Cc: ' Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: W MAIN ST BETWEEN 37TH & 38TH LIGHTING

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Denise,

The cost to install 1 — Type A LED Cobra fixture (150w equivalent) on a 6’ mast on “Pole A” will be $9.37 per
month. Clearances will NOT allow us to hang a light on the pole just west of 37" St. (Pole B)

Let me know if you want to proceed.
Thanks, Danny

DANIEL NALL

LIGHTING REPRESENTATIVE
QUTDOOR LIGHTING DEPT
LOUISVILLE GAS & ELECTRIC
502.364.8509

The information contained in this transmission is intended only for the person or entity
to which it is directly addressed or copied. It may contain material of confidential and/or private nature. Any review,
retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon, this information by persons or
entities other than the intended recipient is not allowed. If you received this message and the information contained
therein by error, please contact the sender and delete the material from your/any storage medium.
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