Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
v/ Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
[ Primary Sponsor: (punUlwomon NiGsle G'DC)(‘%PA |

[Amount$3,9490.00 Date: ©[20[2010 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Fundunq requesr foc <jmvr\d modntenance on § 37 gt
and Southexn PRwWY roumps for i T-UeH SourheQst
(kg Deyriphions putlined \n proposod .

City Agency: PulL\CWorKs
Contact Personzj’w BownN
Agency Phone: c(y) _ G4 -00Q 05

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

’ M M $3,990.00 @290

D1strlct # Codncﬂ Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016

Page 1



NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: PubliC WOk
 Program/Project Name: P\OJ(Y\P Mawntenance

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? - V@S
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with .

account numbers in the request form description? - NF\

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? - NP\

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? w— N P\

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the . N F\
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. | = N ﬂ

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. N O

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? N O

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid |
estimate and description of cost? o Y@S

Rache Roaxx, Legs\adive Ride pate: D[22(2020
For DIStrick 2\

Submitted by:

Revised May 2016



INTEGRATED Services Inc.

A Full Service Facility Maintenance Company

Louisville Metro

3rd Street Southeast Interchange Ramp Proposal

Attention: Nichole George

Date 8/27/2020

Service

Clean up existing landscape
beds. Spray weed killer in beds,
trim bushes and limb up trees
and clean up down tree limb and
mulch tree rings and beds.

Clean up and spray weed killer
around tree and landscaping for
Southern Parkway East

Please contact Kevin Downs with
any questions at 502-413-1729

____________

Unit Cost

$3,090.00




Roarx, Rachel G.

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Thursday, August 27, 2020 12:46 PM
To: Roarx, Rachel G.

Cc: George, Nicole A.

Subject: A RE: Louisville Metro Proposal.docx

We will accept the funds for the maintenance

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, August 27, 2020 12:35 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Louisville Metro Proposal.docx

Good Afternoon,

Attached is a quote from Integrated Services for ramp/lawn maintenance for the 3" Street southeast |-264 interchange
ramp and the Southern Pkwy southeast ramp in District 21. The total is $3,990.00. Will you accept the

money/appropriation?

Rachel Roarx | Legislative Aide

Office of District 21 Councilwoman Nicole George

City Hall | 601 W. Jefferson St. | 3 Floor
Office: (502) 574-1121

Click here to sign up for the District 21 eNewsletter!

From: Kevin Downs <kevin.downsisi@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, August 27, 2020 12:09 PM

To: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Louisville Metro Proposal.docx

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro.?Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Revised with area add on.

Thanks



