Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
[ Primary Sponsor: Councilman Scott Reed \

| Amount: $1,600.00 Date: 8-27-20 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Two (2) LED enhanced reverse turn warming signs for Lime Kiln Lane in the amount of $800.00
each for a total of $1,600.00

City Agency: Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Stuart Sparks

Agency Phone: 502-574-3650

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

16 M__j’/ $1,600.00 Aug 27, 2020

District # @ouncil Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Lime Kiln Ln Signage
Yes/No/NA
Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: D. Carrall Date: Aug 27, 2029

Revised May 2016



TAPCO

Safe travels.

Traffic and Parking Control Co., Inc.

5100 West Brown Deer Road
Brown Deer, Wisconsin 53223

Phone (800) 236-0112 « TAPCOnet.com * Fax (800) 444-0331

SALES QUOTE

Customer Copy

Eymw T Q20012949

Date _ | 8/20/2020
Page 1

Sell To Louisville Metro Public Works ShipTo | Louisville Metro Public Works
gg%m Stuart Sparks Cust. Stuart Sparks
601 W Jefferson St, Rm 10 601 W Jefferson St, Rm 10
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202 LOUISVILLE, KY 40202
USA USA
Customer PO # Expires Slsp Terms Freight - ShipVia
9/20/2020 Nick Poblocki Net 30 DAYS PREPAY/ADD BEST RATE
Item Description Quantity um Price Extension
300037 BlinkerSign, 36"x36"x.080, DMD, DG3, FY, Solar, 8 2 EA 800.00 $1,600.00
Amber LEDs, DPM
Lead Time 3-5 Weeks
Solar powered equipment requires no shading
or obstructions
Furnish only quote. Installation is not included.
Shipment within Merchandise| ~ Freight SaTaN R T otal
Acceptance By -
Date $1,600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,600.00
By

All prices are listed in US Dollars (USD)
For terms and conditions, please visit: https://www.tapconet.com/terms-conditions




Dearing, Connie M.

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Tuesday, September 1, 2020 7:03 AM

To: Carroll, Debbie

Cc: Johnson, Pat W; Dearing, Connie M.
Subject: Re: Lime Kiln Lane Signage - EMAIL NEEDED
Ms. Dearing,

The two advance reverse turn warning signs will be installed at the below circled locations.

Thanks,

B
2

Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE

Louisville Metro Public Works

Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings
601 W Jefferson St, Room 8

(502) 574-3650




From: Carroll, Debbie <Debbie.Carroll@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, August 28, 2020 12:25 PM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Johnson, Pat W <Pat.Johnson@louisvilleky.gov>; Dearing, Connie M. <Connie.Dearing@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Lime Kiln Lane Signage - EMAIL NEEDED

Stuart, please see below message from the Council Clerk’s office. The requested email from you will be part of our CIF
request paperwork that will go before the Appropriations committee. Much thanks!

Debbie Carroll
Dist 16 LA

From: Dearing, Connie M. <Connie.Dearing@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, August 28, 2020 12:15 PM

To: Carroll, Debbie <Debbie.Carroll@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Lime Kiln Lane Signage

Importance: High

Debbie,

Have Public Works (Stuart Sparks) create an email to be specific where on Lime Kiln Lane the sign will be installed, and
that they will accept the funding. This email can be sent to me an | will attach to the documents | already have received.

Regards,

Coranial Biin Comi i oin Corni i

Louisville Metro Council | Assistant Clerk
City Hall | 601 West Jefferson Street | Suite 103
Louisville, KY 40202 | 502-574-3085




Dearing, Connie M.

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Tuesday, September 1, 2020 8:13 AM

To: Dearing, Connie M.

Subject: RE: Lime Kiln Lane Signage - EMAIL NEEDED

Yes, Public Works will accept the funding. Thanks.

From: Dearing, Connie M. <Connie.Dearing@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, September 1, 2020 8:04 AM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Lime Kiln Lane Signage - EMAIL NEEDED

Will you also accept the funding?

Regards,

Comoni M Dty Corta T Llosing Comi

Louisville Metro Council | Assistant Clerk
City Hall | 601 West Jefferson Street | Suite 103
Louisville, KY 40202 | 502-574-3085

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, September 1, 2020 7:03 AM

To: Carroll, Debbie <Debbie.Carroll@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Johnson, Pat W <Pat.Johnson@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Dearing, Connie M. <Connie.Dearing@I|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Lime Kiln Lane Signage - EMAIL NEEDED

Ms. Dearing,
The two advance reverse turn warning signs will be installed at the below circled locations.

Thanks,



Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE

Louisville Metro Public Works

Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings
601 W Jefferson St, Room 8

(502) 574-3650

From: Carroll, Debbie <Debbie.Carroll@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, August 28, 2020 12:25 PM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Johnson, Pat W <Pat.Johnson@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Dearing, Connie M. <Connie.Dearing@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Lime Kiln Lane Signage - EMAIL NEEDED

Stuart, please see below message from the Council Clerk’s office. The requested email from you will be part of our CIF
request paperwork that will go before the Appropriations committee. Much thanks!

Debbie Carroll
Dist 16 LA



From: Dearing, Connie M. <Connie.Dearing@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, August 28, 2020 12:15 PM

To: Carroll, Debbie <Debbie.Carroll@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Lime Kiln Lane Signage

Importance: High

Debbie,

Have Public Works (Stuart Sparks) create an email to be specific where on Lime Kiln Lane the sign will be installed, and
that they will accept the funding. This email can be sent to me an | will attach to the documents | already have received.

Regards,

o ra . TR
OBl Dionsing Comtat ™ flotsing v oy
o L L

Louisville Metro Council | Assistant Clerk
City Hall | 601 West Jefferson Street | Suite 103
Louisville, KY 40202 | 502-574-3085
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