
Revised May 2016 

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request 
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF) 
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF) 
Municipal Aid Program (MAP) 
Paving Fund (PAV) 

Primary Sponsor:   

Amount:   Date: 

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, 
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):   

City Agency:    

Contact Person: 

Agency Phone: 

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have 
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached 
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure. 

_____  _
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date  

Approved by:   _________________________________________________________________   
             Appropriations Committee Chairman               Date 

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only: 

Request Amount:  ________________________     Amended Amount: _____________________  

Reference #:  ____________________________     To OMB:_____________________________ 

Budget Revision #:_______________________________________________________________      

Account #:_____________________________________________________________________ 

To Project Manager:  ______________________     Completion Date:______________________ 

Actual Cost:  _____________________________    Funds Returned:  ______________________ 
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$ 839.16

Mesude Duyar

(502) 574-7275 

Bill Hollander

September 3, 2020

Additional funds to Metro Parks for the design and construction of tree wells barriers by the speed 
humps on Edith Road at Champions Park. The price of lumber increased by $839.16 since the 
original funds were appropriated. All funding provided by D9.

Metro Parks

$839.16

Print Form

■

9
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Revised May 2016 

NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name:

Program/Project Name:
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) 
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with 
account numbers in the request form description?  

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of 
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they 
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville 
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment?  If not, the   
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source:  If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful 
life of more than one year?  If not, the funding source is probably NDF.  

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than 
$5,000?  If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?  
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation:  Does the attachment include a valid  
estimate and description of cost?

Submitted by: Date:

Metro Parks

Additional funds for the tree well barriers along Edith Road

Yes

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

No 

NA

Yes

NA
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Ethridge, Kyle

From: Duyar, Mesude
Sent: Thursday, September 3, 2020 2:44 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle
Subject: RE: Revised Quote. 

Yes.  
 

From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge@louisvilleky.gov>  
Sent: Thursday, September 3, 2020 2:43 PM 
To: Duyar, Mesude <Mesude.Duyar@louisvilleky.gov> 
Subject: Re: Revised Quote.  
 
Yes, we approve. Will parks accept funds? 

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant 
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander 
601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202 
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109 
 

Click here to sign up for the District 9 weekly eNews! 
 

On Sep 3, 2020, at 2:42 PM, Duyar, Mesude <Mesude.Duyar@louisvilleky.gov> wrote: 

  
Yes.  
  

From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge@louisvilleky.gov>  
Sent: Thursday, September 3, 2020 2:35 PM 
To: Duyar, Mesude <Mesude.Duyar@louisvilleky.gov> 
Subject: Re: Revised Quote.  
  
For Edith tree barriers? 

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant 
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander 
601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202 
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109 
 
 

Click here to sign up for the District 9 weekly eNews! 
 
 

On Sep 3, 2020, at 2:31 PM, Duyar, Mesude <Mesude.Duyar@louisvilleky.gov> wrote: 
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Kyle, please see the email from the project coordinator, Steve Ashley. Are you ok with 
the increased cost? We are ready to make a PO. Thanks.  
  

From: Ashley, Steven W. <Steven.Ashley@louisvilleky.gov>  
Sent: Thursday, September 3, 2020 2:11 PM 
To: Duyar, Mesude <Mesude.Duyar@louisvilleky.gov> 
Cc: Blankenship, Michael W <Michael.Blankenship@louisvilleky.gov> 
Subject: Revised Quote.  
  
The price of lumber has gone up considerably in the last three months. The revised 
quote is attached. The new cost is $2562.16. The difference is $839.16 
 
Do you still want me to make a PO for the lumber or should we consider other options?  
  
Steven Ashley 
Louisville Parks and Recreation Arborist 
Phone: (502) 574-6508 
Cell: (502) 817-9366 
Email: steven.ashley@louisvilleky.gov 
  
<image002.jpg> 
  
  
  
<2020 Lowes Tree Well Quote v2.0.pdf> 
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