CIF 101420 PWO0O4

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: CW Barbara Sexton Smith |

[ Amount: $376.00 Date: 9/18/20 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Honoray Street sign for Dr. H. Donald Cockerham to be located on the Southwest corner of 22nd
and Muhammad Ali Bivd. Pz s*(‘ov' Cm@m-jru.é ox Lien ngﬂs‘f ey

in cclebraten £ his 902 ’—H\e@a:y

City Agency: Ppublic Works
Contact Person: patricia Jennings

Agency Phone: 574.3251

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

: M ﬁﬂ /@M« EA;WZM 44 $37600 9/18/20

District # Council Me ber Sigpatdre Amount Date
.
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF 101420 PWO04 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works Signs and Marketing

Program/Project Name: Honorary Street Sign Dr. H. Donald Cockerham
Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) e
Appropriating Funding? Yes hd
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with -
account numbers in the request form description? NA Bd
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of _
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA I
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they -
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? No fad
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes =
funding source is probably NDF. —
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful _
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes ¥
Ordinance Required: [s the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA 3
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No 3
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid :
estimate and description of cost? yf/j 3

Submitted by: Wanda Mitchell-Smith

Date: 9/18.20

Revised May 2016



Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D.

From: Hines, William A

Sent: Friday, September 18, 2020 3:54 PM

To: Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D.

Cc: Roades, Bonnie J; Hall, Barbara C; Wall, Travis R; Jennings, Patricia A
Subject: RE: Honorary Street Sign

Correct $376

William A. Hines III

Labor Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
Signs & Markings Division

3507 Newburg Rd

Louisville, KY 40218

Phone: (502) 794-6862

Fax: (502) 458-4868

From: Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D. <Wanda.Mitchell-Smith@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, September 18, 2020 3:53 PM

To: Hines, William A <William.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Roades, Bonnie J <Bonnie.Roades@louisvilleky.gov>; Hall, Barbara C <Barbara.Hall@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Wall, Travis R
<Travis.Wall@louisvilleky.gov>; Jennings, Patricia A <Patricia.Jennings@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Honorary Street Sign

Importance: High

Please tell me how much the total cost will be. If memory serves me correctly, they are $188 each for a total of $376.
For two signs. Please advise. THANK YOU SO MUCH!!

Wenda MWitcthell - Smith,
Legislative Assistant
Louisville Metro District 4



S atrécie - 7, //r e
Labor Supervisor | |
Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
Signs & Markings Division
3507 Newburg Rd
Louisville, KY 40218
Office: (602) 574-3251
Cell: (502) 773-3221
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From: Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D. <Wanda.Mitchell-Smith@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, September 18, 2020 3:25 PM

To: Jennings, Patricia A <Patricia.Jennings@I|ouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Sexton-Smith, Barbara <Barbara.SextonSmith@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Honorary Street Sign

Importance: High

Hi Patricia,

CW Sexton Smith is requesting and estimate for 2 honorary street signs for Dr. H. Donald Cockerham, Sr. who will be
turning 90 years old on October 5. He is Pastor Emeritus of Zion Baptist Church on the corner of 22" & Muhammad
Ali. I’'m sorry but I will need a rush on this, please.

Weanda Mctehell - Smith,

Legislative Assistant

Louisville Metro District 4

(502) 574-1104
Wanda.mitchell-smith@Iouisvilleky.gov

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure,
copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful.





