Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
e Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Brandon Coan |

| Amount: $510.00 Date: Oct 1, 2020 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
$510 to Public Works for the installation of two no parking signs on Valletta Lane.

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Stuart Sparks

Agency Phone: 502 574

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

8 AM 510.00 Oct 1, 2020

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
Page 1




Department/Project:
Public Works/ Valletta Lane No Parking Signs

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name:

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

 Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
- own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

- Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Valletta Lane No Parking Signs

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

No

No

Yes

Submitted by: Jasmine Weatherby

Date: Oct 1, 2020

Revised May 2016




Dearing, Connie M.
J

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Tuesday, September 29, 2020 6:21 AM
To: Weatherby, Jasmine

Subject: Re: Valetta parking

Yes, LMPW is willing to accept $510 from CM COan's office for this project.
Thanks,

Stuart

From: Weatherby, Jasmine <Jasmine.Weatherby@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, September 28, 2020 5:21 PM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Valetta parking

Stuart - for the sake of our CIF application, is Public Works willing to accept $510 from our office for this project?
Thansk

Jasmine Weatherby (she/her/hers)
Legislative Aide

Councilman Brandon Coan

District 8

601 West Jefferson St

Louisville, KY 40202

Email: jasmine.weatherby@louisvilleky.gov
Office: (502) 574-1108

Help your friends and neighbors stay informed! Share this link to spread the joy of District 8 eNews.

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, September 28, 2020 6:49 AM

To: Tmsoergel <tmsoergel@yahoo.com>; Weatherby, Jasmine <Jasmine.Weatherby@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Coan, Brandon <Brandon.Coan@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Valetta parking

We are replacing/installing a total of 4 signs and clearing vegetation away from a fifth. We are replacing two
with our resources and two were to extend the zones beyond what we would typically do so you are funding

it. The $510 is for two signs.

From: Tmsoergel <imsoergel@vyahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, September 25, 2020 6:21 PM

To: Weatherby, Jasmine <Jasmine . Weatherby@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Coan, Brandon <Brandon.Coan@louisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks @louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Valetta parking




CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

I am not sure .
| think mr sparks can clarify

Sent from my iPhone
Trevor Soergel MD

On Sep 25, 2020, at 12:12 PM, Weatherby, Jasmine <Jasmine Weatherby@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Hi Everyone,

Is $510 for two or three signs? | see below (and received a voicemail to the same effect) that Mr. Soergel
is asking for three signs not two.

Thank you

Jasmine Weatherby (she/her/hers)
Legislative Aide

Councilman Brandon Coan

District 8

601 West Jefferson St

Louisville, KY 40202

Email: jasmine.weatherby@Ilouisvilleky.gov
Office: (502) 574-1108

Help your friends and neighbors stay informed! Share this link to spread the joy of District 8 eNews.

From: Coan, Brandon <Brandon.Coan®@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, September 24, 2020 1:37 PM

To: Weatherby, Jasmine <Jasmine Weatherby@louisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart
<Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Valetta parking

Jasmine - would you go ahead and authorize the transfer of $510 in CIF to PW for the below
project? Would you also update our online CIF budget with this information and, also, update
our online NDF budget withe Bardstown Road Aglow? Thanks!

Brandon Coan

Metro Council District 8
(502) 574-1108

601 W. Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202




Please sign-up to receive important notifications regarding District 8] Our goal is to increase from zero
to 8,000 engaged subscribers by 2019,

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilieky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, September 24, 2020 6:56 AM

To: Coan, Brandon <Brandon.Coan®@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Weatherby, Jasmine <Jasmine. Weatherby@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Valetta parking

CM Coan,

The project cost we are requesting assistance with is $510. With your approval to fund this
portion of the project, we will go ahead and conduct the installation.

Thanks,

Stuart

From: Tmsoergel <tmsoergel@yahoo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 23, 2020 5:05 PM

To: Coan, Brandon <Brandon.Coan®@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Weatherby, Jasmine <Jasmine. Weatherby@louisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart
<Stuart.Sparks @louisvilleky.sov>

Subject: Re: Valetta parking

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or
open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Fyi - the above email was from Trevor soergel not Stuart Sparks
I did not include him in this email

He will be emailing you soon

Sent from my iPhone
Trevor Soerge! MD

On Sep 23, 2020, at 3:38 PM, Coan, Brandon <Brandon.Coan®@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Stuart - thanks for meeting with Dr. Soergel; please advise regarding funding so
that $ is not any impediment to traffic and pedestrian safety in this case. Thanks
again!

Brandon Coan




Metro Council District 8
(502) 574-1108

601 W. Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

Please sign-up to receive important notifications regarding District 8] Our goal is to
increase from zero to 8,000 engaged subscribers by 2019.

From: Tmsoergel <tmsoergel@yahoo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 23, 2020 3:27 PM

To: Weatherby, Jasmine <Jasmine. Weatherby@louisvilleky.gov>; Coan, Brandon
<Brandon.Coan@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Valetta parking

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Several neighbors have expressed many concerns regarding big rock park.

I was able to meet with Stuart Sparks this afternoon regarding parking concerns along
valetta Ave near the entrance to big rock park. Over the past several years as the park
has become more popular and overrun more parking along the west side of valetta is
occurring. This is a high traffic area and a tarc route. There is a bling curve that create
many hazards. Fortunately there as not been any motor vehicle accidents or pedestrians
struck.

Mr. Sparks has been gracious enough to offer placement of two no parking signs in the
first two yards in this area. He admits that funding is tight and we asked him to place
one more sign in the next yard for a total of three signs. | believe he is going to ask
councilman Coan for funding for a third sign. If this is not possible | would be very
willing to come up with the funding.

Please do not hesitate to call for email me .

Sent from my iPhone
Trevor Soergel MD
502 396-6897m

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is
intended solely for use by the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If vou are
not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or
taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and
may be unlawful.




