‘ EOREREL B WAEELE

MAP 101420 PWO04

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighberhood Development Fund (NDF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

2 Primary Sponsor: Barbara Sexion Smith ;

| Amount: 17.388.79 Date: 10/5/20 |

Description of program/preject including public purpose, additional funding sourccs,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Repair and install sidewalk at 608S Campbell Street in District 4

MAP ACCT. #8672-410-8105-148223-822705

City Agency: public Works
Contact Person: Craig Allen

Agency Phone: 574.5150

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the recciving department concerning the project/expenditure.

Barbara S#xign Sy

4 E] 17.398.79 Oct 5, 2020
Phstrict # C‘ounci!/(ficnﬁbcr S[igmnurc Amount Dae
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chatrman Date
Clerk™s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: MAP 101420 PWO04 To OMB:
Budgct Revision #:
Account ¥
To Project Manager: ] ~ Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/[’roject Name: 608 S. Campbell Street Sidewalk Repair

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: 1f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

Yes/No/NA

Yes

No
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NO

[
[
[
[
No [-]
[
[
[
[

$5.000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so. is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supporting Documentation: Docs the attachment include a valid

cstimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: Wanda Mitchell-Smith Date: 10/5/20

Revised May 2016
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From: Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D.

Sent: Monday, October 5, 2020 9:44 AM

To: daryl511@hotmail.com

Subject: FW: 608 S Campbell St Sidewalk Repair Estimate

Subject: Re: 608 S Campbell St Sidewalk Repair Estimate

Craig and Wanda, | approve the $17,398 expenditure for sidewalk and curb repair work near 607 S.
Campbell Street per email thread below. It is my expectation this work can be completed by end of
November if we process the paperwork now.

Thank you, Barbara.

Barbara Sexton Smith
Councilwoman District 4
Louisville Metro Council
Office 502-574-1104

L

On Oct 5, 2020, at 8:07 AM, Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Councilwoman Sexton-Smith,

There is significantly more concrete work on Campbell St that would be repaired
including some items that weren’t at 533-535 S 20" St. For example, there were no
curb repairs at 533-535 S 20™ St but there is a good bit of curb on this repair. There was
no driveway on S 20™ but there is a significant amount of driveway on Campbell and

there is a basement entry and/or coal shoot that is involved here that wasn’t at 533-535
S 20t St.



| hear there is an appropriations meeting on the 14™. If you could get thisin an
approved | should be able to have it repaired before the end of November.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer |

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

From: Sexton-Smith, Barbara <Barbara.SextonSmith@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, October 2, 2020 8:02 PM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>; Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D.
<Wanda.Mitchell-Smith@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: 608 S Campbell St Sidewalk Repair Estimate

Craig, why does this sidewalk repair cost so much more than the one near 533-535S.
20th?

Will 608 S. Campbell Street Repair use the historic look used on S. 20th?

And lastly, if D-4 has the funds, when could this repair be scheduled?

Barbara Sexton Smith
Councilwoman District 4
Louisville Metro Council
Office 502-574-1104

=

On Oct 2, 2020, at 2:47 PM, Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>
wrote:

Wanda,

Please see the estimate for the sidewalk repair at 608 S Campbell St
below. If you have any questions let me know.

LOCATION 608 S Campbell St
REQUESTED BY Dist 4

RATE 5

DATE SENT 10/2/2020




ESTIMATE BY CA

86.2 SY of historic sidewalk, 6.4 SY of
historic ramp, 4.6 CY of historic driveway,
5' of historic header, 41' of historic
integral, 36 SF of historic structural

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS sidewalk, and asphalt as needed
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $17,398.79

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will require

re-inspection.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE
Engineer i
Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely
for use by the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are
hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of
this information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
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