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CIF 102820 PWO4

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
v/Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV)
[ Primary Sponsor: Bachbara Sexken Sunaith
s

[ Amount: YNAANA "] 58 .° Date: /»_-¢& -20

7 $7,570.00

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and W //
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City Agency: @u%ﬂ;z‘/ Weorks
Contact Person: Al J. Ancr=ios

Agency Phone: 57 e — 3 G 58

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # Council Mjn}fwr Siﬁz{ature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _ CIF 102820 PWO04 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: {u(o (< \/\er‘éS

s/No/NA

Program/Project Name: [ {)+ 5 { 2:(1 ?@t &(- W&Mﬁgﬁw 3 YP [auters
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Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?
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Submitted by: _ Mj?/\ . 7M - W

Date: /O—¢ — 25

Revised May 2016



JOASH CONSTRUCTION, INC.

A Minority Owned Business, Certified MBE, DBE, NMSDC, and K-DOT
Concrete Work Proposal

Project # 2020-09-29A-No Bollards
10/20/2020

Project Name: Planters and Concrete Work
Project Location: 2200 W Muhammad Ali Blvd, Louisville, KY 40212

Owner: Zion Baptist Church, Inc.
2200 W Muhammad Ali Blvd, Louisville, KY 40212

502-775-6404

Contractor: Joash Construction, Inc.

Address: PO Box 11381, Louisville, Kentucky 40251
Contact: Robert Rogers, Project Manager

Cell: 502-821-9197

Thank you for this opportunity to assist you with your construction needs. In this proposal we have included
pricing for materials and labor. We look forward to serving your construction needs.

Sincerely, Robert Rogers
Joash Construction, Inc, proposes to install the following:
-2 ea 487x247°x24” Planters

-lea 967x247°x24” Planter
-7 SY of Historic Concrete Sidewalk

Total: $7,570.00

Agreed
/ /
Joash Construction Representative Sign Print Date
/ /

Customer Representative Sign Print Date


cdearing
Typewritten Text


Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D.

C
From: Brown, Jeffrey E
Sent: Wednesday, October 21, 2020 1:18 PM
To: Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D.
Cc: Sexton-Smith, Barbara; Andrews, Al J.; Bell, LaTonya J.
Subject: RE: Zion-22nd & Muhammad Ali

Public Works will accept the funds for the installation of the planter boxes on the condition that the property owner
completed the license agreement and accepts responsibility for future maintenance and liability.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D. <Wanda.Mitchell-Smith@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 21, 2020 1:15 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Sexton-Smith, Barbara <Barbara.SextonSmith@louisvilleky.gov>; Andrews, Al J. <Al. Andrews@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell,
LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Zion-22nd & Muhammad Ali

Importance: High

Hi Jeff,

As per our conversation on yesterday, we now have a new cost estimate for the planter installation for Zion at 22" &
Muhammad Ali attached. This project would include 3 planters and concrete that will be placed on the corner of 22" &
Muhammad Ali Boulevard in the city’s right-of-way. Will you accept these funds. Thank you and please stay safe.

Wanda Witehell - Smeth,

Legislative Assistant

Louisville Metro District 4

(502) 574-1104
Wanda.mitchell-smith@louisvilleky.gov

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure,
copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful.



From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 21, 2020 1:54 PM

To: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D. <Wanda.Mitchell-
Smith@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Sexton-Smith, Barbara <Barbara.SextonSmith@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Andrews, Al J.
<Al.Andrews@|ouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Zion-22nd & Muhammad Ali

The planters will be installed within the public right-of-way
Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 21, 2020 1:53 PM

To: Mitchell-Smith, Wanda D. <Wanda.Mitchell-Smith@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E
<Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Sexton-Smith, Barbara <Barbara.SextonSmith@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Andrews, Al J.
<Al.Andrews@|ouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Zion-22nd & Muhammad Ali

Jeff,

Is this property in the city’s right of way?
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