DocuSign Envelope ID: 56BDDF32-ABA7-416D-9822-D8A4E6168BB3 [ PrintForm

CIF 111120 PW14

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Cindi Fowler ]

| Amount: §4,369.95 Date: 10-29-20 I

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Capital Infrastructure Funding will be directed to Louisville Metro Public Works for sidewalk repairs
at the following: 6911 Ethan Allen - $1,191.47 7014 Ethan Allen Way - $550.08 and 7301-7303
Ethan Allen Way - $2,628.40

City Agency: Louisville Metro Public Works

Contact Person: crajg Allen

Agency Phone: (502)574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

T (indi Fouler $4.369.95 10/30/2020
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF 111120 PW14 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: PUBLIC WORKS

Program/Project Name: SIDEWALK REPAIRS ON ETHAN ALLEN WAY

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

NA

NA

Yes
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Submitted by:My/ %WW

Date:/ﬁz 2372’2(1-

Revised May 2016
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‘T_hjeneman, Cindy L

——— ——= = S
From: Allen, Craig L
Sent: Friday, October 23, 2020 7:58 AM
To: Thieneman, Cindy L
Cc: Fowler, Cindi
Subject: RE: Sidewalks on Ethan Allen Way
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Cindy,
Yes, Public Works will receive this funding for these repairs.
Thanks,
Craig Allen, PE
Engineer Il
Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
(502) 574 6159

From: Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman®@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, October 22, 2020 2:13 PM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Sidewalks on Ethan Allen Way

Hello Mr. Allen,

Would your office except the funds of $4,369.95 for the repair of side walks at 6911 Ethan Allen Way — 7014 Ethan Allen
Way and 7301-7303 Ethan Allen Way.
Thank you,

Cindy Thieneman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p:502.574.1114 City Hall

e: cindy.thieneman@louisvilleky.gov 601 West Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
Louisville, Kentucky 40202




(502) 574 6159

From: Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman®@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, September 11, 2020 12:14 PM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: 6911 Ethan Allen Way

Hello Craig,

We received a call from a constituent at the above address seeing if we could get the above sidewalk fixed. She states
her mother needs to go on walks for her therapy and the sidewalk is crumbling. Could you please give us a price quote
and we could check our budget for getting this sidewalk repaired.

Thank you,

Cindy Thieneman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p:502.574.1114 City Hall

e: cindy.thieneman@Iouisvilleky.gov 601 West Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
Louisville, Kentucky 40202




Thieneman, Cindy L

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Tuesday, September 15, 2020 10:35 AM
To: Thieneman, Cindy L

Cc: Fowler, Cindi

Subject: RE: 6911 Ethan Allen Way

Cindy,

Please see the estimate and pictures below. Unfortunately Public Works doesn’t have funding for this repair at this
time. Please let me know if the Council District 14 plans to fund the repair.

LOCATION 6911 Ethan Allen Way
REQUESTED BY D14
RATE 4
DATE SENT 9/15/2020
ESTIMATE BY CA
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 31'x4' of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,191.47
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will require
re-inspection.







Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer Il

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets




Thieneman, Cindz L

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Cindy,

See the requested sidewalk repairs estimates in D14 below. If you have any questions please let me know.

Allen, Craig L

Wednesday, October 14, 2020 2:13 PM
Thieneman, Cindy L

Fowler, Cindi

D14 Sidewalk Repair Estimates

Follow up
Flagged

LOCATION 6911 Ethan Allen Way
REQUESTED BY D14

RATE 4

DATE SENT 9/15/2020

ESTIMATE BY CA
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 31'x4' of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,191.47

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date

sent. Any requests after 120 days will require
re-inspection.

LOCATION 7014 Ethan Allen Way

REQUESTED BY Dist 14

RATE 4

DATE SENT 10/14/2020

ESTIMATE BY CA

MEASUREMENTs/commenTs | 6'x4' and 6'x4' of sw, seed and protection

ESTIMATE AMOUNT $550.08

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date

sent. Any requests after 120 days will require
re-inspection.
LOCATION 7301-7303 Ethan Allen Way
REQUESTED BY Dist 14
RATE 4
DATE SENT 10/14/2020
ESTIMATE BY CA
4'x4' and 16'x4' of sw, 21" tree, 1 water
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS valve, seed and protection

1




ESTIMATE AMOUNT ] $2,628.40

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will require
re-inspection.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer Il

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
444 South 5'" Street, 4'" Floor
Louisville KY 40202

(502)574-6159



Thieneman, Cindy L

(e —_—————— e
From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Tuesday, October 13, 2020 11:59 AM

To: Thieneman, Cindy L

Cc: Fowler, Cindi

Subject: RE: Sidewalks

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Cindy,

| can definitely get the quotes you need for Ethan Allen Way. These locations wouldn’t go out to bid. Metro already has
an annual contract with fixed unit prices which we would use. I'll be working on these this afternoon.
Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer Il

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
(502) 574 6159

From: Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, October 13, 2020 11:35 AM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW: Sidewalks

Hello Craig,

| am following up on the below email. | had not heard from you.

I am wondering if it is to late in the year to get this done this year?

We will probably submit the CIF the first of the year, depending on cost. However, we would like to know the cost, so
we can budget this money.

Thank you,

Cindy Thieneman

From: Thieneman, Cindy L

Sent: Friday, September 25, 2020 4:46 PM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Sidewalks

Hello Craig,
Hope you are staying safe and well.

Councilwoman Fowler would like to use CIF funds to complete the following sidewalks that we have had on the list since
7-6-18 and 1 that we just submitted on Ethan Alan Way. We have quotes dating back to 2018. Could you please let us
know the new quote prices on the following addresses. She believes that since we are doing several on the same street,
that should yield a lessor cost.
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