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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
= Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
[ Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Cindi Fowler _]

| Amount: $4.999.00 Date: 11-12-20 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Funding request for annual ground/lawn maintenance agreement, 2 interchange ramps at Dixie Hwy./Gene
Snyder.

Description of services in the invoice.

City Agency: Louisville Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: (502) 574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

14 Cindi Fowler $4,999.00 11-12-20
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #;
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Louisville Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Ground/Lawn Maintence ramps at Dixie Hwy./Gene Snyder
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: I[s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$£5.000? If so, an ordinance is required. No

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid v
es

estimate and description of cost?

Submitted byzmt%mm/

Date: // é? ‘a)//&

Revised May 2016



Thieneman, Cindz L

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Tuesday, November 10, 2020 3:54 PM
To: Thieneman, Cindy L

Cc: Fowler, Cindi

Subject: RE: Louisville Metro Proposal

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Public Works will accept the funds for the lawn maintenance around the interstate ramps.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

Assistant Director

Metro Public Works & Assets
444 S 5th St, 4th Fl

Louisville, KY 40202

Office 502-574-0065

Cell 502-773-3222

From: Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, November 10, 2020 3:33 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Louisville Metro Proposal

Hello Mr. Brown,

Attached is a quote from Blades Lawn Care for ramp/lawn Maintence for the two Dixie Hwy/Gene Snyder interchange
ramps. The total of the invoice is $4,999.00. Will you accept the money and the appropriation of the funds?

Thank you,

Cindy Thieneman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p:502.574.1114 City Hall

e: cindy.thieneman@Iouisvilleky.gov 601 West Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
Louisville, Kentucky 40202




BLADES LAWN CARE

Colosscans 5:25
Tlathase @’aw(fagc 502-594-4021
wathan. kartlage(Qtwe. com

Date: 11/4/20

Address: Cindi Fowler—593-3371--Intersection of Dixie Hwy/Gene Snyder

Work Requested:

1) Mow, trim, and pick up trash around both flowerbeds every 7-10 days.

2) Spray both flowerbeds for weeds twice a year or as needed.
3) Purchase and spread mulch in both flowerbeds in the spring and in the fall.
4) Trim all bushes and trees in both flowerbeds in late fall. Dispose of all trimmings.

Estimate: $4,999.00 (covers all material and labor)



Thieneman, Cindz L

From: Thieneman, Cindy L

Sent: Friday, November 6, 2020 10:52 AM
To: Thieneman, Cindy L

Subject: FW: Dixie/Snyder Bid

Attachments: Cindi Fowler.docx

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

From: nathan.hartlage@twc.com <nathan.hartlage@twc.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 5, 2020 7:53 PM

To: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Dixie/Snyder Bid

Here is the new and improved bid :)

From: "Fowler, Cindi"

To: "nathan.hartlage@twc.com"

[

Sent: Thursday November 5 2020 6:50:24AM
Subject: Re: Dixie/Snyder Bid

Nathan,
Thank you for the bid. | would like it to say spray weeds at least twice a year or as needed.
Thanks

Cindi
Sent from my iPad

Cindi Fowler
D14 Councilwoman

On Nov 4, 2020, at 10:00 PM, "nathan.hartlage@twc.com" <nathan.hartlage @twc.com> wrote:

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or
open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Hey Cindi,



Attached is the bid you requested. Let me know if you have any questions. Thanks for the opportunity!

Make A Great Day--Nathan 594-4021
<Cindi Fowler.docx>

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure,

copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful.
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