CIF 120220 PWO7

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborheod Development Fund (NDF)

e Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Mounicipal Aid Program(MAF)
Paving Fund (PAYVY)

| Primary Sponsor: Paula McCraney

[ Amount: $15.000

Date: | ’{/1 2170

paying to have the Louisville Metro sides paved.

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Money will be used by Public Works to pave portions of Millgate Road and Wickham Way in
District 7. A majority of these street are located in Lyndon and have been paved regulary. We are

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Matthew Haines

Agency Phone: 502-574-3883

1 have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have

determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

5000

i3/

Amount Date
Approved by: L
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #:  CIF 120220 PWO07 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Refurned:

Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public Works (paving of Millgate Rd and Wickham Way)

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds wilt
be used for a public purpose.
Council Member Signature and Amount
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~NDF,CIF, MA GENCY CHECKLIST
| Interagency Name: Public Works

! Program/Project Name: f‘ﬁ{{_ﬁ}fq{’@ R@%ﬁf{kﬁfﬂf‘a WG’\/ P@u{@

; Yes/No/NA

' Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) : —
. Appropriating Funding? | Yes M
' Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with —
_ account numbers in the request form description? NA M
' Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of ' _
: the request exclude the matching fund amount? . NA M
' Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they : .
! disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? . NA M

| Funding Seurce: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville :
~own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF. :

' Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. - Yes

KR

. Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

© $5,0007 If so, an ordinance is required. . No E
i % b
" Ordinance Required: [s the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? ; —
" If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? - No M
_ Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid v —
: es M

" estimate and description of cost?

Submitted by: 7/(%71_4,2/‘?&/? Date: /sz 220

Revised May 2016




11/10/2020 Mail - Otten, Benjamin R. - Outlook

RE; Paving

Haines, Matthew R <Matthew Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Fri 11/6/2020 3:29 P

To: Otten, Benjamin R. <Ben|amin.Otten@iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jefirey Brown®louisvilleky.gove

That is correct and yes, Public Works will accept the funds.

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisvilie Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5t Street, 4" Floor

Louisvilie KY 40202

562 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 {C) { 502 574 412§ (F)

From: Otten, Benjamin R. <Benjamin.Otten@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, November 6, 2020 1:36 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew. Haines@Ifouisvilieky. gov>
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <leffrey. Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Paving

Hi Matt,
Councilwoman McCraney is interested in moving forward with paving these sections of Miligate Road and Wickham Way (using meney from our capital
infrastructure fund). Will you accept the funds? And just double checking the project woutld be $15,00072.

Thank you!

Best,

Ben Otien | Legislative Asslstant
Louisvitle Metro Coungil — District 7
601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisvilie, KY 40202
Office: (502} 574-3454 | Pronouns: hefim/is

From: Haines, Matthew A <Matthew Haines@loulsvilleky. gov>
Sent: Thursday, October 28, 2020 3:.57 PM

To: Otten, Benjamin R. <Bgpjamin.Clen@louisvilleky.gov=>
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jefirey Brown @louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Paving

! would just say that if you are aware of any roadway work that either Metro or a small city is completing that connects to the other in a similar fashion to these
roads, that you reach out about hefping compiete the segment. | would say that Metro and smail cities try coordinate with each out as best as possible, but as
you could imagine, semetimes this coordination can fall through the cracks. So any additional assistance we can get is rever a bad thing.

#atthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisviiie Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5™ Street, 4" Fioor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) | 502 528 5973 (C) { 502 574 4120 (F)

From: Otten, Benjamin R. <Benjgmin. Otten@ouisvilieky gov=>

Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2020 3:50 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Maithew. Haines@louisyilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jleffrey. Brown@iouisvilleky.govs

Subject: AE: Paving

Copy that! But for future reference, what would be the best way to set up this sort of partnesship? Also happy to discuss over the phone if that is faster. Thank

you!

Best,
Ben

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew Haines@ipuisvilieky. gov>
Sent: Thursday, October 29, 2020 10:20 AM

To: Otten, Benjamin R. <Benjamin.Otien@louisvilleky.gove
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey. Brown @louisvilleky.gove>
Subject: RE: Paving

If they are already paving the roadway, the partnership is off the table.

katthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisviile Metroe Public Works & Assets

444 South 5" Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) | 502 528 5273 (C) | 502 574 4129 (F)

From': Otten, Benjamin R. <Benjamin. Otten @louisvilleky. gov=
Sent: Wednesday, October 28, 2020 4:38 PM
To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew. Haines@louisvilleky.govs

hitps:/foutiook office365.com/mail/search/id/ AAQKAGVENWY xODISLTRINWUIN GZIZCOAMTNILTBhNjk SNDFkM2Y 0MQAQADCSOJQENKGIpfa2 Tm309Zc %30 1/4




11/10/2020 Mail - Otten, Benjamin R. - Qutiook

Ce: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jefirey Brown@louisvilleky.gov=

Subject: RE: Paving

That's greatl ] wilt check with Councilwoman McCraney abaut the cost but how would we go about setting up this sort of partnership? Would that be for our office
to reach out to Lyndon or you all? | believe they just started paving today, hence why | received multiple cafls from ron-Lyndon residents an those sireels about
their portion not getting paved.

Thank you for the quick response, | really appreciate itt

Best,
Ben

From: Haines, Matihew R <Matthew Haings @loyisvilleky gov>
Sent: Wednesday, October 28, 2020 4:35 PM

To: Otten, Benjamin R. <Benjamin.Otlen@louisvilleky.goy=>
Ce: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey, Brown @louisyilleky.qov>
Subject: RE: Paving

Ben,

It does make a big difference. This would eliminate the need for updating ramps and only have to pave about half the area. The revised estimate wouid be
$15,000.00 for both Wickham Way and Miligate Rd.

in fooking at google maps, | can see where the break between Metro and City of Lyndon responsibifity is. 1t would make the most sense to me for Metro to
parner with the City of Lyndon to pave the entire section from Farnham to the dead end. 1 think if this is done, the costs may aiso decrease skghtly, but | am
unsure what the City of Lyndon's timing would be to pave this. | say o pariner with them because if we pave one half of the road, the residents on the other
section will likely be upset with the City of Lyndon and vice-versa, We have done this kind of parinering with other small cities in the past.

Thanks,

Biatthew R, Raines, PE

Engineerlng Supervisor

Loutsvilie Meiro Pubilc Works & Asssais

444 South 5t Street, 5" Floor

Loulsville KY 40202

502 574 3883 {D} § 502 528 5873 (C) 1 502 674 4128 {F)

From: Often, Benjamin R. <Benjamin.Otten@lpuisvileky.gov>
Sant: Wednesday, October 28, 2020 4:05 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Paving

Hi Mat,

I'm not sure if this would make a difference in cost but it would not need to be the entire portions of Mitlgate and Wickham north of Famham. About two-thirds of
those portions fall within Lyndon and are currently getting paved by the city of Lyndon. The only portions that would need to be paved would be along the last 10
{or so) homes on each road.

I posted a screenshot of the streets below. The highlighted portion is the area covered by Lyndon currently getiing paved. Would this make the project cheaper?
Thank yoilt

Lot Haratbrmly AfBanDEE Aneslanail lnaneal id14 & £ A VRNV N EE TTHIRTR TeRIFLVFIFONAR FTRIY TDRRELGRTTIELRATWVARAM AMNA FAACNIADRT AL b n VP D V7 AT alA




11/10/202C Mail - Otten, Benjamin R. - Outlock

Best,

Ben Otter: | Legisiative Asslstant
Latiisville Metro Councll - District 7
501 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
Office: {502) 574-3454 | Pronouns: he/him/is

#rom: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffray Brown@louisyilleky.qov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 28, 2020 12:13 PM

To: Otten, Berjamin R. <Benjamin,Otten@louisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matihew R <Matthew Haines @iguisvilleky.gor
Subject: RE: Paving

Matt can help.
We are in the process of a survey to re-rate the condition of ali Metro roads but those results will not be ready until next year.

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S10e, an AT&T 5@ Evolution capable smartphone

—-eem- (rigirial message ——

From: "Otten, Benjamin R.” <Beniamin.Otlen @louisvilleky.gov=
Date: 10/28/20 12:08 PM {GMT-05:00)

“To: "Brown, Jeffray E" <effrey. Brown@louisvilleky,gov>
Subject; Paving

Hi Jeff,

Apalogles for bothering you again but who would be the person to contact regarding paving? | have had a few constituents complain about two small stretches of
road In our district and wanted 1o Jook into it. Thank you!

Best,

Ben Otien | Legisiative Assistant
t ouisville Metro Council — District 7

| isville, Y 40202
Office: (502) 574-3454 | Pronouns: he/him/is




13/16/2020 Mail - Otien, Benjamin R. - OQutlook
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From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew. Haines@louisvilleky. gove>
Sent: Wednesday, October 28, 2020 3:37 PM

To: Otten, Benjamin R. <Benjamin.Otten®@louisvilleky,.gov>
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey. Brown @louisvilleky gov>
Subject: RE: Paving

Ben,

Just to recap our conversation, you were interested in having the Metro owner portions of Millgate and Wickham repaved from Farnham to the dead ends.
Currently the ratings are 56, and 70 respectively but we are currently having our entire roadway network re-rated. Once those ratings are completed, & new 3
year pian will be put together based on the new PCl's. These roadways wilt likely be lower and may make it into the future 3 year plan. Alternately, District 7 can
utilize CIF dollars to repave the roadways at which | estimate both sections to cost $37,500.00. Ramps will be updated to meet ADA standards at both of these

intarsection in conjunction: with the paving.
Thanks,

Matthew R, Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Loulsviile Retro Public Works & Assels

444 South 5" Street, 4™ Floor

L.oulgvitie KY 46202

502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) | 502 574 4129 {F)

From: Otten, Benjamin R. <Benjamin. @iovisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, October 28, 2020 1:45 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R <pMalthew Halnes@louisvilleky. gov>
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jefirey Brown @louisvilleky.goy>
Subject: RE: Paving

Thank you!
Ang helio Matt! Would you be able 1o give me a call sometime today? | just have a quick guestion regarding two small stretches of road.

hitps:f/outlook .office365.com/mail/search/id/ AAQKAGVANWY xODISLTRINWUINGZIZCO4MTNILTBhNjk SNDFkM2 Y OMQAQA DeSOjQENKGI gfa2 Tm309Zc%3D 344
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