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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
X Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Rick Blackwell |

| Amount: $1,123.80 Date: 01/11/2021 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding for upgrade of existing streetlight and installation of new
streetlight at Columbine & Greenwood Road. This Tocation is in front of PRP
High School and is used by students to access the school. The cost to upgrade
the existing open bottom light to LED is $7.37/month for 5 years, totalling
$442.20. The cost to install a new 250weq LED 1light on an existing pole is
$11.36/month for 5 years totalling $681.60.

City Agency: Public works
Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502.574.0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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Department/Project:
Metro Public Works/Streetlights at Columbine & Greenwood Road

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Streetlights at Columbine & Greenwood Road

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: -1z McQuillen Date: 01/11/2021

Revised May 2016
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McQuillen, Liz

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Friday, January 8, 2021 4:03 PM

To: McQuillen, Liz; Cash, Cathy [Contractor]

Subject: RE: Columbine & Greenwood Road - Streetlight cost
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Public Works will accept the funds for the streetlight but we need to make sure there will be no additional installation
fees for the new streetlight

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, January 8, 2021 3:36 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Cash, Cathy [Contractor] <Cathy.Cash@Ige-ku.com>
Subject: RE: Columbine & Greenwood Road - Streetlight cost

Thank you for the information, Jeff & Cathy.

Councilman Blackwell would like to move forward with funding the upgrade to the first light and the installation and
service of a second light using District 12 NDF Funds.
Jeff — Will you confirm that Public Works will accept the funding?

Thank you,
Liz McQuillen

Liz McQuillen | Legislative Aide

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-1112 1 (502) 574-3363

www.RickBlackwell.com

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 2:59 PM

To: Cash, Cathy [Contractor] <Cathy.Cash@I|ge-ku.com>; McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Columbine & Greenwood Road - Streetlight cost

Liz,
To upgrade the old open bottom light to an LED would be $7.37/month for 5 years, so you would need to appropriate
$442.20. We would recommend the 250W LED equivalent to replace the 175W MV.

To add a new 250Weq LED light on an existing pole would be about $11.36/month and you would need to fund for at
least 5 years for a total of $681.60. After 5 years, if no additional funds are appropriated, the light would be turned off.

Jeffrey Brown, PE



DocuSign Envelope ID: A866A89F-AA9A-4A07-A82C-35D08073DFC8

From: Cash, Cathy [Contractor] <Cathy.Cash@Ige-ku.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 2:47 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Columbine & Greenwood Road - Streetlight cost

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

leffrey,

There is a 175W MV Open Bottom style light on the pole by PRP — Pole# 39534-84157 that is being paid for by Metro —
pole has TARC stop sign on it.

There is no light on pole# 39532-84148 that is on Columbine across from the street sign.
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5999 KY-1931
Louisville, Kentucky

B Googie

(:‘;’ « Slreet View

Cathy Cash

Coordinator | LG&E Outdoor Lighting Dept. | Ops Plus, Inc. (an official LG&E contractor)
6900 Enterprise Drive, Louisville, KY 40214

0:502-364-8727

Ige-ku.com

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, January 07, 2021 2:07 PM

To: McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@louisvilleky.gov>; Cash, Cathy [Contractor] <Cathy.Cash@Ige-ku.com>
Subject: RE: Columbine & Greenwood Road - Streetlight cost

EXTERNAL email. STOP and THINK before responding, clicking on links, or opening attachments.
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I need to add Cathy with LGE because I'm not sure these are Metro leased streetlights

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 1:49 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Columbine & Greenwood Road - Streetlight cost

Good Afternoon Jeff —

Councilman Blackwell is interested in possibly funding the placement of two LG&E LED streetlights at the corner of
Columbine & Greenwood Road. This intersection is in front of PRP High School and we have heard from parents and
administrators that this intersection is very dark and dangerous for students who cross here.

The two posts that we are looking at are listed below:
- 39534-84157
- 39532-84148 (I think the last digit is 8, but am having a hard time seeing my picture)

Could you please provide an estimate on what a contract would be to have these installed and serviced?

Thanks,
Liz McQuillen

Liz McQuillen | Legislative Aide

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-1112 ¢ (502) 574-3363

www.RickBlackwell.com

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure,
copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful,

The information contained in this transmission is intended only for the person or entity
to which it is directly addressed or copied. It may contain material of confidential and/or private nature. Any review,
retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon, this information by persons or
entities other than the intended recipient is not allowed. If you received this message and the information contained
therein by error, please contact the sender and delete the material from your/any storage medium.




