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NDF 020321 PW15

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
& Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Kevin Triplett |

| Amount: $850 Date: November 17, 2020 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Remobilization fee for installation of parking T's on East Warnock Street

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Stuart Sparks

Agency Phone: 502-574-3650

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #:  NDF 020321 PW15 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
n/a

Additional Signatures
I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Name: Public Works

' Program/Project Name:

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

Remobilization Fee- Warnock Street

~ account numbers in the request form description?

| Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
 disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

 Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes
NA
NA
NA
NA

NA
No
No

Yes

Submitted by:

shughes

Date: Nov 17, 203§

Revised May 2016




Hughes, Susan

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 10:56 AM
To: Triplett, Kevin D.; Hughes, Susan
Subject: FW: Fw: Fw: E Warnock St parking T's

So......we will be appropriating $850 to Public Works for this project.

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 10:50 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Grothaus,
Seth T <Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Evan Brewer <evan@reynoldscorporation.com>; Bobby (bobmack@reynoldscorporation.com)
<bobmack@reynoldscorporation.com>; Hines, William A <William.Hines@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Jennings, Patricia A
<Patricia.Jennings@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Fw: Fw: E Warnock St parking T's

Dan,

Yes, this can happen. If you can begin the process for appropriating the money that will ensure we are ready
to conduct the project ASAP. This will likely have to wait until next Spring.

Evan and Bobby,
I will let you know when we have the PO to complete work.
William and Patricia,

This is just an FYI at this time. We will need to place temporary no stopping anytime signs at this location
again. Likely won't be until next Spring but | wanted to include you.

Thanks,

Stuart

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 10:46 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; Grothaus, Seth T
<Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Fw: Fw: E Warnock St parking T's

Ok....we would like to have this done all in one day for$850. Can the following to occur: Signs out several days in advance
with the date posted for the work — weather permitting or other failure. Notify our office of this day and the Councilman
and I will get out early that morning to move vehicles with PARC’s assistance if possible. If we can make that happen
then we want to proceed. This is a procedure | have employed many, many times years ago with Public Works and it
worked extremely well! Let me know if this can happen and then we can appropriate the $.
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From: Brown, Jeffrey E <jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 10:21 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilieky.gov>
Subject: RE: Fw: Fw: E Warnock St parking T's

Or $850 every time they show up to the project

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 10:20 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Fw: Fw: E Warnock St parking T's

So0000 $850 to come back once and $1700 for two?

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 10:18 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Fw: Fw: E Warnock St parking T's

That’s not what | understood, | gave you some bad info

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 10:17 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>; Grothaus,
Seth T <Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Fw: Fw: E Warnock St parking T's

Just confirmed with Reynold's. There will be a remobilization fee to go back to the job site.

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@{ouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 10:12 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>; Grothaus,
Seth T <Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Fw: Fw: E Warnock St parking T's

They already got the kettle ready and went onsite once. My understanding is a second trip is a remobilization
fee.

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 10:10 AM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett @louisvilleky.gov>; Grothaus, Seth

T <Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Fw: Fw: E Warnock St parking T's

Are you sure about the second mob fee? | thought they had agreed to go back out one more time.
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Dearing, Connie M.

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Tuesday, January 26, 2021 11:36 AM

To: Dearing, Connie M.

Subject: RE: NDF for remobilization of parking T's on East Warnock Street
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Louisville Metro Public Works will accept the remobilization for S850 to have the contractor come back out to E
Warnock St to install thermoplastic pavement markings.

Please let me know if you need anything else from me.

From: Dearing, Connie M. <Connie.Dearing@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, January 26, 2021 11:31 AM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: NDF for remobilization of parking T's on East Warnock Street
Importance: High

Hello Stuart,

Can you please send me an email stating that Public Works will accept the funding of $850 for the remobilization of
parking T’s on E. Warnock St.?

Thanks!

Louisville Metro Council | Assistant Clerk
601 W. Jefferson Street | Suite 103

Louisville, KY 40202 | 502-574-3085
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