CIF041421PW22

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Robin J. Engel District 22

| Amount: $910.40 Date: 3/19/2021

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Sidewalk Panel Repair at 7507 Kendrick Crossing Lane in District 22. This project is to repair a
sidewalk that Public Works has rated as a 4, after a sinkhole caused significant damage. The
purpose is to level the sidewalk and make it safe for pedestrian traffic. Public Works will be
handling the repair work.

City Agency: [ouisville Public Works & Assests Department
Contact Person: craig Allen, PE Sidewalk Engineer

Agency Phone: (502) 574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

22 B Robin J. Engel $910.40 3/19/2021
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF041421PW22 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public Works 7507 Kendrick Crossing Sidewalk Panel Repair

Additional Signatures

1 have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

| Interagency Name: Public Works &Assests Department

Program/Project Name: 7507 Kendrick Crossing Sidewalk Panel Repair
| ‘ Yes/No/NA

‘Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes M
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with —
account numbers in the request form description? Yes M
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of _
the request exclude the matching fund amount? Yes hd
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they -
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? Yes ke
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes ]
- funding source is probably NDF. —
 Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful ____
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes hd
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than _
- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No M
- Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? _
- If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No M
“ Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid —
~estimate and description of cost? Yes M
Submitted by: Jared Townes Legislative Assistant District 22 Date: 3/19/2021

Revised May 2016




Townes, Jared M.

o i e S ]
From: Allen, Craig L
Sent: Friday, March 19, 2021 8:07 AM
To: Townes, Jared M.; Brown, Jeffrey E
Cc: Engel, Robin
Subject: RE: Sidewalk or Curb Request case #7985151

Jared,
we'll accept the funds for the repair.
Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer il

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
craig.allen@louisvilleky.gov

(502) 574 6159

From: Townes, Jared M. <Jared.Townes@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, March 19, 2021 8:01 AM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Engel, Robin <Robin.Engel@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk or Curb Request case #7985151

Craig,

We are preparing the CIF for the sidewalk panel repair at 7507 Kendrick Crossing Lane. Can we get your confirmation
that Public Works will accept the CIF transfer from District 22 of $910.40 for this repair?

Regards,

Jared M. Townes

Legislative Assistant to

Councilman Robin Engel

District 22

Louisville Metro Council

City Hall — 2™ Floor

601 W, Jefferson St.

Louisville, KY 40202

Phone: (502) 574-3467

Email: jared.townes@louisvilleky.gov




From: Allen, Craig L <Craig. Allen@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, March 16, 2021 3:50 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Townes, Jared M. <jared.Townes@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Engel, Robin <Robin.Engel@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk or Curb Request case #7985151

leff,

linspect it this morning and took some sidewalk repair measurements. There is a depression under the sidewalk that’s
caused the sidewalk failure. There’s also a hole right up next to the curb. I'm going to ask Operations to come out and fill
the hole next to the curb.

As for the sidewalk repair, it does meet the criteria for repair however since it was first reported in May 2020, it may be
several years before it's next in line to be repaired with the sidewalk repair budget.

Jared,
lincluded an estimate below in case Councilman Engel has funds to repair this sidewalk with discretionary infrastructure
funds.

LOCATION 7507 Kendrick Crossing Ln
REQUESTED BY D22
RATE 4
DATE SENT 3/16/2021
ESTIMATE BY CA
12'x4' of sw, earth fill and topsoil to fill
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS depression, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $910.40
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after
120 days will require re-inspection.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer i

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
craig.allen@louisvilleky.gov

{502) 574 6159

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, March 15, 2021 3:43 PM

To: Townes, Jared M. <Jared.Townes@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Jeremy.D.Gildehaus@marsh.com; Engel, Robin <Robin.Engel@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk or Curb Request case #7985151

Craig,
Do you know the status of this one and has the sink hole been inspected?

Jeffrey Brown, PE



From: Townes, Jared M. <jared.Townes@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, March 15, 2021 3:01 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Jeremy.D.Gildehaus@marsh.com; Engel, Robin <Robin.Engel@louisvilleky.gov>; Allen, Craig L
<Craig. Allen®@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk or Curb Request case #7985151

Jeff,

Can we get an update on the Sidewalk #7985151 repair request for Mr. Gildehaus?

Jeremy,

Thank you for your patience on this issue. Public Works presides over sidewalk repair work.

Regards,

Jared M. Townes

Legislative Assistant to

Councilman Robin Engel

District 22

Louisville Metro Council

City Hall - 2" Floor

601 W. Jefferson St.

Louisville, KY 40202

Phone: (502) 574-3467

Email: jared.townes@louisvilleky.gov

From: Townes, Jared M. <Jared.Townes@louisvilleky.gov> On Behalf Of Engel, Robin
Sent: Thursday, March 4, 2021 11:44 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@]ouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Jeremy.D.Gildehaus@marsh.com; Townes, Jared M. <jared.Townes@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Sidewalk or Curb Request case #7985151

Importance: High

Jeff,
Can we get an update on the status of case #7985151 at 7507 Kendrick Crossing Lane? Mr. Gildehaus is reporting that

the case was classified as completed, but the sidewalk, which has recessed into the ground due to a sink hole has not
been repaired. What is the status of funding on this project and is it scheduled for repair?

Regards,




Jared M. Townes

Legislative Assistant to

Councilman Robin Engel

District 22

Louisville Metro Council

City Hall - 2™ Floor

601 W. Jefferson St.

Louisville, KY 40202

Phone: (502) 574-3467

Email: jared.townes@louisvilleky.gov

From: Gildehaus, Jeremy D <Jeremy.D.Gildehaus@marsh.com>
Sent: Wednesday, March 3, 2021 1:29 PM

To: Engel, Robin <Robin.Engel@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Sidewalk or Curb Request case #7985151

Importance: High

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

To whom it may concern,
I would like to reach out regarding the sidewalk and sinkhole in front of my house.

In May of 2020 | sent in a sidewalk or curb issue request via 311 — case #7985151 — 7507 Kendrick Crossing Ln.,

Louisville, KY 40291. It was quickly moved from submitted to received and then received to completed. | asked a number
of times via the website what “completed” means with no response as obviously the sidewalk was never repaired. | then
followed with a call and was informed that a crew has looked at the issue and said that it will need to be fixed. They are
working on “funding” is what | was informed. | then followed up in July 2020 with an email to you and have not heard
since.

I can tell you as far as funding goes — my taxes went up for my house 6% and | was required to pay that. | am asking that
this sidewalk and sinkhole in front of my house be addressed as soon as possible.

I see numerous people in our neighborhood walking our sidewalks including seniors. | have noticed on multiple
occasions folks tripping. My kids also walk this sidewalk to catch their ride to school every morning.

I' would like for this to be addressed as soon as possible before there is a bigger issue and someone really gets hurt. |
have attached several pictures to this email. The sinkhole is continuing to go underneath the street and | would hate for
this piece to not be addressed as it is right next to the sidewalk.

Please advise as soon as possible on how/when this will be addressed.
4



Regards,

Jeremy Gildehaus
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