










From: Taylor, Shalanna
To: Canuel, Jason T; Veeneman, Andrea R.
Cc: Harward, Sonya
Subject: RE: NDF funds Acceptance
Date: Monday, March 22, 2021 12:44:12 PM

Thank you
 
 

Shalanna Taylor
Legislative Assistant
President David James District 6 Office
601 W. Jefferson Street Louisville, Ky 40202
|Office: 502-574-1106|
|Direct: 502-574-3910|
Click here to subscribe to the District 6 Newsletter
 

From: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov> 
Sent: Monday, March 22, 2021 12:42 PM
To: Veeneman, Andrea R. <Andrea.Veeneman@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: NDF funds Acceptance
 
Yes, we will accept the NDF funds.
 
Jason T. Canuel
Assistant Director
Louisville Parks and Recreation
PO Box 37280
Louisville, Kentucky 40233
 

502/574.6086 (office)
502/439.7694 (cell)
jason.canuel@louisvilleky.gov
 

 

From: Veeneman, Andrea R. <Andrea.Veeneman@louisvilleky.gov> 
Sent: Monday, March 22, 2021 12:09 PM
To: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>
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Cc: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: NDF funds Acceptance
 
Hi Jason,
 
Do you accept these funds?
 
Thank you,
 
Andrea Veeneman
Fiscal Administrator- Metro Parks & Recreation/Louisville Fire
Office of Management and Budget
Louisville Metro Government
611 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY  40202
Phone: 502-574-3810
Fax: 502-574-3829
andrea.veeneman@louisvilleky.gov
 
 
 

From: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov> 
Sent: Monday, March 22, 2021 10:48 AM
To: Veeneman, Andrea R. <Andrea.Veeneman@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>; James, David A
<David.James@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: NDF funds Acceptance
 
Hello Andrea,
 
Attached is our NDF paperwork for the Luv it Landscape and Vessel Management invoices.
Will you accept the funds of $11,975?
 
Thank you,
 
 

Shalanna Taylor
Legislative Assistant
President David James District 6 Office
601 W. Jefferson Street Louisville, Ky 40202
|Office: 502-574-1106|

mailto:Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov
mailto:andrea.veeneman@louisvilleky.gov
mailto:Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov
mailto:Andrea.Veeneman@louisvilleky.gov
mailto:Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov
mailto:David.James@louisvilleky.gov



