Print Form

NDF041421MP10

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
= Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAY)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Pat Mulvihill |

[ Amount: $1,200.00 Date: 03/22/2021 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

D-10 NDF Funding of $1,200.00 through Metro Parks Department to Luv-It Landscaping for
landscaping, clean-up, spraying, mulching, etc. at the ROW on Newburg Rd near Schuff Ln and

Goss Ave. and Eastern Pkwy.

City Agency: Metro Parks Department
Contact Person: jason Canuel, Assistant Director

Agency Phone: (502 574-6068

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have

determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached

documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
/

i O E Council Pat Mul\;ihill ﬂﬁt# $1,200.00 03/22/2021
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:

Reference #: NDF041421MP10 To OMB:

Budget Revision #:
Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Parks Department

$1, 200 00 to Parks to Luv-It Iandscapmg for Newburg Rleoss Ave

LEJ_rogramfPl_'oject Name:

| - - | Yes/No/NA

"Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) 177'___' |

 Appropriating Funding? . Yes EI ‘

" Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with e

' account numbers in the request form description? NA |EI

"Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of ' e

i the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA |E| |
"Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they - - b e
dlsclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

“Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

" own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA IZI

* funding source is probably NDF.

T Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful o

‘ life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA B |

‘ Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than | o = 1
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No E

" Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? |

‘ If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No EI

" Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

| estimate and description of cost? - Yes EI
‘ \

Submitted by: Geoff Wohl D-10 LA Date: 03/22/2021

Revised May 2016



Wohl, Geoff

e o = e e e e e e e —~ |
From: Canuel, Jason T
Sent: Wednesday, March 24, 2021 12:59 PM
To: Wohl, Geoff
Subject: RE: accepting funds for Luv-it Landscaping for Newburg Rd/Goss Ave

Yes, we will accept the funds.

Jason T. Canuel

Assistant Director

Louisville Parks and Recreation
PO Box 37280

Louisville, Kentucky 40233

502/574.6086 (office)
502/439.7694 {cell)
jason.canuel@louisvilleky.gov

LOUISVILLE
PARKS

AND RECREATION

From: Wohl, Geoff <Geoff.Wohl@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, March 24, 2021 12:36 PM

To: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: accepting funds for Luv-it Landscaping for Newburg Rd/Goss Ave

Jason,
On behalf of CM Mulvihill, please confirm that Metro Parks will accept $1,200.00 of D-10 NDF Funds for Luv-It

Landscaping for the landscaping in the ROW at Goss Ave and Eastern Pkwy. and for Newburg Rd at Schuff Ln. as we
discussed. Thanks very much.

Geoff Wohl

Legislative Assistant

Councilman Pat Mulvihill, District 10
Louisville Metro Council

601 W. Jefferson Street

Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-1110

geoff.wohl@Iouisvilleky.gov




P.0.Box 17192 .
Louisville, KY 40217 Invoice

635-1 686 Number: 9057

We Don’t Leave until you say you “Luv-It’ e

Total ~ $0.00
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Invoice
Number: 8760

:

Louisville, KY 40217
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We Don’t Leave until you say you

200.00

$1

Total




