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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Bill Hollander |

| Amount: $1,000 Date: March 23, 2021 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to Metro Public Works to install a 4" thermoplastic triangular edge line and install 12"
thermoplastic hatching at 10' spacing in front of 2852 Frankfort Avenue, on the west side of the
alley. All funding provided by D9 office.

City Agency: Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Stuart Sparks

Agency Phone: (502) 574-3650

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

9 Bl tollan Ao $1,000 3/23/2021

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _CIF041421PW09 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: . Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Install hatching and edge line in front of 2852 Frankfort Avenue

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5.000? If so, an ordinance is required. No

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: {zqh, ﬁ(w\}/f, Date: 3/23/2021

Revised May 2016
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Ethridge, lee

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Thursday, March 4, 2021 2:19 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E; Ethridge, Kyle; Jennings, Patricia A

Cc: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: RE: 2862 Frankfort Avenue - First Financial Bank - NPAT striping
Attachments: Frankfort_Ave_First_National_Bank.xlsx

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Kyle,

| have completed the cost estimate for this project. Because Frankfort Ave is owned and maintained by KYTC we will
have to request approval from them to do this. During the field inspection it was noticed there is a marked parking
space pretty close to the alley next to First National Bank. It would have to be removed for this project. The cost to
grind out the last parking space and install (1) thermo triangular section with hatching to restrict parking is $1,000 (on
the same block face as Blue Dog Bakery). It will be three to four months until we can get to it. We are pretty behind
right now so please let us know if you want to move forward with it so we can go ahead and schedule it while you are
working to secure the funding.

Thanks,

Stuart

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Wednesday, March 3, 2021 2:37 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: 2862 Frankfort Avenue - First Financial Bank - NPAT striping

Yes, | can. | am working on it now.

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, March 3, 2021 8:39 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: 2862 Frankfort Avenue - First Financial Bank - NPAT striping

Stuart,
Can you provide a cost estimate for the pavement markings?

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, February 25, 2021 1:02 PM
To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
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Cc: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: 2862 Frankfort Avenue - First Financial Bank - NPAT striping

Good Afternoon, Jeff.

A few years ago, the D9 office paid for hash line striping near Blue Dog Bakery to help delineate no
parking in a highly congested area.

Recently Councilman Hollander was contacted by First Financial Bank, which is next to Blue Dog
Bakery, regarding vehicles that continually park too close to the alley which makes it very unsafe for
vehicles when turning onto Frankfort Avenue.

D9 is interested in paying for thermal tape to mark hash marks from the sign to the alley (entrance to
the bank parking lot and drive-thru area). Please see attached photos regarding the specific location.

Could MPW please review and provide our office with a cost estimate?

Thanks so much,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (5602) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the bi-weekly District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood
news and alerts!

Comments

Bill - I'm writing you as the manager of the First Financial Bank in Crescent Hill. My issue is with the street parking that boarders the
ally to our parking lot and drive thru. On the south side of the street (bank side) there is a "no parking past>" sign that is not visible
and there is no paint on the curb to indicate "no parking". Cars park there very very regularly and it makes it impossible to see
westbound traffic (especially an SUV)- its only a matter of time before there is a major accident. Could you come take a look and see

if it is possible to create the appropriate traffic tools to keep that corner empty? Thanks,
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Ethridge, Kzle

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Tuesday, March 23, 2021 9:51 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle; Brown, Jeffrey E; Jennings, Patricia A

Cc: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: RE: 2862 Frankfort Avenue - First Financial Bank - NPAT striping

Will do. Louisville Metro Public Works will accept funding after funds are appropriated.

From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, March 23, 2021 9:50 AM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Jennings,
Patricia A <Patricia.Jennings@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: 2862 Frankfort Avenue - First Financial Bank - NPAT striping

Thanks so much, Stuart.

We would like to move forward. We can appropriate funding. | can let you know when it's been
transferring, but it will take several weeks due to the Metro Council schedule.

Thanks again,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the bi-weekly District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood
news and alerts!

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, March 23, 2021 9:48 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Jennings,
Patricia A <Patricia.Jennings@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: 2862 Frankfort Avenue - First Financial Bank - NPAT striping

Kyle,

The cost from the original estimate is still accurate. There are more markings on this proposal but no grinding is
necessary. Revised plan attached.

Kindly,

Stuart
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