NDF051221PW17

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
XNeighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: M arkus i kler ]

| Amount: #79¢ Date: 4 (9 [2 | |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s): with

These funds would be used 4o pay or a 5“/ur’ loase L&HE
on a S‘i’red’l-jkf b be mstalled at +the intecsechpn of
Ky 22 andA Simcoe Lane.

City Agency: P, blic Works
Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 5"')‘-\ - 5%1\0

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

|7 /% ) 1798 *Hm,[z_l

District # We[@ﬂgnature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: NDF051221PW17 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: : Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
Page 1



Department/Project:

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Py blic wWorks
Program/Project Name: ‘3—}~re et 4 Wt at Ky22 /Simcce, La. intersectivin

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? - \/
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with ,
account numbers in the request form description? "y / A
Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? === /

N (A

Request Form: [f other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? N / ' A
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the T
funding source is probably NDF. N A
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful ‘
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. " L //A
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5.000? If so, an ordinance is required. - [\]
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? - /\/
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid )
estimate and description of cost? - >/

Submitted by: K{‘ M Date: i"l lql P>

Revised May 2016



Eatherly, Kip

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Tuesday, March 23, 2021 11:35 AM

To: Eatherly, Kip

Subject: RE: streetlight near 9600 Brownsboro Road

Public Works will accept NDF for a new streetlight to be leased from LGE at the southwest corner of the Simco and
Brownsboro Rd intersection. The total amount for the 5 year lease will be $798 ($13.30/month x 5 years) to install a
400W equivalent Type C LED.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Eatherly, Kip <Kip.Eatherly@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, March 23, 2021 11:28 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: streetlight near 9600 Brownsboro Road

Jeff,
Thanks again for meeting with me and LG&E’s lighting representative on site this morning to discuss the possible
placement of a streetlight near the intersection of Simcoe Lane and Brownsboro Road. If you don’t mind, would you

confirm the placement, type of light, and cost we discussed?

Thank you.

Kip Eatherly

District 17 Legislative Aide

Office of Metro Councilman Markus Winkler
(502) 574-3462

Click here to sign up for the District 17 eNewsletter



