PrintForm |

CIF060221PW16

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Scott Reed - District 16 |

L Amount: $20,286.70 Date: May 12, 2021 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Sidewalk repairs in District 16. List attached.

$20,286.70 - District 16 CIF Account

$30,000.00 - Account #8137 410 8107 148234 822705 - District 16 Sidewalk Repairs (Request
that these funds are used prior to the CIF dollars)

City Agency: Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Craig Allen

Agency Phone: 502-574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

16 M_«: <7 $20,286.70 May 12, 2021

District # Cefincil Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _ CIF060221PW16 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: District 16 Sidewalk Repairs
Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? Yes

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: D. Carroll Date: May 12, 20g{

Revised May 2016



Carroll, Debbie
“

From: Carroll, Debbie

Sent: Tuesday, May 11, 2021 2:17 PM

To: Carroll, Debbie

Subject: FW: District 16 Sidewalk Repair List Summary 2- Detail of Locations and Cost Attached

$45,959.01 -Willow Creek neighborhood — 36 locations
610.13 -10630 Meeting Street in Norton Commons
969.33 -4003 Deer Creek Dr. in Ashley Woods
2,748.23 -4230 Ashleywood Ct. in Ashley Woods

$50,286.70 - TOTAL

$20,286.70 — from the Dist 16 CIF Account
$30,000.00 — from Account #8137 410 8107 148234 822705 - District 16 Sidewalk Repairs



Carroll, Debbie
“

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Tuesday, May 11, 2021 7:59 AM

To: Carroll, Debbie

Subject: District 16 Sidewalk Repair Estimates
Debbie,

Please see the sidewalk repair estimates you requested below. If you have any questions let me know.

LOCATION 4003 Deer Creek Dr
REQUESTED BY Dist 16

RATE 4

DATE SENT 5/11/2021
ESTIMATE BY CA

10x4 of sw, cut roots for one tree, seed

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $969.33
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will require

re-inspection.

LOCATION 4230 Ashleywood Ct
REQUESTED BY Dist 16

RATE 5

DATE SENT 5/11/2021
ESTIMATE BY CA

24x4 and 14x4 of sw, cut roots for one
tree and use hinged joints for one tree,

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $2,748.23
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will require

re-inspection.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer Il

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
444 South 5 Street, 4" Floor
Louisville KY 40202
craig.allen@louisvilleky.gov
(502)574-6159




Carroll, Debbie

e m— e e e T e e ey
From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Monday, April 26, 2021 1:55 PM

To: Carroll, Debbie

Subject: Sidewalk Repair Estimate for 10630 Meeting St

Debbie,

The sidewalk repair estimate for 10630 Meeting St is below. If you have any questions let me know.

LOCATION 10630 Meeting St
REQUESTED BY D16
RATE 4
DATE SENT 4/26/2021
ESTIMATE BY CA
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 8x6.5 of sw, remove 4x1 of sw
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $610.13
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will require

re-inspection.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer i

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
444 South 5 Street, 4'" Floor
Louisville KY 40202
craig.allen@Ilouisvilleky.gov
(502)574-6159




Carroll, Debbie
“

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Monday, April 26, 2021 1:56 PM
To: Carroll, Debbie

Subject: RE: Willow Creek Sidewalk Repairs
Debbie,

These estimates below are still good.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer Il

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
craig.allen@Ilouisvilleky.gov

(502) 574 6159

From: Carroll, Debbie <Debbie.Carroll@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Saturday, March 27, 2021 9:08 AM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Willow Creek Sidewalk Repairs

Hi Craig,

| finally got an account number that will help fund the below and I'm getting ready to do paperwork. Just making sure all
the amounts below are still the same. Didn’t know if there were any changes due to timing of the estimates and after
arborist reviews. Much appreciated.

Debbie Carroll
Dist 16 LA

From: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, February 9, 2021 4:11 PM

To: Carroll, Debbie <Debbie.Carroll@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Willow Creek Sidewalk Repairs

Debbie,

Here are the updated Willow Creek Sidewalk Repair Estimates for all of the sidewalks with a 5 rating. The total
estimated cost is $45,959.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Address Rating Estimate
5207 Windy Willow Dr 5, 2 TREES
S 3,393.10
5204 Windy Willow Dr 5
S 929.29




5211 Windy Willow Dr 5, TREE
3,467.27
11412 Hammond Dr 5
1,761.60
11406 Kendrick Dr 5, 2 TREES
4,940.17
5110 Windy Willow DR 5
1,429.36
11505 Fisherman Way 5, TREE
1,813.59
1140 Kendrick Dr RS
1,369.83
11414 Kendrick Dr R5
719.03
11500 Kendrick Dr R5
586.97
11504 Kendrick Dr R5
1,428.82
11506 Kendrick Dr R5
489.03
11514 Kendrick Dr R5
440.40
11516 Kendrick Dr R5
230.06
11415 Kendrick Dr R5
220.20
5408-5410 Windy Willow RS
Dr 1,062.42
5505 Windy Willow Dr RS
146.57
5407 Windy Willow Dr RS, TREE
1,883.26
5405 Windy Willow Dr R5
759.23
5403 Windy Willow Dr R5, TREE
1,216.30
5305-5307 Baywood Dr R5
684.91
5410 Baywood Dr R5
244.51
5406 Baywood Dr R5, TREE
1,262.86
5311 Drifton Dr R5, TREE

2,698.23




5308 Drifton DR

R5, leave stump in yard

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE
Engineer Il

S 1,998.47
5304 Drifton Dr R5, TREE
S 969.03
5204 Baywood Dr RS
S 220.20
11513 Fisherman Way R5
S 961.50
11202 Deham Dr RS
S 366.87
R5, TREES on Lithia Dr
5412 Lithia Dr next to driveway and
on Deham Dr S 1,572.91
11306 Deham Dr RS
S 1,565.71
11307 Deham Dr R5
S 1,078.07
11303-11305 Deham Dr R5
S 637.67
11301 Deham Dr R5
S 637.67
11215 Deham Dr R5
S 489.03
501 Lithia Dr R5, TBEE, remsp_ect at
time of repair S 2,284.90
Total S 45,959.01

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5 Street, 4'" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

craig.allen@Ilouisvilleky.gov

(502)574-6159




Carroll, Debbie
“

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Tuesday, May 11, 2021 8:36 AM

To: Carroll, Debbie

Subject: RE: District 16 Sidewalk Repair Estimates

Yes, we’ll accept the funds for these repairs.

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer Il

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
craig.allen@louisvilleky.gov

(502) 574 6159

From: Carroll, Debbie <Debbie.Carroll@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, May 11, 2021 8:34 AM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: District 16 Sidewalk Repair Estimates

Thank you Craig. I'm not sure if needed for the paperwork, but if so, would you please reply back that Public Works will
accept funds to repair sidewalks in District 16? Much appreciated.
Debbie

From: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, May 11, 2021 7:59 AM

To: Carroll, Debbie <Debbie.Carroll@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: District 16 Sidewalk Repair Estimates

Debbie,

Please see the sidewalk repair estimates you requested below. If you have any questions let me know.

LOCATION 4003 Deer Creek Dr
REQUESTED BY Dist 16

RATE 4

DATE SENT 5/11/2021
ESTIMATE BY CA

10x4 of sw, cut roots for one tree, seed

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $969.33
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will require

re-inspection.

LOCATION 4230 Ashleywood Ct




REQUESTED BY Dist 16

RATE 5
DATE SENT 5/11/2021
ESTIMATE BY CA

24x4 and 14x4 of sw, cut roots for one
tree and use hinged joints for one tree,

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $2,748.23
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will require

re-inspection.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer Il

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
444 South 5 Street, 4'" Floor
Louisville KY 40202
craig.allen@Ilouisvilleky.gov
(502)574-6159




