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NDF021721PW12 (as amended)

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
X Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
[ Primary Sponsor: Rick Blackwell |

| Amount: 1662.00 Date: 05/24/2021 ;

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding for removal of dead tree at 9618 Inca Drive. Tree is near public ROW
and poses a risk to power lines.

original estimate was $768, but actual cost of removal with new contract was
$1,662.

City Agency: Metro public works & Assets
Contact Person: Craig Allen

Agency Phone: 502.574.6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

12
$1,662.00 5/25/2021

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: NDF021721PW12 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Metro Public works/Tree Removal 9618 Inca Drive

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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1A
Metro Public Works

Interagency Name:

Program/Project Name: Tree Removal 9618 Inca Drive

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
- account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
- Request Form: [f other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No
‘Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: L1z McQuillen Date: 05/24/2021

Revised May 2016
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McQuillen, Liz

From: Alien, Craig L

Sent: Friday, May 21, 2021 3:46 PM

To: McQuillen, Liz

Subject: RE: Dead Tree at 9618 Inca Dr

Attachments: FW: NDF - D12 to PW for funding removal of dead tree at 9618 Inca Drive,,;

LouisvillePublicWorks20210128__ec3f014a-67¢9-497b-90af-cdc3733ca498.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Liz,

In between the time when | got this estimate from Bob Ray and when | got this money Bob Ray had already signed a new
contract with the City. The new price after the new contract was $1,662. The tree has been removed. Can you
appropriate the remaining $894?

$1,662 is still a good price to remove this tree. The next lowest price | have from my sidewalk contractors is $2,500.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer I

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
craig.allen@louisvilleky.gov

(502) 574 6159

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Thursday, January 28, 2021 12:40 PM

To: McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@louisvilieky.gov>
Subject: RE: Dead Tree at 9618 Inca Dr

Good Afternoon Liz, this tree can be removed for $768.00. That’s a good price.

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer i

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
craig.allen@louisvilleky.gov

(502) 574 6159

From: McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, January 26, 2021 7:52 AM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig. Allen@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Dead Tree at 9618 Inca Dr

Good Morning Craig — CM Blackwell is interested in funding, depending on the cost. Could you move forward with
getting an estimate for the tree removal?

Thanks!

Liz McQuillen
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Liz McQuillen Legislative Aide

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-1112  (502) 574-3363

www RickBlackwell.com

From: Allen, Craig L <Craig. Allen®@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, January 22,2021 3:07 PM

To: McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Dead Tree at 9618 Inca Dr

| forgot to include the picture.
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Craig Allen, PE
Engineer Il
Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
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craig.allen@louisvilleky.gov
{502) 574 6159

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Friday, January 22, 2021 3:05 PM

To: McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Dead Tree at 9618 Inca Dr

Liz,

There is a dead tree hanging over Johnsontown Rd at 9618 Inca Dr. The property owner has said he can’t afford to cut
the tree down. Would this be something Councilman Blackwell would be able to remove? | can get an estimate from
Bob Ray if the Counciiman would like to consider it.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer li

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
444 South 5% Street, 4" Floor
Louisville KY 40202
craig.allen@louisvilleky.gov
{502)574-6159




