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CIF061621PW21A

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
e Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councitwoman Nicole George |

| Amount: $6,000 Date: June 4, 2021 ]

Description of program/preject including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Purchase and installation LED enhanced stop signs for District 21. Locations will be determined by
District 21 Council Office in partnership with Public Works.

Cost: $6,000

City Agency: Puyblic Works

Contact Person: syyart Sparks

Agency Phone: (502) 574-3650

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax deollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

21 % \M $6,000 6/4/2021

District # Council Member Signature o Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount;
Reference #:  CIFO61621PW21A To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Retumed:
Revised May 2016
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Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name:

LED Enhanced Stop Signs for District 21

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

'Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Yes

NA

NA

T Yes/NoINATT

‘Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
- funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have auseful |

NA

Yes

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than _
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
‘Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
| If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No :
| Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid "
estimate and description of cost? Yes |
Date: 6-4-2021

Submitted by: Rachel Roarx, District 21 Legislative Aide

Revised May 2016




From: George, Nicole A

Sent: Friday, June 4, 2021 10:52 AM

To: Roarx, Rachel G.

Subject: Re: The most beautiful thing I've ever seen!
Categories: Print

Approve

From: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisviileky.gov>
Sent: Friday, June 4, 2021 10:43 AM

To: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George @louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: The most beautiful thing i've ever seen!

Councilwoman George do you approve?

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, June 4, 2021 10:03 AM

To: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: The most beautiful thing I've ever seen!

Rachel,
Public Works will accept the funding for this project.
Thanks,

Stuart

From: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel Boarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 3:32 PM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart. Sparks@louisvilieky.goy>

Cc: George, Nicole A. <Nicole George@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: The most beautiful thing I've ever seen!

Stuart,

D21 would like to fund 5 flashing/light up stop signs to be placed in our district. If there is a better name for these,
please let me know.

Locations TBD with approval from PW.

Will you accept the CIF funding of 5_6,000 from our office?




Rachel Roarx | Legislative Aide

Office of District 21 Councilwoman Nicole George
City Hall | 601 W. Jefferson St. | 3" Floor

Office: (502) 574-1121

Click fiere to sign up for the District 21 eNewsletter!

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, April 30, 2021 6:25 AM

To: George, Nicole A. <Nicole George@iouisvilieky.gov>
Cc: Roarx, Rachei G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: The most beautiful thing I've ever seen!

We would have to evaluate the site specific conditions and crash history. Typically, the speed would be 45
mph posted. The cost, if you wanted to fund them, is approximately $1,000 to $1,200 each.

From: George, Nicole A. <Nicole. George @louisvilieky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, April 29, 2021 3:04 PM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@ilouisvitleky.gov>

Cc: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel Roarx@louisvilleky . gov>
Subject: RE: The most beautiful thing I've ever seen!

What is the threshold for high rate of speed and severe crash history? How much do they cost?

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, April 29, 2021 11:58 AM

To: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George®louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: The most beautiful thing I've ever seenl

Unless funded outside of S&M, the higher rates of speed and severe crash history are the only way | have done it so
far. Also, 1 only have a few to use and when they are gone, | don’t have funding to get any more. :

From: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, April 29, 2021 7:08 AM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: The most heautifid thing I've ever seen!

I don't doubt the high speeds. What I'm asking is, how does this get approved and funded?

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@lcuisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, April 29, 2021 7:06 AM

To: George, Nicole A. <Nicole Gegrge@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: The most beautiful thing i've ever seen!

Speeds along Oid Bardstown Rd are in high. The posted speed limit is 45 mph.
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From: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, April 28, 2021 2:02 PM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: The most beautiful thing I've ever seen!

How does one get a fancy sign like this near Providence and Qld Bardstown Rd?

From: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, April 28, 2021 11:46 AM

To: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George @louisvilleky o>
Subject:




