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CIF061621PW21B

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
[ Primary Spoensor: Councilwoman Nicole George |

| Amount: $8,250 Date: June 4, 2021 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Design of the "paint & post" curb extensions at the intersections along Ashland Ave between

Taylor Blvd and Scuthern Pkwy to slow drivers,

Scope of Services aftached. Cost estimate: $8,250

City Agency: public Works

Contact Person: pjrk Gowin

Agency Phone: 507.574.5925

I kave reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

R
21 n yovyy '/w $8,250 6-4-2021

District # Council Member Signature % Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF061621PW21B To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date;
Actial Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Interagency Name: Public Works

 Program/Project Name:

‘Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
- account numbers in the request form description?

' Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

- Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

' Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the

funding source is probably NDF,

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

‘Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
" If s0, 15 the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
- estimate and description of cost?

Ashland Ave Paint & Post Curb Extensions Design |
e NOINA

'Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have auseful . _

Yes ~] ”
N
NA |
Yes
Yes
NA
No
Yos

Submitted by: Rachel Roarx, District 21 Legislative Aide

Date: 6-4-2021

Revised May 2016




Roarx, Rachel G.

From: George, Nicole A.

Sent: Friday, June 4, 2021 10:52 AM
To: Roarx, Rachel G.

Subject: Re: Ashland

Categories: Print

Approve

From: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, June 4, 2021 10:44 AM

To: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.Gecorge @louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Ashland

Councilwoman George do you approve?

From: Gowin, Dirk L <Dirk.Gowin@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 4:34 PM

Ta: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilieky.gov>
Cc: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George @louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Ashland

Rachei,

Metro Public Works will gladly accept these funds. Thank you for your assistance in making our community safer.

Dirk Gqowin, PE, PLS, PTOE
dirk.cowin@loulsvilleky gov
502.574.5925

From: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel Roarx@louisvilieky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 3:10 PM

To: Gowin, Dirk L <Dirk. Gowin®@lguisvilleky.gov>

Cc: George, Nicole A. <Nicole George @louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Ashfand

Drik,

Will you accept the CIF funds of $8,250 for paint & post curb extensions along Ashland Ave from Taylor Blvd to Southern
Plowy? .

Rachel Roarx | Legislative Aide

Office of District 21 Councilwoman Nicole George
City Hall | 601 W. Jefferson St. | 3™ Fioor

Office: {502) 574-1121




Click here to sign up for the District 21 eNewsletter!

From: Roarx, Rachel G.

Sent: Wednesday, May 19, 2021 2:11 PM

To: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George@louisvilleky. gov>
Subject: RE: Ashiand

| will file that for the June 7" new business deadline.

From: George, Nicole A. <Nicole. George@iouisvilleky.gove>
Sent: Tuesday, May 18, 2021 6:22 PM

To: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Ashland

Can you please send the appropriation to Public Works?

From: Gowin, Dirk L <Dirk.Gowin@louisvilleky gov>

Sent: Friday, May 14, 2021 11:32 AM

To: Geoige, Nicole A. <Nicole George@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: King, Michael M <}Michael.King3@louisvilieky.gov>; Deatherage, Amanda C. <Amanda.Deatherage @louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Ashland

CW George,
Following from our traffic group on items 1 & 5.

Ashiand Avenue is currently listed (by Ordinance) as a Metro “through” street and has a speed limit of 35 mph.. The ADT
is approximately 3000 vehicles per day. It functionally classifies/operates as a local collector providing a connection
between local streets and the arterial street system (Taylor and Southern Parkway). We can do a speed study and see
what the 85" percentile is.. It is likely around 35 mph. And check crash rates as well.

We can/will look at Bellevue and Ashland for a multi-way stop again, but a quick look at the splits (see below) indicates
that unless there is a crash problem, it would not meet MUTCD guidance for the installation of a multi-way.

Please let the CW know that TE will look at both requests. Thanks!!
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birk Gowin, PE, PLS, PTOE

dirk.zowin@louisvilleky.gov
502.574.5925

From: George, Nicole A. <Nicole Georse@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, May 13, 2021 9:09 AM

Ta: Gowin, Dirk L <Dirk.Gowin@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: King, Michael M <Michael King3@louisvilleky gov>; Deatherage, Amanda C. <Amanda.Deatherage @louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Ashland

Please proceed. Rachel will assist with the appropriation. My only request is that you add a line requiring
them to present a draft for comments prior to dropping final drawings.

For my own record, | hope the following considerations will be given:

1.) Dropping the speed limit from 35mph

2.) Widening the parking area

3.) Pavement treatment such as road rumble strips coming at the Oimsted North approach ??
4.) Treatment near Livingston




5.) 4 way stop at Bellevue & Ashiand - previously denied based on accident count.

From: Gowin, Dirk L <Dirk.Gowin@!louisvilleky.gav>

Sent: Tuesday, May 11, 2021 9:45 AM

To: George, Nicole A, <Nicole George @louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: King, Michael M <Michael.King3 @louisvilieky.gov>; Deatherage, Amanda C. <Amanda.Deatherage @louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW: Ashland

CW George,

Fee estimate for design of “paint & post” curb extensions at the intersections along Ashland to slow drivers is below. Let
me know if you would like to proceed. '

Dirk Gowin, PE, PLS, PTOE
dirk.gowin@louisvilleky.gov
502.574.5925

From: Bourke, Chad <Chad.Bourke@strand.com>
Sent: Monday, May 10, 2021 5:22 PM

To: Gowin, Dirk L <Dirk.Gowin@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Ashland

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Dirk,

Please see the following preliminary scope and fee for this project. If everything looks good to you, | wili send along a
more formal proposal letter.

Scope of Services

1. Develop drawings that include a standard detail for intersection bumpouts using pavement markings and

delineators and a layout sheet to identify intersections included in project.
2. Develop a base file using publicly available GIS data and develop a pavement marking plan for the intersection of

Ashland Avenue, Livingston Avenue, and Mapleton Avenue.

3. Develop an opinion of probable construction cost.
4. Submit drawings and opinion of probable construction cost to Metro Government for review and address

comments, as appropriate.
5. Submit final drawings and opinion of probable construction cost.

Compensation - 58,250
Let me know if you have any comments/questions. As always, thank you for the opportunity.

Chad | Chad Bourke, P.E., PTOE

; Strand Associates, Inc?




EDZ 584.3731 ext 2415
chad. bourke@sirand com | www.strand,.com
P.E. (KY)

3. STRAND

AEEGCIAYES

xcellence in Engineering Since 1946,

From: Gowin, Dirk L <Dirk. Gowin@louisvilieky gov>

Sent: Wednesday, April 28, 2021 9:13 AM
To: Bourke, Chad <Chad.Bourke @strand.com>
Subject: Ashland

Chad,

| would like a scope and fee to provide paint & post curb extensions along Ashiand from Taylor to Southwestern
Pkwy. Let’s discuss next week. Calendar below.

Gowin, Dirk L. Calendar

Dirk. Gowin@louisvilieky.gov

Monday, May 3, 2021 — Friday, May 7, 2021

Time zone: (UTC-05:00) Eastern Time (US & Canada)
(Adjusted for Daylight Saving Time)

May 2021
Su Mo Tu We Th Fr Sa

2345686738
9 10 11 12 13 14 15
16 17 18 19 20 21 22
23 24 25 26 27 28 29
30 31

Pl Tentative [ Free
B Out of Office Working Elsewhere [[] Outside of Working Hours

< Mon, May 3

M Before 8:00 AM Free




0 8:00 AM - 9:00 AM  Free

9:00 AM — 1:00 PM Busy
] 1:00 PM —3:00 PM Free
: 3:00 PM —4:00 PM  Busy
] 4:00 PM - 5:00 PM  Free
| 5:00 PM -5:30 PM  Free
: 530 PM - 8:30 PM  Busy
| After 8:30 PM  Free

4 Tue, May 4

B! Before 8:00 AM  Free
] 8:00 AM —11:00 AM Free
11:00 AM-12:00 PM Busy

[l 12:00 PM - 1:00 PM Free
1:.00 PM ~3:30 PM Busy

] 3:30 PM ~5:00 PM  Free

After 5:00 PM  Free
« Wed, May 5
B Before 8:00 AM  Free

8:00 AM - 10:00 AM  Free
10:00 AM ~ 11:00 AM Tentative
11:00 AM~12:00 PM Busy

12:00 PM - 1:00 PM Free

1:00 PM - 3:00 PM Busy
£ 3:00 PM~4:00 PM Tentative
[ 4:00 PM - 5:00 PM  Free
| After 5:00 PM  Free

+ Thu, May 6

[ Before 8:00 AM  Free

[] 8:00 AM - 9:00 AM Free

9.00 AM - 10:00 AM Busy

] 10:00 AM - 11:00 AM  Free

11:00 AM—~12:00 PM Busy

O 12:00 PM - 4:00 PM  Free
P 4:00 PM - 5:00 PM Tentative

B After 5:00 PM  Free

« Fri, May 7

| Before 8:00 AM  Free




8:00 AM — 10:00 AM Free
10:00 AM — 11:00 AM  Busy
11:00 AM ~ 3:00 PM  Free
3:00 PM —4:00 PM Busy
4:00 PM - 5:00 PM  Free
After 5:00 PM  Free

pirk Gowin, PE, PLS, PTOE
Transportation Division Manager
Metro Public Works

444 S. 5" Street; 4" Floor

Louisville, KY 40202

dirk gowin@iouisviileky.gov
502.574.5925

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. 1t is intended solely for use by the
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure,
copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be

unlawful,




