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CIF080421PW08

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
X Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAY)
| Primary Sponsor: Cassie Chambers Armstrong |

| Amount: $. - (8 1449 Date: July 2.2, 2oz |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Appropriating $18,149 to Metro Public Works for repairs of sidewalks on 2218-2221 Taibott Ave.
and 2225 Talbott Ave.

City Agency: Ppublic Works

Contact Person: crajg Allen

Agency Phone: 503.574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #; _ CIF080421PW08 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public Works Talbott Ave Sidewalk Repairs

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.
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Program/Project Name: Talbott Ave Sidewalk Repairs
et Ve NaNE ™
"Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
"Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of )
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful o
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000?7 If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? B
If s0, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
" Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: M%‘f‘"‘ Me tea\F

Date: Fl2212|

Revised May 2016




Metcalf, Megan A.

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Monday, July 26, 2021 11:03 AM

To: Metcalf, Megan A.

Cc Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Website Mayor Contact Form [#56310] - on

Yes, Public Works wiil accept the funds for this work.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer li

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
craig.allen@louisvillekv.gov

(502) 574 6159

Fram: Metcalf, Megan A. <Megan.Metcalf@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, Juiy 26, 2022 9:13 AM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Website Mayor Contact Form [#56310] - on

Hi Craig,

Thanks for bringing this to our attention again. Council Member Armstrong is planning to appropriate $18,149 for this
sidewalk project. Will you accept the funds?

Thanks,

Megan

From: Allen, Craig L. <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, July 21, 2021 9:40 AM

To: Metcalf, Megan A. <Megan.Metcalf@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Website Mayor Contact Form [#56310] - on

Megan,
You probably remember this sidewalk on Talbott Ave. Please read Cheryl's recent correspondence below. Can you ask
Councilwoman Armstrong if she is able to fund these repairs? The repair estimates below are still goad.

SRt SR-SDCB-21-025735
LOCATION 2219-2221 Talbott Ave
RATE 5

DATE SENT 3/5/2021
ESTIMATE BY CA




14x5, 12.25x5, 19.5x5, and 4.5x3.5 of sw,
11x9 of dw, 24" and 41" trees, seed and
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $15,737.00
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent, Any requests after 120 days will require
re-inspection.
SR SR-SDCB-21-029901
LOCATION 2225 Talbott Ave
RATE 5
DATE SENT 3/5/2021
ESTIMATE BY CA
27x5 of sw, cut roots for one tree, seed
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $2,412.00
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will require
re-inspection.
Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE
Engineer i

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
craig.allen@louisvilleky.gov

(502) 574 6159

From: Melendez, Salvador <Salvador.Melendez@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, July 21, 2021 7:48 AM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilieky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Fwd: Website Mayor Contact Form [#56310] - on

Craig,

Can you look into this compiaint? Thank you.

Sal Melendez,
Public Works
Sent via the Galaxy $10

From: Melendez, Salvador <Salvador.Melendez@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, July 21, 2021 7:46:11 AM
To: Ford, Will F <Will.Ford@louisvilieky.gov>

Subject: Re: Website Mayor Contact Form [#56310] - on

Will do.

Sal Melendez,




Metcalf, Megan A,

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Friday, March 5, 2021 5:07 PM
To: Metcalf, Megan A.

Cc Schnaus, Timothy W.

Subject: Sidewalk Repair Fstimate

Hi Megan,

Over the past nine months Public Works has received three different service requests for the same repair at 2221 and
2219 Talbott Ave. The family living at 2221 Talbott Ave includes 8 young man who is quadriplegic. The family has said
he has to drive his wheel chair into the street because the sidewalk is impassable.

The sidewalks at both locations have a 5 rating. Just so you know, sidewalk repairs are rated on a 1 to 5 scale, 5 being
the worst. Sidewalks rated a 4 or 5 are given priority and are repaired with the sidewalk repair budget or Council
infrastructure discretionary funds. Since this sidewalk was first reported in June 2020 and we are currently working on
4’s and 5’s reported in 2018 it will be a long time before Public Works repairs this sidewalk with the sidewalk repair

budget.

Below I included an estimate for repairing the sidewalk at these two addresses below for Councilwoman Armstrong to
consider. | also included an estimate for the sidewalk repair at 2225 Talbott Ave since this sidewalk is just a few doors
down and its also rated a 5. Please let me know if the Councilwoman is able to fund these repairs.

SR# SR-SDCB-21-025735
LOCATION 2219-2221 Talbott Ave
RATE 5

DATE SENT 3/5/2021
ESTIMATE BY CA

14x5, 12.25x5, 19.5x5, and 4.5x3.5 of 5W,
11x9 of dw, 24" and 41" trees, seed and

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $15,737.00
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent, Any requests after 120 days will require
re-inspection.
SR# SR-SDCB-21-029901
LOCATION 2225 Talbott Ave
RATE 5
DATE SENT 3/5/2021
ESTIMATE BY CA
27x5 of sw, cut roots for one tree, seed
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $2,412.00




Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will require
re-inspection.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer li

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
444 South 5% Street, 4" Floor
Louisville KY 40202
craig.alien@louisvilleky.gov
(502)574-6159






