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CIF081821PW12

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
X Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

[ Primary Sponsor: Rick Blackwell

| Amount: $5,000 Date: 08/06/2021

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Funding for public works for paving of Kosene Court,

City Agency: Public works
Contact Person: Matthew Haines

Agency Phone: 502 574 3883

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

12 .
gm !Z ! Lf( [ “ $5.000 8/9/2021
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF081821PW12 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public works /Paving of Kosene Court

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Kosene Court Paving

» Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Heother B&s;p‘o«

Submitted by: Heather Blazis Date: 08/06/2021

Revised May 2016
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From: Haines, Matthew R
To: Blazis, Heather
Subject: RE: Kosene Court
Date: Wednesday, July 14, 2021 3:03:26 PM
Attachments: image001.png
image0Q2.png
image005.p0g
image007.png
image010.png
im 11.0n
Heather,

| estimate it at $5,000.00. If you plan to fund, | will have our contractor repave with Westmeadow Ct
when they go back out and will switch the money back once approved by council.

Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5 street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1502 574 4129 {F)

From: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, July 7, 2021 4:42 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Kosene Court

Good afternoon, Matthew. Yes, we would like to get a quote on paving Kosene Court.
Thank you,
Heather

Heather Blazis Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-1112 © (502) 574-3363

www.rickblackwell.com

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew. Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, July 6, 2021 1:07 PM

To: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@loujsvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Kosene Court

Alameter/Chiswell was paved a few years back which Kosene is directly off that roadway. | do not
recall if and what the reasoning was for that at the time. Birnamwood, Baymeadow, and the courts
off those roadways were all planned to be paved with this round of paving.
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We have limited budgets so we try to get as much as we can, If D12 wants to pave Kosene Ct | can
provide a quote.

Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 south 5% Street, 4'" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Blazis, Heather <heather blazis@louisvilieky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, July 6, 2021 12:32 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Kosene Court

Thank you very much for the update on Westmeadow Court. We really appreciate that and | know
the residents will as well. Do you know why Kosene would be the only street in the neighborhood to
not be paved?

Thank you,

Heather

Heather Blazis Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-1112 ° (502) 574-3363

www. rickblackwell.com

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew, Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, July 6, 2021 12:05 PM

To: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Kosene Court

Westmeadow was supposed to be repaved with the rest of paving, however, the contractor ran out
of material. They need to come back and finish this paving and am awaiting their schedule to do so.

Kosene is not on our current list for paving.
Thank you,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisvilie Metro Public Works & Assets
444 South 5" street, 4™ Floor
Louisville KY 40202
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502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky gov>
Sent: Thursday, July 1, 2021 1:37 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew . Haines@louisvilleky gov>
Subject: Kosene Court

Good afternoon, Matthew. Another individual contacted me about having Westmeadow Court
paved and also mentioned Kosene Court as well. Apparently they are the two roads in that
subdivision that haven’t been paved. Kosene has cracks that grass is growing out of. Can you please
let me know if this is on the list to be paved anytime soon?

Thank you,

Heather

Heather Blazis Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
« (502)574-1112 ° (502)574-3363
www.rickblackwell.com

From: Haines, Matthew R <Maithew Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, June 23, 2021 2:47 PM

To: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Monthly Paving Report: May 2021

It is still outstanding. Have not received a schedule on it yet. Will advise when received.

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5 Street, 4™" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1502 528 5973 (C} 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Blazis, Heather <heather blazis@louisvillekv.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, June 23, 2021 2:45 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew. Haines@louisvilleky gov>
Subject: RE: Monthly Paving Report: May 2021

Good afternoon, Matthew. | wanted to follow up for any update on Westmeadow Court and when it
would be paved.

Thank you,

Heather
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Heather Blazis  Legislative Assistant

Office of Counciiman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-1112 ¢+ (502) 574-3363

MMKMMMMQm
From: Blazis, Heather
Sent: Monday, June 14, 2021 12:44 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew Haines@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Monthly Paving Report: May 2021

Good morning, Matthew. | see Westmeadow Court listed on this paving list, showing as finished in
May. A constituent contacted our office to say that the entrance to the neighborhood had been
paved, but not Westmeadow Court. Do you have an estimate of when the court itself will be paved?
Thank you,

Heather

Heather Blazis Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-1112 © (502) 574-3363

www, rickblackwell,.com

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew Haines@louisvilleky.goy>

Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 12:17 PM

To: Bradley, Maxwell B. <Maxwell.Bradley@louisvilleky.gov>; Tapp, Christy
<Christy.Tapp®I|ouisvilleky.gov>; Jackson, Aaron K <Aaron Jackson@louisvilleky.gov>; Frockt, Daniel
<Daniel. Frockt@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, leffrey E <Jeffrev. Brown®@louisvilleky.gov>; Burns, Vanessa
<Vanessa.Burns@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2 @louisvilleky.goy>; Stenberg, Beth
<Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>; Gibson, Ozzy <Ozzy.Gibson®@louisvilleky.gov>; Metro Council
Staff <MetroCouncilStaff@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Monthly Paving Report: May 2021

Hello everyone,

Attached is the fiscal year 21 monthly paving report for May. If anyone has any questions or
comments, please feel free to contact me.

Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE
Engineering Supervisor
Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5" Street, 4" Floor
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Louisville KY 40202
502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)



Harward, Sonya
L - L T B N R S P O KT

From: Blazis, Heather

Sent: Wednesday, August 11, 2021 8:41 AM
To: Harward, Sonya

Subject: FW: Kosene Court Paving

Heather Blazis legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-1112  (502) 574-3363

www.rickblackwell.com

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, August 11, 2021 8:41 AM

To: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Kosene Court Paving

Public Works will accept the funds.
Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5 Street, 4™ Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D} 1502 528 5973 (C) 1502 574 4129 (F)

From: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, August 10, 2021 9:04 AM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Kosene Court Paving

Good morning, Matthew. For our paperwork for the CIF we need an email confirming that Public Works will accept the
$5000 from District 12 to complete the requested paving of Kosene Court. Could you please send me that at your
earliest convenience?

Thank you,
Heather

Heather Blazis Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
{(502)574-1112 (502)574-3363

www.rickblackwell.com




