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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
e Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

CIF091521PW04

| Primary Sponsor: Jecorey Arthur

| Amount: 188.00

Date: 8/11/21

Location: W.J. Hodge Street
Honoree:Alberta O. Jones

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
We are replacing an honory street sign that has been torn down.

City Agency: Public Works

Contact Person: wijjliam Hines

Agency Phone: 502.794.6862

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached

documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # uncil Membér Signature
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Date

Approved by:

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount:
Reference #: CIF091521PW04

Appropriations Committee Chairman

Amended Amount:

To OMB:

Date

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public Works/]Replace Honorary Street Sign for Alberta Jones on W] Hodge St.

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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’Interagé’ncy‘Nén‘le: U PUthWOYkS o

? Program/Project Name: Replace Honorary Street Sign for Alberta Jones on W] Hodge St.

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
- Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
- funding source is probably NDF.

' Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

~ Ordinance Required: [s the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: s the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

~ Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
 estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA
ves [
NA ﬂ
NA B
NA -]
Yes  [f]
Yes -]
NA E
NA 3
Yes K

Submitted by:

Date: 5[ HlZl

Revised May 2016



Wright, Brianna

From: Hines, William A

Sent: Wednesday, August 11, 2021 2:39 PM

To: Wright, Brianna

Subject: RE: Honorary Street Sign Replacement | Alberta O. Jones

Good afternoon Brianna,
Yes we will. Could you please send a copy of the resolution.
Thank you,

William A. Hines III

Labor Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
Signs & Markings Division

3507 Newburg Rd

Louisville, KY 40218

Phone: (502) 794-6862

Fax: (502) 458-4868
https://louisvilleky.gov/

From: Wright, Brianna <Brianna.Wright@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, August 11, 2021 10:59 AM

To: Hines, William A <William.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Honorary Street Sign Replacement | Alberta O. Jones

Will you accept the funds to make the sign?

Thank you!

From: Hines, William A <William .Hines@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, May 28, 2021 6:57 AM

To: Wright, Brianna <Brianna. Wright@louisvilleky gov>

Subject: RE: Honorary Street Sign Replacement | Alberta O. Jones

Good morning Brianna,
The cost for {1) honorary street name sign is $188
Have a great day,

William A. Hines 111



Labor Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
Signs & Markings Division

3507 Newburg Rd

Louisville, KY 40218

Phone: (502) 794-6862

Fax: (502) 458-4868
https://louisvilleky.gov/

From: Wright, Brianna <Brianna.Wright@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, May 27, 2021 3:55 PM

To: Hines, William A <William.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Honorary Street Sign Replacement | Alberta O. Jones

William,

The honorary street sign on W. J. Hodge Street for Alberta O. Jones is missing and we would like to have it replaced.
Could you please give me a quote for this?

Thank you

Brianna



