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NDF100621ABC08

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
X Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
[ Primary Sponsor: Cassie Chambers Armstrong |

[ Amount: g5 000.00 Date: )9¢R02021 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Appropriating $5,000 in District 8 Neighborhood Development Funds to Alcohol
Beverage control to fund officer overtime for weekend enforcement of late time
Tiquor license establishments.

City Agency: Alcohol Beverage Control

Contact Person: Robert Kirchdorfer

Agency Phone: (502) 574-2886

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

9/20/21

8 9126142021
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _NDF100621ABC08 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
ABC overtime weekend Enforcement

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount

District 1

District 2

District 3

District 4

District 5

District 6

District 7

District 8

District 9

District 10

District 11

District 12

District 13

District 14

District 15

District 16

District 17

District 18

District 19

District 20

District 21
District 22

District 23

District 24
District 25

LA R S - BN - - - - - B R - - T - B~ R = R - R . Y R R R I - - -

District 26

Revised May 2016
Page 2



DocuSign Envelope ID: 13454145-9625-45BD-BECS-AD41A3BDEDDB

, CIF, N AV I

Interagency Name: ABC

Program/Project Name: ABC Overtime Weekend Enforcement

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
- Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF, NA
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. Yes_ No
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes
9/20/21
Submitted by: MR Nideait Date: 9I@p2021-

Revised May 2016
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Metcalf, Megan A.

From: Kirchdorfer, Robert

Sent: Monday, September 20, 2021 1:34 PM
To: Metcalf, Megan A.

Cc Watkins, Rodridges T

Subject: Re: Overtime NDF

Megan, codes and Regulations will accept these funds for our ABC officers for overtime.

Robert Kirchdorfer
Director
Codes & Regulations.

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 20, 2021, at 12:06 PM, Metcalf, Megan A. <Megan.Metcalf@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Hi Director Kirchdorfer and Mr. Watkins,

For the District 8 appropriation of $5,000 in overtime funds to ABC, | need you to respond to this email
that ABC will accept the funds in order to file it today with New Business for the Metro Council meeting.

Thanks,

Megan Metcalf

Megan A. Metcalf, JD

she/her

Legislative Aide, District 8

Council Member Cassie Chambers Armstrong
(502) 574-1108

601 W. Jefferson Street

Louisville, KY 40202

<image001.gif>

From: Kirchdorfer, Robert <Robert.Kirchdorfer@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, September 10, 2021 1:19 PM

To: Metcalf, Megan A. <Megan.Metcalf@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Overtime NDF

Megan, | spoke with my Enforcement chief on this and he just got back to me that he can have his team
do it. When do you expect to have the funds in place as we could start next weekend

Thanks




Robert Kirchdorfer

Director/ABC Administrator
Department of Codes & Regulations
Louisville Forward

Louisville Metro Government

(502) 574-2886

NOTICE of CONFIDENTIALITY: This e-mail, including any attachments, is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential information that is legally
privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this e-mail is not the
intended recipient, you are notified that any review, use, disclosure, distributing or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please contact
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all forms of the original message.

From: Metcalf, Megan A. <Megan.Metcalf@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, September 10, 2021 10:13 AM

To: Kirchdorfer, Robert <Robert.Kirchdorfer@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Overtime NDF

Hi Director Kirchdorfer,

While the budget amendment is in the works, Council Member Armstrong would like to allocate NDF
funds for overtime to allow for weekend enforcement for the next several weekends. She would like to
allocate $5000 for overtime. Would that be sufficient and will ABC accept the funds for this purpose?

Thanks,
Megan

Megan A. Metcalf, JD

she/her

Legislative Aide, District 8

Council Member Cassie Chambers Armstrong
(502) 574-1108

601 W. Jefferson Street

Louisville, KY 40202
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