




From: Neathery, Tracey L
To: Friedman, Steve P
Subject: RE: Urgent COVID-19 Contract Request - Assistance Needed
Date: Wednesday, September 22, 2021 10:28:09 AM

It’s okay to send.  Please include this email thread so Joel will be reminded of the process being
followed.
 
~Tracey
 

From: Friedman, Steve P <Steve.Friedman@louisvilleky.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2021 9:26 AM
To: Neathery, Tracey L <Tracey.Neathery@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Urgent COVID-19 Contract Request - Assistance Needed
 
The amendment for the date extension is complete and has been implemented.  The second NCCR
you mentioned below in the second paragraph is attached.  Please review before I send it to Joel for
approval.
 
Thanks,
Steve
 

From: Neathery, Tracey L <Tracey.Neathery@louisvilleky.gov> 
Sent: Monday, September 13, 2021 4:48 PM
To: Lyddane, Briana <Briana.Lyddane@louisvilleky.gov>; Neaveill, Joel P
<Joel.Neaveill@louisvilleky.gov>; Friedman, Steve P <Steve.Friedman@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Cabeza, Arlene H. <arlene.cabeza@louisvilleky.gov>; Winslow, Nickolas A
<Nickolas.Winslow@louisvilleky.gov>; Mendel, Connie <Connie.Mendel@louisvilleky.gov>; Altman,
William <William.Altman@louisvilleky.gov>; Handmaker, Karen
<Karen.Handmaker@louisvilleky.gov>; Huntzinger, Holden <Holden.Huntzinger@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Urgent COVID-19 Contract Request - Assistance Needed
 
Briana,
You didn’t mention the amount of the increase LMPHW will need.  Assuming it will be more than
$30k, you are correct.  The most expedient way is to extend the date as we work to complete the
request for an increase. 
 
First, send in a NCCR for the date extension.  We can execute that once we have collected all
signatures.  We will also require a second NCCR requesting the increase.  If the amount is greater
than $30,000, Metro Council must approve it.  That approval generally takes 6-8 weeks, but with the
date extension in place you should be okay.
 
~Tracey
 

From: Lyddane, Briana <Briana.Lyddane@louisvilleky.gov> 
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Sent: Monday, September 13, 2021 4:27 PM
To: Neathery, Tracey L <Tracey.Neathery@louisvilleky.gov>; Neaveill, Joel P
<Joel.Neaveill@louisvilleky.gov>; Friedman, Steve P <Steve.Friedman@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Cabeza, Arlene H. <arlene.cabeza@louisvilleky.gov>; Winslow, Nickolas A
<Nickolas.Winslow@louisvilleky.gov>; Mendel, Connie <Connie.Mendel@louisvilleky.gov>; Altman,
William <William.Altman@louisvilleky.gov>; Handmaker, Karen
<Karen.Handmaker@louisvilleky.gov>; Huntzinger, Holden <Holden.Huntzinger@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Urgent COVID-19 Contract Request - Assistance Needed
 
Good afternoon! We just discovered that our PSC with Vitality Dx for COVID-19 testing in the school
system has expired. The PO# is 381269 with a ceiling of $450,000. We originally asked for the
contract to be put in place January through August 2021 because a grant we received from the
Rockefeller Foundation is paying for the services and the grant was set to end in August. Because
COVID testing volume declined over the spring, and picked up in the later summer, we received an
extension from the Rockefeller grant to expend these funds through December 31, 2021. We will
continue to utilize Vitality Dx through the grant period and need to extend the contract through
December 31, 2021. In addition, we need to raise the ceiling amount because we anticipate going
over $450K through December 31.
 
Can you please assist us in extending and increasing this contract in the quickest way possible? If we
can extend now to pay bills until we hit the $450K ceiling, that would be ideal. Then in the meantime
we can go through whatever process we need to in order to increase the total amount. Please let us
know what you recommend we do. I’ve copied several LMPHW staff who can speak to the urgency
of this request as well as answer any programmatic questions you may have.  
 
Thanks,
Briana
 
Briana M. Lyddane, MPH
(She/Her – What’s this?)
Executive Administrator
Louisville Metro Public Health and Wellness
400 East Gray Street, Louisville, KY 40202
briana.lyddane@louisvilleky.gov
Phone: 502-574-6690 Cell: 502-930-8623
*I am teleworking during COVID-19…please email me.
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