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Print Form

CIF111721LMPD15

NDF111721EMPD15
(as amended)

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
“wNeighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
X Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAY)
| Primary Sponsor: Kevin Triplett |

[ Amount: $480:06- $496.13 Date: November 3, 2021 )

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Funding is requested for a blue light on the camera at 3rd and Florence Ave as well as installation.

DataLink will install the light.

City Agency: LMPD
Contact Person: Emily McKinley

Agency Phone: 574 24 3 0

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

~

BV $496.13
15 ji g,i’:w; L *,_ 4 lef - “$486-00- Nov 2, 2021
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
i
//
/
/
Approved by: /
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF111721LMPD15 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: LMPD

Program/Project Name:

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

LED LIGHT INSTALLATION

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

M Yes

NA_ Yes

Noe—_ NA
Nao NA
Yes

Submitted by: M HA/? %W

75

pate: /100 3, 209
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Harward, Sonza

From: Hughes, Susan

Sent: Thursday, November 4, 2021 12:15 PM
To: Harward, Sonya

Cc: Luckett, Daniel R; Triplett, Kevin D.
Subject: FW: NDF for LMPD Blue Light

Thank you Sonya. See the message below.

Susan

From: McKinley, Emily <Emily.McKinley@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 4, 2021 12:13 PM

To: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>; Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin.Triplett@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>; Nett, Timothy <Timothy.Nett@!ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: NDF for LMPD Blue Light

Yes. LMPD will accept the funds for the blue light at 3//Florence.

From: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, November 4, 2021 12:12 PM

To: McKinley, Emily; Triplett, Kevin D.

Cc: Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: FW: NDF for LMPD Blue Light

Lt. McKinley, | prepared the funding request for the blue light at Florence. |included your description and purpose of
the project, but the Clerk’s office is asking for a direct quote that you will accept the funding of $480.00. Thank you,

Susan

From: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 4, 2021 12:08 PM

To: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin.Triplett@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: NDF for LMPD Blue Light

We need an email from LMPD, probably Emily McKinley, stating that they will accept the funds for the
purpose described in the NDF request.

Thanks,
Sonya




Gmail - FW: Blue LED on 3rd and Florence https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=2becf33317& view=pt&search=...

NDF \?/fa,{*i f?iﬁggfz

Gmaf' Susan Hughes <swhughes11@gmagfcom>

FW: Blue LED on 3rd and Florence

1 message

Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilieky.gov> Wed, Oct 27, 2021 at 1:156 PM
To: "swhughes11@gmail.com” <swhughes11@gmail.com>

From: McKinley, Emily <Emily. McKinley@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, October 26, 2021 2:58 PM

To: Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin. Triplett@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Lucketi@louisvilieky.gov>; Hughes,
Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Nett, Timothy <Timothy. Nett@louisvilleky.gov>; Webster, Harry <Harry. Webster@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW. Blue LED on 3rd and Florence

CM Triplett,

Good afternoon! Attached is the quote from Datalink (our camera vendor) for the blue light on the camera at

3'd//Florence Ave. Please review. If you approve, | will have TechOps Sgt. Tim Nett coordinate with your office
regarding funding, PO requests and installation schedules. The company is local, so installs are usually fast.

I will also check to see if the quote changes for a flashing light. As we discussed, | think this would be a good
location to test that type of light.

Let me know if you have any issues. We appreciate your support and teamwork!

Respectfully,

Emily

From: Christa Druin <cdruin@datalink.net>
Sent: Wednesday, October 20, 2021 7:29 AM
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Gmail - FW: Blue LED on 3rd and Florence https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=2becf33317& view=pt&search=...

To: Overton, Troy <Troy.Overton@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Logsdon, Chris <Chris.Logsdon@louisvilleky.gov>; Nett, Timothy <Timothy.Nett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Blue LED on 3rd and Florence

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open attachments unless
you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Good Morning,
Please see the attached quote.
Thank You,

Christa

Christa Druin
Division Manager - Central/Eastern Kentucky

© pAaTA LINK

0: (502) 206-3312 | C: (502) 500-5273 | F: (502) 206-3311

500 N. English Station Rd., Suite 108 | Louisville, KY 40223

Support: Please use our customer portal to submit a ticket.
For emergencies, dial (812) 266-9389.

Confidentiality Notice: The information included in this e-mail, including any aftachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient and may contain
information that is confidential and protected. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure, distribution or similar action is prohibited. if you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender and delete all copies of the original message immediately.

From: Overton, Troy <Troy.Overton@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, October 19, 2021 3:19 PM

To: Christa Druin <cdruin@datalink.net>

Cc: Logsdon, Chris <Chris.Logsdon@louisvilleky.gov>; Nett, Timothy <Timothy. Nett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Blue LED on 3rd and Florence

Christa —

Can you send me a quote to add a blue LED to the camera at 3™ and Florence? It's been requested, so you can
attach it to a reply all and | will get it in a ticket and get a PO to add the light for you.

Thanks!

20f3 10/27/2021, 2:24 PM



Gmail - FW: Blue LED on 3rd and Florence https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=2becf33317& view=pt&search=...

Troy

Troy Overton

Video Engineer 1]

Office of Civic Innovation and Technology
4108. 5t st | 20d Floor | Louisville, KY 40202

Office: 502.574.7132

“...Though, in reviewing the incidents of my administration, | am unconscious of intentional error, | am nevertheless too sensible of my defects
not to think it probable that | may have committed many errors. Whatever they may be, | fervently beseech the Almighty to avert or mitigate the
evils to which they may tend. | shall also carry with me the hope, that my Country will never cease to view them with indulgence; and that, after
forty-five years of my life dedicated to its service with an upright zeal, the faults of incompetent abilities will be consigned to oblivion, as myself
must soon be to the mansions of rest.”

-President George Washington, “Washington’s Farewell Address, 1796”

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by
the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any
disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly
prohibited and may be unlawful.

.@ 3rd and Florence LED Light Quote.pdf
— 595K
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DATA LINK

We have prepared a quote for you

Louisville Metro-3rd & Florence Blue LED Light

Quote # 007680
Version 1

Prepared for:
| Louisville Metro Government

lennifer Corum
Jennifer.corum@loulsvilleky.gov




4841 East Virginia St.
Evansville, Indiana 47715
www.datalink.net

(812) 401-9946

e Statement of Work
Louisville Metro-LED Lights

Data Link will furnish and install LED Blue Lights (Static)
Labor and Material for Blue LED Light at 3rd and Florence.
Thank You

Materials

12B-B-B Bolt Beam 12mm LED Light - 55 Lumens - Blue Black

Power Supply Power supply

Subtotal:

Labor & Equipment

Technicianand  Tech and Bucket $100.00
Bucket

Technician Technician $60.00

Subtotal:

$300.00

$180.00




4841 East Virginia.St.
Evansville; Indiana 47715
www.datalink.net

{812) 401-9946

Louisville Metro-3rd & Florence Blue LED Light

Data Link Louisville Metro Government Quote #: 007680

Christa Druin 410 S. Sth Street Version: 1

5022063312 Louisville, 40202 Delivery Date: 10/20/2021
Fax (812) 401-9915 Jennifer Corum Expiration Date: 12/18/2021
cdruin@datalink.net (502) 574-4444

Jennifer.corum@louisvilleky.gov

Quote Summary

Materials

$16.13
$480.00

Labor & Equipment

Total:

Taxes, shipping, handling and other fees may apply. We reserve the right to cancel orders arising from pricing or other errors. Purchase
orders may be submitted to sales@datalink.net. Please allow minimum 2 weeks for scheduling once quote has been approved.




Harward, Sonza

From: Bell, LaTonya J.

Sent: Tuesday, November 16, 2021 10:56 AM

To: Harward, Sonya; Hughes, Susan

Subject: FW: D15 - 11/17/21 Appropriations Comments - NDF111721LMPD15

Susan, thank you!

Sonya, please add this email to the CIF Agency Request packet as well. Thanks.

From: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes®@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 16, 2021 10:47 AM

To: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Fwd: D15 - 11/17/21 Appropriations Comments - NDF111721LMPD15

Sorry. Thisis it

Get Outlook for i0S

From: McKinley, Emily <Emily.McKinley@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 11, 2021 4:02 PM

To: Triplett, Kevin D.

Cc: Hughes, Susan

Subject: Re: D15 - 11/17/21 Appropriations Comments - NDF111721LMPD15

1. Yes. The appropriation should inciude the entire cost on the Datalink invoice.
2. Yes, the camera is owned by LMPD and is a metrowatch camera. The light would connect to the power source
on the electrical pole and would last longer than a year.

From: Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin.Triplett@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 11, 2021 3:52 PM

To: McKinley, Emily

Cc: Hughes, Susan

Subject: FW: D15 - 11/17/21 Appropriations Comments - NDF111721LMPD15

Good afternoon Major KcKinley —

We've submitted the appropriation request for the lighting at 3" Street — and are not being asked the following;
Please see below and provide us any information you can.

Thanks so much.

Kevin

From: Robinson, Cara E. <cara.robinson@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 11, 2021 3:42 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel. Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>; Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>; MetroCouncilClerk <MetroCounciiClerk@louisvilleky.gov>;




Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin.Tripleti@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: D15 - 11/17/21 Appropriations Comments - NDF111721LMPD15

Good Afternoon,
Please address the items in red font type below prior to Monday, November 15, 2021.

Thank you,
Cara

15. NDF111721L APPROPRIATING $480 FROM DISTRICT 15 NEIGHBORHOOD
MPD15 DEVELOPMENT FUNDS TO LOUISVILLE METRO POLICE
DEPARTMENT FOR THE PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF A
BLUE LED LIGHT FOR THE CAMERA LOCATED AT 3RD STREET
AND FLORENCE AVENUE.
Sponsors: Primary Kevin Triplett (D-15)

Attachments: NDF111721LMPD15 pdf
Comments: District 15 is purchasing the Blue LED light from Data Link through the Louisville
Metro Police Department to XXXX

District 15 LA to Address:

1. The amount listed in the Metro Council City Agency Request is $480, the total amount
listed on the quote from Data Link is $496.13 which includes the materials, should the
total amount include the materials on the application?

2. Does LMPD own the camera located at 3™ Street and Florence Avenue and does the
Blue LED light have a useful life of more than one year?





